RFB-DPR-1444014
provide services for
Pump System and
BPA Maint, Testing,
Repairs, Installation
Open 10/7/2020 KI &

PACIFIC ELECTRO

AD 2:00 PM MECHANICAL DOONWOOD ALAKAI

Iltem and Descriptioni QTY |UOM |UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Group 1

1. Maintenance Rate 800 |MH S 125.00 | $ 100,000.00 [ S 154.00 | $ 123,200.00 | S 120.42 | $ 96,336.00

2. Repair Rate 200 |MH S 125.00 [ $ 25,000.00 | S 154.00(|$ 30,800.00 | $ 120.42 | $ 24,084.00

3 Minimum Service Rate |50 |EACH |S$S 250.00($ 12,500.00|S 154.00($ 7,700.00 | $ 54450 | § 27,225.00

3A. Inspection Fee 50 |EACH |$ 125.00 | $ 6,250.00 | $ 154.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 544.00 | $§ 27,200.00

Group 2

inspection/Test/certify

BPA 600 |EACH N/A NO BID 300.00 | $ 180,000.00 104.71 | S 62,826.00

Repair Labor Rate 100 (MH N/A NO BID S 15400|$ 15,400.00 | $ 124.42 [ $ 12,442.00
WATER CONTROLS PURAL

Item and Descriptioni QTY |UOM |UNIT PRICE |[TOTALPRICE |UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Group 1

1. Maintenance Rate 800 |MH S 97.33|$ 77,864.00| S 160.00 | $ 128,000.00 | $ - S -

2. Repair Rate 200 (MH S 97.33|$ 19,466.00 | S 156.00|$ 31,200.00 | S - S -

3 Minimum Service Rate |50 |EACH | S 97.33 | S 4,866.50 | S 520.00|$ 26,000.00 | $ - S -

3A. Inspection Fee 50 |[EACH |S 9733|S 4,866.50|S 520.00($ 26,000.00 | S - S -

Group 2

inspection/Test/certify

BPA 600 |EACH N/A NO BID S 94.00|$ 56,400.00 | S - S -

Repair Labor Rate 100 |MH N/A NO BID S 121.00($ 12,100.00 | $ - S -




