
Opened: May 14, 2020

For:

Item No. Description  Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1
Truck with Service Body and 35’ Telescopic 

Articulating Aerial Device
2              No Bid  No Bid 169,860.66$ 339,721.32$ 171,312.54$ 342,625.08$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer

Model

2
Truck Cab and Chassis with Storm Drain Line 

and Catch Basin Cleaner
2 $473,397.72 946,795.44$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 399,790.00$    799,580.00$      438,959.39$ 877,918.78$    411,054.00$  822,108.00$              

Manufacturer 

Model

3

39,000 lb. GVWR. Truck Cab and Chassis with 

20' Stake Body, 5-Ton 

Crane and 3,000 lb. Capacity Liftgate

2 $241,774.77 483,549.54$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 198,500.00$    397,000.00$      No Bid No Bid 188,872.00$  377,744.00$              

Manufacturer

Model

Freightliner/Venturo 

M2 106/HT66KX-VLC

 Freightliner/VacAll 

114SD/AJV1215 

Hawaii Truck Parts, Sales and 

Services LLC

Gordon Truck Centers dba 

Freightliner of Hawaii

PETERBILT/VACCON

2020 MODEL 367/VP03611HEN/1000 

(B24 at 18") LHAS

PETERBILT/TADANO/DHOLLANDLA

2020 MODEL 398/TADANO MODEL TM-

ZT503A/DHOLLANNA DA VOL 15

 FORD

(F5G) F550 CHASSIS CAB W/ 

ALTEC AERIAL DEVICE 

 FORD MOTOR COMPANY

F450 4x2 DRW CHASSIS - 16,500# 

GVWR - F4G - ALTEC MODEL AT35G 

TELESCOPING/ARTICULATING 

AERIAL DEVICE 

2021 INTERNATIONAL WITH 

VENTURO

HV 607 SBA, HT66KX

 2021 INTERNATIONAL WITH 

VACTOR

HV 513 SFA, 2100i 

 MACK

GRANITE 64B, CAMEL MAXXX 900 

RFB-DFM-1368019

Furnish and Deliver Heavy Duty Trucks

Opened By: CR & JL
HT&T Truck Center Cutter Ford, Inc. Gill Island Motors Inc.

International Trucks of Hawaii, 

LLC


