Solicitation No. RFB-DPR-1362714
Furnish and Deliver Work Vehicles

BID TAB

Bid Opening: January 31, 2020 at 14:00 HST

Opened by: ST/CR

Cutter Ford, Inc

Inter Pacific Motors Inc.

DBA Orchid Isle Auto Center

Unit Bid Total Bid Year/Make/Model Unit Bid Total Bid Year/Make/Model
Item No. Quantity: 2 | $ 35449.20 | $ 70,898.40 2020 Fo(rg2|12)50 2WD $ 3496229 |$ 69,924.58 2020 Ford F250 (F2A)
Item No. Quantity: 2 | $ 40,328.77 | $ 80,657.54 2020 Fo(rlc:12|12)50 2WD $ 3887642 (% 77,752.84% 2020 Ford F250 (F2A)
Item No. Quantity: 1 | $ 46,984.27 | $§  46,984.27 2020 Fo(rlc:12|12)50 2wD 4464291 | $ 44,642.91 2020 Ford F250 (F2A)
Item No. Quantity: 2 | $ 44,112.02 | $ 88,224.04 2020 Ford F250 (F2A) No Bid
L 2020 Ford F250
Item No. Quantity: 3 | $ 39,235.58 | $ 117,706.74 Crew Cab (W2A) $ 38,567.52|$ 115,702.56 2020 Ford F250 (F2A)
Item No. Quantity: 1 | $ 72,967.51 [ $§ 72,967.51 2020 Fo((/?lgé)so 4wb $ 51,636.63|$% 51,636.63 2020 Ford F250 (W2B)
Item No. Quantity: 1 | $ 42,073.28 | $ 42,073.28 2020 Fo(rlc:12|12)50 2WD $ 4110155|$% 41,101.55 2020 Ford F250 (F2A)
L 2020 Ford F450
Item No. Quantity: 6 | $ 77,509.91 | $ 465,059.46 Chassis Cab (W4G) $ 80,973.79 | $ 485,842.74 2020 Ford F450 (W4G)
L 2020 Ford F450
Item No. Quantity: 1 | $ 67,883.74 | $ 67,883.74 Chassis Cab (FAG) $ 66,797.88|$ 66,797.88 2020 Ford F450 (F4G)
. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc
Gill Island Motors DBA Cutter Chevrolet
Unit Bid Total Bid Year/Make/Model Unit Bid Total Bid Year/Make/Model
o 2020 Ford F250 4x2 2020 Chevrolet Silverado
Item No. Quantity: 2 | $ 3349482 |$ 66,989.64 Reg Cab Pickup (F2A) $ 38,247.00 | $ 76,494.00 2500 HD
o 2020 Ford F250 4x2 2020 Chevrolet Silverado
Item No. Quantity: 2 | $ 36,803.72 | $ 73,607.44 Reg Cab Pickup (F2A) $ 42,747.00 | $ 85,494.00 2500 HD
ltem No. Quantity: 1 No Bid $ 48247.00 | §  48.247.00 2020 Chevrolet Silverado
2500 HD
. 2020 Ford F250 4x2 .
. : . . No Bid
Item No Quantity: 2 | $ 41,221.52 | $§ 82,443.04 Reg Cab w/ Box Delete (F2A) o Bi
o 2020 Ford F250 4x2 2020 Chevrolet Silverado
Item No. Quantity: 3 | $ 36,507.38 | $ 109,522.14 Crew Cab 160" WB (W2A) $ 40,247.00 | $ 120,741.00 HD 2500
Item No. Quantity: 1 No Bid $ 55947.00|$ 55947.00 | 2920 Chﬁ‘g‘;ggg"verado
o 2020 Ford F250 4x2 2020 Chevrolet Silverado
Item No. Quantity: 1 | $ 38,354.50 | §  38,354.50 Reg Cab Pickup (F2A) $ 47,247.00 | $ 47,247.00 HD 2500
Item No. Quantity: 6 No Bid No Bid
Item No. Quantity: 1 No Bid No Bid

*Correction to extension price, due to bidder's arithmetical error



