SOLICITATION DOCUMENT NO. RFB-DPR-1367413 To Provide
Round Trip Bus Services for the Department of Parks and
Recreation Summer Fun Program Open 2/4/2020 by SK & CD

Ground Transport

Robert's Hawaii

Description Item TOTAL LINE PRICE TOTAL LINE PRICE

AINA HAINA COMMUNITY PARK 1 $ 6,975.00 | $ 6,370.00
KAHALA COMMUNITY PARK 2 $ 3,732.00 | $ 3,705.00
KAIMUKI COMMUNITY PARK 3 $ 3,645.00 | $ 3,510.00
KAMILO IKI COMMUNITY PARK 4 $ 5,460.00 | $ 4,420.00
KANEWAI COMMUNITY PARK 5 $ 3,435.00 | $ 3,414.00
KAPAOLONO COMMUNITY PARK 6 $ 2,940.00 | $ 2,928.00
KILAUEA DISTRICT PARK 7 $ 2,310.00 | $ 2,278.00
KOKO HEAD DISTRICT PARK 8 $ 3,900.00 | $ 3,512.00
MANOA VALLEY DISTRICT PARK 9 $ 10,835.00 | $ 11,382.00
McCULLY DISTRICT PARK 10 $ 4,220.00 | $ 4,200.00
PAKI COMMUNITY PARK 11 $ 4,245.00 | $ 4,293.00
WILSON COMMUNITY PARK 12 $ 4,320.00 | $ 4,392.00
DIAMOND HEAD COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 13 $ 790.00 [ $ 618.00
KOKO HEAD COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 14 $ 1,185.00 | $ 813.00
MANOA COMPLEX TEENS PROGRAM (Mahalo Event) 15 $ 380.00 | $ 260.00
WAIALAE COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 16 $ 760.00 | $ 520.00
AIEA DISTRICT PARK 17 $ 6,645.00 | $ 11,475.00
ALA PUUMALU COMMUNITY PARK 18 $ 2,890.00 | $ 3,120.00
BERETANIA COMMUNITY PARK 19 $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,220.00
BOOTH DISTRICT PARK 20 $ 4,860.00 | $ 5,400.00
FERN COMMUNITY PARK 21 $ 1,330.00 | $ 1,440.00
HALAWA DISTRICT PARK 22 $ 3,605.00 | $ 4,170.00
KALAKAUA DISTRICT PARK 23 $ 2,280.00 | $ 2,520.00
Kalihi Uka Community Park 24 $ 1,740.00 | $ 1,920.00
Kalihi Valley District Park 25 $ 1,760.00 | $ 1,920.00
KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX CHILDRENS PROGRAM 26 $ 3,060.00 | $ 3,060.00
KAMEHAMEHA COMMUNITY PARK: 27 $ 1,750.00 | $ 1,920.00
LANAKILA DISTRICT PARK 28 $ 2,420.00 | $ 2,520.00
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Robert's Hawaii

Description ltem [TOTAL LINE PRICE TOTAL LINE PRICE

MAKIKI DISTRICT PARK 29 $ 6,675.00 | $ 6,900.00
MOANALUA COMMUNITY PARK 30 $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,680.00
PUUNUI COMMUNITY PARK 31 $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,040.00
SALT LAKE DISTRICT PARK 32 $ 7,230.00 | $ 7,560.00
AIEA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM (Mahalo) 33 $ 300.00 | $ 405.00
BOOTH COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 34 $ 300.00 | $ 270.00
HALAWA COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 35 $ 300.00 | $ 270.00
KALAKAUA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM 36 $ 300.00 | $ 270.00
KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM 37 $ 300.00 | $ 270.00
MAKIKI COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 38 $ 300.00 | $ 270.00
ASING COMMUNITY PARK 39 $ 4,735.00 | $ 8,415.00
CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK 40 $ 4,100.00 | $ 7,740.00
EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK 41 $ 3,000.00 | $ 8,400.00
EWA MAHIKO DISTRICT PARK - LOWER 42 $ 5,860.00 | $ 10,080.00
EWA MAHIKO DISTRICT PARK - UPPER 43 $ 4,680.00 | $ 8,100.00
EWA COMPLEX TEENS - MAHALO 44 $ 650.00 | $ 900.00
HO AE'AE COMMUNITY PARK 45 $ 3,860.00 | $ 7,110.00
KALANIANAOLE BEACH PARK 46 $ 4,100.00 | $ 7,560.00
MAILI COMMUNITY PARK 47 $ 4,100.00 | $ 7,920.00
MAKAHA COMMUNITY PARK 48 $ 2,505.00 | $ 4,725.00
MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK 49 $ 8,030.00 | $ 14,760.00
MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - LOWER 50 $ 5,200.00 | $ 5,860.00
MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - UPPER 51 $ 3,435.00 | $ 3,874.00
MILILANI COMPLEX TEEN - MAHALO 52 $ 540.00 | $ 650.00
PACIFIC PALISADES COMMUNITY PARK 53 $ 3,840.00 | $ 6,750.00
PEARL CITY DISTRICT PARK 54 $ 2,856.00 | $ 5,175.00
PEARL CITY COMPLEX TEEN - MAHALO 55 $ 225.00 | $ 405.00
PILILAAU COMMUNITY PARK 56 $ 3,360.00 | $ 6,075.00
WAHIAWA DISTRICT PARK 57 $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,920.00
WAIANAE DISTRICT PARK 58 $ 3,960.00 | $ 8,100.00
WAIANAE COMPLEX TEEN (MAHALO) 59 $ 840.00 | $ 1,530.00
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WAIAU DISTRICT PARK 60 $ 5,840.00 | $ 10,170.00
WAIKELE COMMUNITY PARK 61 $ 3,130.00 | $ 5,220.00
WAIPAH+AG69:C80U DISTRICT PARK 62 $ 2,650.00 | $ 4,770.00
WAIPAHU COMPLEX TEEN -MAHALO 63 $ 300.00 | $ 450.00
WHITMORE COMMUNITY PARK 64 $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,740.00
AHUIMANU COMMUNITY PARK 65 NO BID $ 7,335.00
BLANCHE POPE SUMMER FUN 66 NO BID $ 3,510.00
ENCHANTED LAKE COMMUNITY PARK 67 NO BID $ 6,615.00
HAU'ULA COMMUNITY PARK 68 NO BID $ 5,490.00
HE'EIA SUMMER FUN 69 NO BID $ 6,750.00
KAHALU'U COMMUNITY PARK 70 NO BID $ 3,060.00
KAHUKU SUMMER FUN 71 NO BID $ 8,235.00
KAILUA SUMMER FUN 72 NO BID $ 7,875.00
KAINALU ELEMENTARY SUMMER FUN 73 NO BID $ 5,130.00
KANEOHE DISTRICT PARK 74 NO BID $ 945.00
KAPUNAHALA NEIGHBORHOOD PARK 75 NO BID $ 6,030.00
LAIE SUMMER FUN 76 NO BID $ 4,455.00
SUNSET BEACH NEIGHBORHOOD PARK 77 NO BID $ 3,060.00
WAIALUA DISTRICT PARK 78 NO BID $ 6,255.00
WAIMANALO DISTRICT PARK 79 NO BID $ 5,490.00
KAHALUU COMPLEX TEENS 80 NO BID $ 495.00
KAHALUU COMPLEX TEENS PROGRAM (Mahalo) 81 NO BID $ 1,350.00
KAILUA COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 82 NO BID $ 540.00
KAI-WAIMANALO TEENS (Mahalo) 83 NO BID $ 675.00
KANEOHE COMPLEX TEENS (Mahalo) 84 NO BID $ 990.00
WAIALUA COMPLEX TEENS (MAHALO) 85 NO BID $ 495.00
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