Solicitation No. RFB-DPR-1274806
Furnish and Deliver Mowers and Utiliy Vehicles
Opened: 5/9/2019 by AD & RS

American Machinery B. Hayman Co. (Hawaii), Ltd. Bacon-Universal Hawthorne Pa‘_"ﬁc dba Ness Turf Pacific Golf & Turf
Equipment
ITEM NO. [ITEM QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE  |TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 48" Rotary Deck Zero Turn Riding

mower 1 S 15,490.51 | $  15,490.51 | No Bid No Bid $ 18,21885|$ 1821885 (S 13,531.39 | §  13,531.39
2 Riding Rotary Deck Mower with Side

Discharge 1 S 12,732.15 | $  12,732.15 | $ 14,869.10 | $ 14,869.10 [ $ 16,230.00 | $ 16,230.00 | $ 21,603.00 | S  21,603.00 | $ 17,477.09 | $ 17,477.09
3 UTV with 4 Wheel Drive and Dump

Cargo Box 2 No Bid S 18,324.60 | $ 36,649.20 | $ 17,800.00 [ $ 35,600.00 |No Bid $ 13,819.60 | $  27,639.20
4 Commercial Utility Cart 2 S 20,174.87 | $ 40,349.74 | $ 18,848.16 | $ 37,696.32 | $ 13,400.00 [ $ 26,800.00 |No Bid $ 33,375.83 [$  66,751.66




