Solicitation No. RFB-DPR-1251708
Furnish and Deliver Various Specialized Vehicles and Equipment
Opened: 5/2/2019 by AD & AP

B. Hayman Co. (Hawaii), Ltd. Bacon-Universal Company, Inc. Ness Turf Equipment Pacific Golf and Turf
ITEM NO. [ITEM QrTy UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 Trailer Mounted Generator (1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 6,000 Ibs. Capacity Forklift |4 No Bid S 33,088.89 | $ 132,355.56 | No Bid No Bid
Wide Area Mowers with

3 Three (3) Cutting Units 2 S 90,314.10 | $ 180,628.20 | $ 21,151.82 | $ 42,303.64 | $ 100,595.30 [ $ 201,190.60 |No Bid
72 inch Cutting Deck Riding

4 Mower 2 S 21,628.26 | $ 43,256.52 |No Bid No Bid $ 2491034 S 49,820.68
72 inch Cutting Deck Zero

5 Turn Riding Mower 2 S 12,560.20 | $ 25,120.40 |No Bid S 28,462.44 | $§ 56,924.88 [ $ 12,171.76 | S  24,343.52
Hybrid Riding Greens

6 Mower 1 S 52,874.32 | $ 52,874.32 |No Bid No Bid S 41,041.52 S 41,041.52
60 inch Power Mower with

7 Trailer 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Riding 5 Rotary Deck Mower |1 S 53,958.09 | $ 53,958.09 |No Bid S 54,412.05 [ $ 54,412.05 [ $ 52,022.33|$ 52,022.33
4 Wheel Turf Truckster with

9 Hydraulic Cargo Bed 1 S 26,115.17 | $ 26,115.17 |No Bid S 30,239.66 | $ 30,239.66 |No Bid
Truckster Mounted Top

10 Dresser 1 S 37,879.57 | $§ 37,879.57 |No Bid S 35,809.83 [ $ 35,809.83 |No Bid

11 Riding Sand Raker 1 S 17,882.72 | $ 17,882.72 [No Bid No Bid $ 1510711 |$ 15,107.11
14,000 GVWR Trailer with

12 16 ft. Tilt Bed 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tandem Axle Beavertail

13 Trailer with 18 ft. Deck 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tandem Axle Beavertail

14 Trailer with 20 ft. Deck 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




