Bid Tab Summary
RFB-DFM-1239904

Services To Maintain a Vehicle and Equipment Parts Inventory Shop,
and Manage an On-Site Service Counter.

Genuine Parts, Company

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises

ltem Description Iést;[/ Unit |Unit Price [Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 |Monthly Management Fee 12 [Months] $8,600.00 $103,200.00 $8,787.70 $105,452.40
Markup Percentage for

2 Contrarz:tor’s Bran%ed Parts 15% 15%
Markup Percentage for Non-

3 Contrarc):tor’s Bran%ed Parts 15% 15%

Item Description Total Price Total Price

Fuel tank kit with sender, part

4 |no. 1016004 $1,074.81 No Bid
Pump, Fuel, part no.

5 (103781101 $244.85 No Bid
Pads, Brake-Front, part no.

6 |106.037 $654.81 $437.98
Rotor, Front Brake, part no.

7 1120.65051 $306.64 $320.44
King Pin Kit, part no.

8 (12472161 $714.50 $771.21
Latch, L/S Door, part no.

9 116631627 $450.75 $428.31
Driver, Fuel Solenoid, part no.

10 19209057 $756.84 $621.97

11 [Alternator, part no. 210-5119 $393.02 $258.54
Muffler, Eng. Exhaust, part no.

12 (22719 $102.76 $323.38
Ball Joint/Control Arm (Frt/Lt),

13 |[part no. 260-5231 $426.73 $220.81
Front Shock Absorber, part

14 |no. 34741 $411.70 $407.56
Hose, Power Steering, Ford,

15 [part no. 3C3Z3A717AA $185.16 $159.08
Injector, #7 Reman Nozzle,

16 [partno. 3C3Z9E527ECRM $979.69 $1,489.42
Fuel Pump with Sender
Assembly, part no.

17 |3C3Z9H307GD $584.94 $1,712.76
Caoill, Ignition, part no.

18 [3W7Z12029AA $311.82 $173.69
Compressor, A/C, Ford, part

19 [no. 4C3Z19V703AA $4,310.38 $4,200.35
Alternator, Upper, part no.

20 |6C3Z10346BARM $847.46 No Bid




Drier, Accumulator, Ford, part

21 |no. 6C3Z19C836A $131.79 $282.38
Gear Box, Steering, part no.

22 |7C3Z3504ARM $394.43 $359.31

23 |8 Volt Batteries, part no. 8148 $1,339.15 $1,473.43

24 |Distributor, part no. 84-1830 $320.11 $319.56
Gasket, part no.

25 |8C3Z16A238A $114.31 $114.31
Caliper, Frt, part no.

26 |8C3Z2B121CA $102.40 No Bid

27 |Radiator, part no. 8C3Z8009B $963.26 $792.95

28 |Seal, Front, part no. 9150S $245.64 $108.33
Core, A/C Evaporator,

29 |Motorcraft, part no. YK1999 $261.60 $702.42
Caoil, Ignition, Motorcraft, part

30 |no. DG508 $850.43 $473.69
Stabilizer, Steering Kit, part

31 |no. F81Z3EG650AA $122.08 $408.94
Bushing, Kit, Control Arm,

33 |Upper, part no. K6176 $78.32 $32.29

TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE: $120.880.38 $122,045.51

(Sum of Items No. 1, 4 through 33)




