Bid Abstract

Furnish Safety Shoes for a Twelve (12) Month Period
Solicitation No. RFB-DHR-1238104
November 14, 2018

Robert H Su, LLC dba Red
Wing Shoe Store

Saf-Gard Safety Shoe Co.

Opened by: ST/JFS

Work Shoe Hawaii Inc.

ITEM NO. [DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. |UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE |UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE [UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1 Men's Safety Shoe: 6 in. 400 $ 175.00 $ 70,000.00 ($ 109.99 $ 43,996.00 (% 11518 $ 46,072.00
Manufacturer and Model: Red Wing #2240 Hytest 13890 | cat Threshold (P90935-brown & P9096 black)

2 Men's Safety Shoe: 8 in. 200 $ 18500 $ 37,00000|$ 11499 $ 22,998.00(% 150.00 $ 30,000.00
Manufacturer and Model: Red Wing #4202 BR Max SRM2950 and SRM295 Keen Detroit 8" (1008313)

3 Engineer's Boots 50 $ 200.00 $ 10,000.00 (% 109.99 $ 549950 (% 12775 $ 6,387.50
Manufacturer and Model: Red Wing #4202 Wolverine WW10680 | Wolverine Floorhand Welly (W10680)

4 Welding Shoes 10 $ 20000 $ 2,000.00|% 90.00 $ 900.00 [$ 14450 $ 1,445.00
Manufacturer and Model: Red Wing #2231 Hytest 13200 |Keen Oakland Welly (1020148)

5 Men's Climber Boots 10 $ 22500 $ 2,250.00|$ 10499 $ 1,049.90 NO BID
Manufacturer and Model:| Red wing #4416 (black) & #4420 (brown) Carolina CA1825

6 Men's Safety Low-Cut Casual Shoe 20 $ 12500 $ 2,500.00 (% 55.00 $ 1,100.00($ 100.52 $ 2,010.40
Manufacturer and Model: Red Wing #6337 SR Max SRM4400 Skechers Ekron (77068)

7 Puncture Resistant Men's Safety Shoe 20 $ 22500 $ 4500.00|$% 10999 $ 2,199.80 (% 172.00 $ 3,440.00
Manufacturer and Model: Red Wing #3506 Avenger N7223 Reebok RB6765

8 Men's Logger Boot 10 $ 22500 $ 2,250.00|$ 10499 $ 1,049.90 NO BID
Manufacturer and Model:| Red wing #4416 (black) & #4420 (brown) Carolina CA1821

9 Women's Safety Shoe 25 NO BID $ 11999 $ 2999.75(% 140.00 $ 3,500.00
Manufacturer and Model: Wolverine WW10180 and Ww10181 | Keen Detroit XT Mid (1020089)

10 Asphalt Shoe 2 NO BID $ 14499 $ 28998 |$ 12565 $ 251.30

Manufacturer and Model:

Timberland Pro TM 52562

Cofra New Asphalt




