Furnish and Deliver Various Police Equipment for a Twelve (12) Month Period

RFB-HPD-1216603

Elite Products LLC

LC Action Police Supply

Point Blank Enterprises

opened by:ST/JFS

Security Equipment Corp

|GROUP A (item Nos. 1 - 5)

Item No. |Description Est. Qty |Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
Holsters — Safariland ALS
Level lll Retention Duty
Part No. 6360-83-61 — Right
1 Hand 200 No Bid $ 91.77 $18,354.00 No Bid $ 130.00 $ 26,000.00
Holsters — Safariland ALS
Level lll Retention Duty
Part No. 6360-83-62 — Left
2 Hand 100 No Bid $ 9177 $ 9,177.00 No Bid $ 130.00 $ 13,000.00
Magazine Pouch — Aker
Double for Glock 17
3 Part No. A510-BP-3-NkI 100 No Bid $ 22.88 $ 2,288.00 No Bid $ 26.00 $ 2,600.00
Bianchi #20C Double
Magazine Pouch
Magazine Pouch — Aker
Double for Glock 17
Part No. A510-BP-3-
4 Brass 100 No Bid $ 22.88 $ 2,288.00 No Bid $ 26.00 $ 2,600.00
Double Magazine
Pouch
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP A (Item Nos. 1 — 4): No Bid $32,107.00 No Bid $ 44,200.00
|IGROUP B (Item Nos. 5 - 8)
Item No. |Description Est. Qty |Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
Sam Brown Waist Belts;
5 11 ounce bends, plain 300 No Bid No Bid $ 42.46 $12,738.00 ($ 55.00 $ 16,500.00
Make and Model: G&G, Six - FLB59 Aker, BO3-HPD-BP
Sally Brown Waist Belts;
6-1/2 to 7 ounce, plain,
6 Right 50 No Bid No Bid $ 4586 $ 2,293.00|$ 66.00 $ 3,300.00
Make and Model: G&G, SJA-RH B-192 | Aker, BO3W-HPD-BP-RH
Sally Brown Waist Belts;
6-1/2 to 7 ounce, plain,
7 Left 50 No Bid No Bid $ 4586 $ 2,293.00|$ 66.00 $ 3,300.00
Make and Model: G&G, SJA-LH Aker, BO3W-HPD-BP-LH
Brass Buckle, Polished
8 Brass 200 No Bid No Bid $ 437 $ 87400 ($ 9.00 $ 1,800.00
Make and Model: G&G, 125BR Aker, B1-BSB
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP B (Item Nos. 5 - 8): No Bid No Bid $18,198.00 $ 24,900.00




Elite Products LLC

| LC Action Police Supply| Point Blank Enterprises |

Security Equipment Corp

IGROUP C (Item Nos. 9 - 14)

Item No. |Description Est. Qty |Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
Police Caps for Officers,
9 Standard type, All sizes 500/ $ 63.00 $ 31,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model:| Bayly, 08NO3AO0
Police Caps for Officers,
with 50 each $ $
One (1) Row of Gold
Braid;
10 All sizes for Lieutenants 50| $110.00 $ 5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model:| Bayly, 08NOKB3
Police Caps for Officers,
with 50 each $ $
Two (2) Rows of Gold
Braid;
All sizes for Captains and
11 Above 50( $110.00 $ 5,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model:| Bayly, 08NOJB3
Police Cap Bands, Chrome
band, snake chrome cap
12 strap for band 300($ 995 $ 2,985.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model:| Bayly, 7035
Police Cap Bands, Gold
band, 100 each $ $
13 gold cap strap for band 100|$ 995 % 995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model:| Bayly, 7033
14 Police Cap Covers 300($ 575 $ 1,725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model:| Bayly, 9235
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP C (Item Nos. 9 - 14): $ 48,205.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
IGROUP D (Item Nos. 15 - 17)
Item No. [Description Est. Qty [Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
15 Handcuffs 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2199 3% 2,199.00
Make and Model: Peerless, 700C
Handcuff Pouches, Nickel
16 Chrome Snap 100 No Bid No Bid $ 2044 $ 2,04400|% 23.00 $ 2,300.00
Make and Model: G&G SIY-B580 Aker, A500-BP-NICKEL
Handcuff Pouches, Brass
17 Snap 100 No Bid No Bid $ 2044 $ 2,04400|% 23.00 $ 2,300.00
Make and Model: G&G SIX B-580 Aker, A500-BP-BRASS
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP D (Item Nos. 15 - 17): No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6,799.00




Elite Products LLC

| LC Action Police Supply| Point Blank Enterprises |

Security Equipment Corp

IGROUP E (Item Nos. 18 - 26)

Item No. |Description Est. Qty |Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
Magnetic Finger Print
18 Powder, 16 ounce 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 39.00 $ 1,950.00
Make and Model: Sirchie, BPMSBM9
Magnetic Wand
Applicator, Red Pencil
19 Style 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18.00 $ 1,800.00
Make and Model: Forensics Source, 1-0150
Finger Print Powder, 8
20 ounce 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1620 $ 1,620.00
Make and Model: Sirchie, BPP08
Finger Print Brush,
21 Fiberglass Bristles 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 775 % 2,325.00
Make and Model: Sirchie, 122L
22 Finger Print Lifting Tape 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 625 $ 3,125.00
Make and Model: Lightning Powder, 1-1401
23 Finger Print Ink, 2 ounce 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 500 $ 100.00
Make and Model: Sirchie, 230T
24 Finger Print Ink Roller 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 16.00 $ 160.00
Make and Model: Sirchie, FPT262B
Finger Print Reprint
25 Labels 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.00 $ 230.00
Make and Model: Sirchie, FPT108R
Finger Print Kit Box with
26 Custom Decal 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3000 $ 1,500.00
Make and Model: Pelican, 1060
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP E (Item Nos. 18 - 26): No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 12,810.00
|GROUP F (Item Nos. 27 - 30)
Item No. [Description Est. Qty [Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
Gloves, White, Cotton,
27 Size Small 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 550 $ 275.00
Make and Model: Hatch, WG1000SS
Gloves, White, Cotton,
28 Size Medium 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 550 $ 825.00
Make and Model: Hatch, WG1000SM
Gloves, White Cotton,
29 Size Large 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 550 $% 1,100.00
Make and Model: Hatch, WG1000SL
Gloves, White, Cotton, Size
30 X-Large 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 550 $ 550.00




Elite Products LLC

LC Action Police Supply

Point Blank Enterprises

Security Equipment Corp

| Make and Model:

Hatch, WG1000SXL

|Total Sum Bid for GROUP F (Item Nos. 27 - 30): No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,750.00
IGROUP G (Item Nos. 31 - 33)
Item No. |Description Est. Qty |Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
31 Pepper Spray Pouch 300 No Bid No Bid $ 18.02 $ 5406.00|% 2725 $ 8,175.00
Make and Model: G&G, HPD-SGQ Aker, A575A-BP-V
32 Pepper Spray Service-Fog 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8.60 $ 4,300.00
Make and Model: Guardian Protective Devices, SCT00C
33 Pepper Spray, Training-Inert 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 820 $ 1,640.00
Make and Model: Guardian Protective Devices, SCT10C
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP G (Item Nos. 31 - 33): No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 14,115.00
|GROUP H (Item Nos. 34 - 36)
Item No. [Description Est. Qty [Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
34 Measuring Wheel 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 25.00 $ 1,500.00
Make and Model: Rolatape, 32-12/RT-104
35 Whistle, Chrome 144 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.70 $ 964.80
Make and Model: Acme, ACME-1
36 Whistle, Brass 144 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 705 % 1,015.20
Make and Model: Acme, ACME-2
|Total Sum Bid for GROUP H (Item Nos. 34 - 36): No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3,480.00
|GROUP | (Item Nos. 37 and 38 AWARD BY ITEM)
Item No. |Description Est. Qty |Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price |Unit Cost Total Price
37 Case Holder for Expandable 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3930 % 3,930.00
Make and Model: ASP, 52632
38 Flashlight Pouch 500 No Bid No Bid $ 1828 $ 9,140.00|$ 31.00 $ 15,500.00

Make and Model:

G&G, B-672-8

Gould & Goodrich, B-672-8




