District | - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Scheduie - 2018
Program Area, Destination|Est. Area Return No. mocm__.".m Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Date Estimated Enrollment  |(Pass)| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Group No] Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Total Bus Bus Total
1. AINA HAINA COMMUNITY PARK
827 West Hind Drive (373-2722)
(Children)
6/22/18  |to Chuck E Cheese (225) | 9:00a.m. | 1:30 p.m. 5|:$340.00 $1,700.00 5|No Bid No Bid
(Dillingham City Square) .
7/6/18  |to Regal Dole Theatre  [(225) | 9:00 a.m. | 12:30 p.m. 5[ $425.00 $2,125.00 5|No Bid No Bid
7/116/18  |to Wet 'n Wild (225) | 9:00a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 5  $340.00 $1,700.00 5|No Bid No Bid
{ALAKA'l Program)
6/22/18  |to Honolulu Zoo (50) | 3:45p.m. | 7:45p.m. 1| $340.00 $340.00 1|No Bid No Bid
7/3/18  |to Dave & Buster's (50) | 10:30 a.m. | 2:30 p.m. 1| . $340.00 $340.00 1|No Bid No Bid
7/16/18  [to Wet 'n Wild (50) | 9:00a.m. | 1:00p.m. 1| $425.00 $425.00 1[No Bid No Bid
 $6,630.00 No Bid
2. KAHALA COMMUNITY PARK
4495 Pahoa Avenue (733-7371)
(Children)
6/26/18 _|to Koko Marina Theaters |(150) | 9:30a.m. | 12:30 p.m. 3 amhocc $1,020.00 3[No Bid No Bid
7/3/18 to Kroc Center (Kapolei) |(150) | 8:45a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 3| .'$425,00 $1,275.00 3[No Bid No Bid
7/24/18 |to Chuck E Cheese (150) | 845a.m. | 1:15p.m. 3 mwgco $1,020.00 3|No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pear] City)
$3,315.00 No Bid




3. KAIMUKI COMMUNITY PARK |
3521 Waialae Avenue (733-7351)
{Children)
6/20/18  [to KMCB Bowling Center [(175) | 8:30a.m. | 1:00 p.m. - $425.00 $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid
(Kaneohe Marine Corp)
6/27/18  |to Wet 'n Wild (175) | 8:45am. | 2:00 p.m. ' $425.00 $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid
7/18/18  |to Chuck E Cheese (175) | 9:00a.m. | 1:15 p.m. ' $340.00 $1,360.00 No Bid No Bid
(Dillingham City Square) .
$4,760.00 No Bid




District | - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination| . Area Return No. _ao_um_ rt's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
ITEM NO.| Date Esiimated Enrollment |[( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
_
4, KAMILO IKI COMMUNITY PARK
7750 Hawaii Kai Drive (395-5314)
(Children)
6/28/18  |to Wet 'n Wild (175) | 8:30 a.m. | 12:45 p.m. 4[ $1,700.00 . 4|No Bid No Bid
7/19/18  |to Kualoa Regional Park [(175) | 8:30a.m. | 12:45 p.m. 4] -$5 ) $2,212.00 4|No Bid No Bid
7/26/18  |to Chuck E Cheese (175) | 8:45a.m. | 12:45 p.m. 4| $425.00 $1,700.00 4|No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City)
. _ © $5,612.00 No Bid
5. KANEWAI COMMUNITY PARK
2695 Dole Street (733-7366)
{Children)
6/21/18 _|to KMCB Bowling Center {(150) | 8:30 a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 3| "$383.00 $1,149.00 3|No Bid No Bid
(Kaneche Marine Corp)
6/28/18 |to Pokai Bay Beach Park |(150) [ 8:30 a.m. | 12:30 p.m. 3| $468.00 $1,404.00 3|No Bid No Bid
7/12/118  |to Chuck E Cheese (150) | 830 a.m. | 1:15p.m. 3| - $383.00 $1,149.00 3[No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City)
7/19/18 _|to KMCB Movie Theater [(150) | 8:30a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 3| $383.00 $1,149.00 3|No Bid No Bid
-$4,851.00 No Bid




KAPAOLONO COMMUNITY PARK

701 11th Avenue (733-7370)

{Children)

6/21/18  [to Chuck E. Cheese (125) | 8:45a.m. | 1:30 p.m. .-$383,00 $1,149.00 No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City)

711218  |to KMCB Bowiing Center |(125) | 8:45a.m. | 1:00 p.m. $425.00 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid
(Kaneohe Marine Corp)

7/24/18  |to Haleiwa Surf Center (125) | 8:30a.m. | 12:30 p.m. $468.00 $1,404.00 No Bid No Bid
(Shuttle)

6/28/18 |to Kahala Theaters (125) | 8:45am. | 11:30 a.m. .$340.00 $340.00 No Bid No Bid

'$4,168.00 No Bid




District 1 - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Praogram Area, Destination Area Return No. movo%_._ms.m: No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No Date Estimated Enrollment |[( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
7. KILAUEA DISTRICT PARK
4109 Kilauea Avenue (733-7355)
{Children)
6/22/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center (100} | 8:00a.m. | 12:30 p.m. $936.00 2|No Bid No Bid
6/29/18 |to Ice Palace (100) | 8:45a.m. | 1:15 p.m. $680.00 2[No Bid No Bid
7/13/18 _ |to KMCB Bowling Center |(100) | 8:30 a.m. | 1:00 p.m. $766.00 2[No Bid No Bid
{Kaneohe Marine Corp) -
7/20/18  to Chuck E. Cheese (100) | 8:30a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 2| . $340.00 $680.00 2[No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City)
$3,062.00 No Bid
8. KOKO HEAD DISTRICT PARK
423 Kaumakani Street (395-3096)
(Children)
6/27/18 _|to Kualoa Regional Park {(200) | 8:30 a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 4! - $510.00 $2,040.00 4INo Bid No Bid
7/18/18 _ |to Haleiwa Surf Center  [(200) | 8:30a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 4| -$553.00 $2,212.00 4|No Bid No Bid
7/25118 |to Chuck E. Cheese (200) | 830 a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 4| $425.00 $1,700.00 4|No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City)
'$5,952.00 No Bid




MANOA VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

2721 Kaaipu Avenue (988-0580) (pick-up at gym parking lot off of Manoa Road)

(Children)
6/21/18 |to Sea Life Park (350) | 8:30a.m. | 1:15 p.m. 7| $383.00 $2,681.00 7{No Bid No Bid
6/28/18  [to Kualoa Regional Park [(350) | 8:30 a.m. | 1:15 p.m. 7| $510.00 $3,570.00 7|No Bid No Bid
7/5/18  |to Honolulu Zoo (350) | 8:30a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 7| “$340.00 $2,380.00 7|No Bid No Bid
7/26/18  |to Wet 'n Wild (350) | 8:30am. | 1:15p.m. 7| $425.00 $2,975.00 7|No Bid No Bid
$11,606.00 No Bid
10. McCULLY DISTRICT PARK
831 Pumehana Street (973-7271)
(Children)
6/29/18 |to Ice Palace (175) | 8:30am. | 1:15p.m. 4| $300.00 $1,200.00 4|No Bid No Bid
7/6/18 _|to Polynesian Cultural Ctr. [(175) | 8:00 a.m. | 1:00 p.m. -$450.00 $1,800.00 4|No Bid No Bid
7/13/18 [to Chuck E. Cheese (175) | 9:00a.m. | 1:15 p.m. [ $1,200.00 4{No Bid No Bid
(Dillingham City Square)
7/20/18  [to Kualoa Regional Park |(175) | 8:00am. | 1:00 p.m. ~$338.00 $1,352.00 4|No Bid No Bid
$5,562.00 No Bid




District | - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
_
Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
11. PAKI COMMUNITY PARK
3503 Leahi Avenue (733-7368)
{Children)
6/19/18  |to KMCB Bowling Center [(150) | 8:45a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 3| $340.00 $1,020.00 3|No Bid No Bid
(Kaneohe Marine Corp)
7/3/18  |to Chuck E. Cheese (150) | 8:45am. | 1:00 p.m. 3| $383.00 $1,149.00 3|No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City)
7/10/18 _|to Ala Moana Beach Park {(150) | 8:45a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 3[:$340.00 $1,020.00 3[No Bid No Bid
7/24/18  |to Dave & Busters (150) | 9:00 a.m. | 1:00 p.m. 3| '$340.00 $1,020.00 3|No Bid No Bid
$4,209.00 No Bid
12. PALOLO VALLEY DISTRICT PARK
2007 Palolo Avenue (733-7358)
(Children)
7/20118  |to Wet 'n Wild (100) | 8:30a.m. | 1:15 p.m. 2| '$425.00 $850.00 2|No Bid No Bid
~: $850.00 No Bid




13, WILSON COMMUNITY PARK |
4901 Kilauea Avenue (733-7367)
‘|(Children)
6/20/18 |to Chuck E. Cheese (125) | 8:45am. | 1:00 p.m. 3| $425.00 $1,275.00 3|No Bid No Bid
(850 Kamehameha Hwy. - Pearl City) _
6/27/18 |to Ice Palace (125) | 845a.m. | 1:15p.m. 3 mwmwco $1,149.00 3{No Bid No Bid
7/11/18__|to Kualoa Regional Park [(125) | 8:30 am. | 1:00 p.m. 3| $425.00 $1,275.00 3[No Bid No Bid
7/18/18  |to KMCB Bowling Center |(125) | 8:30 am. | 1:00 p.m. 3| ~$383.00 $1,149.00 3|No Bid No Bid
(Kaneohe Marine Corp)
$4,848.00 No Bid
14. DIAMOND HEAD COMPLEX TEENS
Palolo Valley District Pk.|
2007 Palolo Avenue (733-7358)
{Mahalo Event) ,
81118 [to Kaimuki Community Pk.[(48) | 4:00 p.m. 1| $340.00 $340.00 1|No Bid No Bid
to McCoy Pavilion 8:30 p.m.
' '$340.00 No Bid




District | - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

_
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15.

Paki Community Park

3503 Leahi Avenue (733-7368)

(Mahalo Event)

8/1/18

to Kanewai Community Pk|(48)

4:00 p.m.

—_—

~ $340.00

$340.00

=

No Bid

No Bid

{0 McCoy Pavilion

8:30 p.m.

- $340.00

No Bid

16.

KOKO HEAD COMPLEX TEENS

Aina Haina Community Park

827 West Hind Drive (373-2722)

(Mahalo Event)

8/1/18

to McCoy Pavilion {986)

4:00 p.m.

8:30 p.m.

'$340.00

$680.00

No Bid

No Bid

17.

Kamilo Iki Community Park

' $680.00

No Bid

7750 Hawaii Kai Drive (395-5314)

(Mahalo Event)

8/1/18

to Koko Head District Pk. |(48)-

3145 p.m.

- $383.00

$383.00

No Bid

No Bid

to McCoy Pavilion

8:30 p.m.

7 $383.00

No Bid




18.

MANOA COMPLEX TEENS

Manoa Valley District Park

2721 Kaaipu Avenue (988-0580) (pick-up at gym parking lot off of Manoa Road)

{Mahalo Event)
8/1/18  |to McCoy Pavilion (96) | 4:15p.m. | 8:30 p.m. 2|"$340.00 $680.00 2|No Bid No Bid
8/1/18 _ |to McCully District Park  [(48) | 4:00 p.m. 1| $340.00 $340.00 1|No Bid No Bid
to McCoy Pavilion 4:20 p.m. | 8:30 p.m.
- $1;020.00 No Bid
19. WAIALAE COMPLEX TEENS
Kilauea District Park _
4109 Kilauea Avenue (733-7357)
(Mahalo Event)
8/1/18  |to McCoy Pavilion (100) | 4:00 p.m. | 8:30 p.m. 2| $340.00 $680.00 2|No Bid No Bid
(Ala Moana Regional Park)
. $680.00 No Bid




District | - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
Program Area, Destination Area Return No. _mocm_:.m Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enroliment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
20. Aiea District Park
99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7853)
(Children)
6/22/2018 to Kapolei Movies (275)| 8:30AM | 11:20AM | 6 | s293.00 $1,758.00 6 | $245.00 $1,470.00
6/26/18 [to Ala Moana Beach Park | (150)| 8:30 AM 1:15 PM 3 $260.00 $780.00 3 | 7$220.00 $660.00
6/28/18 |to Ala Moana Beach Park | (150)| 8:30AM | 1:15PM | 3 | s260.00 $780.00 3 | “$220.00 $660.00
7/6/18 |to Dave and Busters (275)] 815AM | 11:20AM | 6 | $260.00 $1,560.00 6 | - $220.00 $1,320.00
7/20/18 |to Ice Palace (275)| 8:30AM | 1:40PM | 6 | $260.00 $1,560.00 6 | $1,260.00
$6,438.00 $5,370.00
21. ALA PUUMALU COMMUNITY PARK
1575 Ala Puumalu Street (831-7231)
(Children)
6/21/18 _|to Chuck E. Cheese (Dillingham)| (100} | 9:00 AM 1:15 PM 2 $260.00 $520.00 2 $440.00
6/28/18 |to Wet n Wild (100)| 8:45 AM 1:15 PM 2 $293.00 $586.00 2 $490.00
7/2118 [to Ala Moana Beach Park | (100)| 8:30 AM 1:15 PM 2 $260.00 $520.00 2 $440.00
7/26/18 |to Ice Palace (100)| 8:45 AM 1:15 PM 2 $260.00 $520.00 2 $440.00
7/27/118 |to Salt Lake District Park | (100)| 8:45 AM 1:00 PM 2 $260.00 $520.00 2 $440.00
$2,666.00




22,

BERETANIA COMMUNITY PARK

1290 Aala Street (522-7022)

(Children)
6/22/18 |[to Ice Palace (100)| 8:45 AM 1:30 PM 2 $300.00 $600.00 2 $570.00
7/11/18 |to Kuhio Beach (100)[ 9:00 AM 1:30 PM 2 $300.00 $600.00 2 $490.00
7/20M18 [to Wet N Wild (100} | 8:30 AM *2:00 PM 2 $338.00 $676.00 2 $600.00
7/25/18 |to Waimea Beach (100} | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 2 $450.00 $900.00 2 $800.00
$2,776.00 $2,460.00
23. BOOTH COMPLEX CHILDRENS PROGRAM
Booth District Park: 2331 Kaneali'i Ave. (522-7040)
Lanakila District Park: 1701 Lanakila Avenue (832-7820)
Pu‘unui Community Park: 2555 Puunui Ave (595-2460)
. |(Children)
7/27/18 |to lce Palace (375)| 8:30 AM 1:30 PM $300.00 $2,400.00 $2,280.00
2 buses each at: Lanakila District Park &Puunui Community Park
4 buses at: Booth District Park $2,400.00 $2,280.00.




District Il - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
_
Program Area, Destination Area Return No., Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Ing.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment | ( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
. Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
24, BOOTH DISTRICT PARK
2331 Kaneali'i Ave.(522-7
{Children)
6/22/18 |[to Ala Moana Beach Park | (175)( 9:00 AM 1:15 PM 4 $300.00 $1,200.00 4 $1,140.00
6/28/18 |to ChuckECheese (Kalihi) | (175)| 9:00AM | 12:45PM | 4 | $300.00 $1,200.00 4 $1,140.00
7/13/18 |to Wet N' Wild Hawaii (175)] 8:30AM | 2200PM* | 4 | $338.00 $1,352.00 4 $1,200.00
$3,752.00 $3,480.00
25. FERN COMMUNITY PARK
1202 Middle Street (832-7809)
(Children)
6/27/18 |to Chuck E Cheese Dilingham | (75) | 9:00AM | 12:00PM | 2 | $300.00 $600.00 2 | $285.00 $570.00
$600.00 $570.00
26. HALAWA DISTRICT PARK
99-795 IWAIWA ST. AIEA, HI 96701 (483-7852)
(Children)
6/21/17 [to Honolulu Zoo (150)| 845AM | 1:30PM | 3 | s260.00 $780.00 3 | $240.00 $720.00
7/5/18 |to lce Palace (150) | 8:45 AM 1:45PM | 3 | $260.00 $780.00 3 $210.00 $630.00
7/12/18 jto Ala Moana Regional Park | (150)| 8:30 AM 1:30PM | 3 | $260.00 $780.00 3 $220.00 $660.00
7/25/18 |to Wet N Wild (150)| 8:30 AM 3:00PM | 3 | $260.00 $780.00 3 | "$260.00 $780.00
7/27/18 |to Chuck E Cheese Pearl City | (150)| 8:45AM | 12:30PM | 3 | $260.00 $780.00 3 [$220.00 $660.00
$3,900.00 $3,450.00




27. KALAKAUA DISTRICT PARK
720 McNeill Street (832-7801)
(Children)
6/22/18 |to lce Palace (125)| 8:30am 1:30pm $900.00 $240.00 $720.00
6/27/18 |to Ala Moana Beach (125)}| 8:45am 1:00pm $900.00 $260.00 $780.00
_|{Shuttle)
7/10/2018 |to Kalihi Valley District Park (125)| 8:30am 1:15pm $300.00 $300.00 $720.00 $720.00
$2,100.00 $2,220.00




District Il - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment [ ( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
28, KALIHI UKA COMMUNITY PARK
2329 Kalihi Street (832-7807)
{Children)
6/19/18 |to Hanauma Bay (75) | 8:30AM | 1:00PM ( 2 | $338.00 $676.00 2 $325.00 $650.00
7/3/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center {75) | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 2 $375.00 $750.00 2 | $360.00 $720.00
7/13/18 lto Kualoa Regional Park | (75) | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 2 $338.00 $676.00 2 | $325.00 $650.00
. $2,102.00 -$2,020.00
29. KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX CHILDRENS PROGRAM
Kalihi Valley DP & Complex Office: 1911 Kamehameha IV Road (832-7811 OR 7812)
Kalihi Uka Community Park: 2329 Kalihi Street (832-7807) | |
Kamehameha Community Park: 1400 Kalihi Street {Enter thru Lohilani Street} (832-7819)
(CHILDRENS)
7/11/18 |to Gunstock Ranch (300)| 8:30am 1:00pm | 7 | $450.00 $3,150.00 7 | $425.00 $2,975.00
2 buses each at:
Kalihi Uka CP & Kamehameha CP $3,150.00 $2,975.00
3 buses at:
Kalihi Valley District Park
7/25/18 |to Ice Palace (300)| 9:00am 1:30pm | 7 | $300.00 $2,100.00 7 |- 's285.00 $1,995.00
2 buses each at:
Kalihi Uka CP & Kamehameha CP $2,100.00 £ $1,995.00
3 buses at:
Kalihi Valley District Park




30.

KALIHI VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

1911 Kamehameha IV Road (832-7812)

(Children)
6/20/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (125) 830 AM | 1:00 PM $338.00 $1,014.00 | $325.00 $975.00
7/13/18 |Haleiwa Surf Center (125)| 8:30AM | 1:00PM $375.00 $1,125.00 *$360.00 $1,080.00
$2,139.00 £$2,055.00
31. KAMEHAMEHA COMMUNITY PARK
1400 Kalihi Street (832-7819)
(Children)
6/20/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center | (100)}] 8:30 AM | 1:00 PM $375.00 $750.00 . $360.00 $720.00
6/27/18 |to K-Bay Lanes (100)| 8:30 AM 1:30 PM $300.00 $600.00 832500 $650.00
7/3/18 |to Hanauma Bay (100)| 8:30AM | 1:30 PM $338.00 $676.00 . $325.00 $650.00
$2,026.00 1$2,020.00




District Il - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No| Date Estimated Enroliment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
32, LANAKILA DISTRICT PARK
1701 Lanakila Avenue (832-7820)
{Children)
6/29/18 |to K-Bay Lanes (Kaneohe MCBH (100)| 8:45 AM 12230PM | 2 $300.00 $600.00 2 $650.00
7/6/18 |to Booth District Park (100} 8:45 AM 1:30 PM 2 $300.00 $600.00 2 $520.00
$1,200.00 $1170.00
33. MAKIKI COMPLEX CHILDREN'S PROGRAM
Makiki District Park: 1527 Keeaumoku Street (768-9290 or 9291)
Sheridan Community Park: 833 Piikoi Street (592-7041)
(Children)
7/13/18 |to Ice Palace (300)| 8:30AM 1:30PM | 6 | $300.00 $1,800.00 6 | $285.00 $1,710.00
1 bus at:
Sheridan CP to Makiki DP $1,800.00 $1,710.00
5 buses at:
Makiki DP




34, MAKIKI DISTRICT PARK | _
1527 Keeaumoku Street {768-9290)
(Children)
6/22/18 (to Waimea Bay (225} 8:30AM 1:00PM 5 $375.00 $1,875.00 5 $1,875.00
6/29/18 [to Kualoa Regional Park | (225)| 8:30AM 1:00PM 5 $413.00 $2,065.00 5 $1,750.00
7/6/18 |to Honolulu Zoo (225)| 9:00AM 1:15PM 5 $300.00 $1,500.00 5 260.0( $1,300.00
7/20/18 |to Waterpark (225)| 8:30AM 2:00PM | 5 | $338.00 $1,690.00 5 | $300.00 $1,500.00
$7,130.00 $6,425.00
35. MOANALUA COMMUNITY PARK
2900 Moanalua Road Honolulu, HI 96819 (831-7105)
{Children)
6/21/18 |to Gunstock Ranch (175)| 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 4 $413.00 $1,652.00 4 | $425.00 $1,700.00
6/28/18 [to Waimea Bay Beach Park (175)| 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 4 $450.00 $1,800.00 4 $425.00 $1,700.00
7/5/118 |to K-Bay Lanes (175)| 8:30AM | 1:30PM | 4 | $300.00 $1,200.00 4 | $325.00 $1,300.00
7/20/18 [to Magic Island, AlamoanaRP | (175)| 8:30 AM 1:30 PM 4 $300.00 $1,200.00 4 | $240.00 $960.00
7/26/18 [to Dave and Busters (175)| 8:30 AM 4 $300.00 $1,200.00 4 m..‘_..“.,..m,nmo..oo” $1,040.00
from Ala Moana Regional Park 1:30 PM
$7,052.00 $6,700.00




District I - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc,
Group No] Date Estimated Enroliment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per | | of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
36. PU'UNUI COMMUNITY PARK
2555 Puunui Ave (595-2460)
(Children)
6/22/18 |To Kualoa Regional Park | (75) | 830AM | 1:00PM | 2 | $413.00 $826.00 2 | $350.00 $700.00
7/6/18 |To Chuck E. Cheese (Pearl City)] (75) | 9:00AM | 1:00PM | 2 | $300.00 $600.00 2 | $285.00 $570.00
7113/18 |To Consolidated Theaters (Ward| (75) | +8:30 AM | 11:45AM | 2 $300.00 $600.00 2 | ::$265.00 $530.00
+FIELDTRIP TIME WILL VARY DEPENDING ON MOVIE LENGTH _
$2,026.00
37. SALT LAKE DISTRICT PARK
1159 Ala Lilikoi Pl. (831-7100)
(Children)
6/20/18 |to Ala Moana Beach Park | (150)| 8:30 AM 1:15PM | 3 | $300.00 $900.00 3 | --'$260.00 $780.00
6/21/18 |to Ala Moana Beach Park | (150)| 830AM | 1:15PM | 3 | $300.00 $900.00 3 | $260.00 $780.00
6/28/18 [to Wet n Wild (275)| 845AM | 2:00PM | & | $338.00 $2,028.00 6 | $28500{ | $1,710.00
7/13/18 _|to Kapolei Consolidated Theater| (275)| 8:30 AM | 11:30PM | 6 | $338.00 $2,028.00 6 | $285.00 $1,710.00
7/26/18 |to Ice Palace (275)| 845AM | 145PM | 6 | $300.00 $1,800.00 6 | -$260.00 $1,560.00
$7,656.00 $6,540.00




38.

AIEA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

Aiea Complex Office: 99-3500 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7860)_

Aiea District Park: 99-3500 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7859) -

Salt Lake District Park: 1159 Ala Lilikoi Place (831-7100)

(Mahalo Banquet)

7/30/18

to Salt Lake District Park | (50)

4:00 PM

_$293.00

$293.00

$350.00

$350.00

to Aiea District Park

to Hawaii Okinawa Center

9:00 PM

$350.00

39.

BOOTH COMPLEX TEENS

Booth District Park: 2331 Kaneali’i Avenue (522-7040)

(Mahalo Banquet)

7/30/18

to Booth District Park (50)

4:00 p.m..

- $338.00

$338.00

$350.00

to Pu'unui Community Park

$350.00

to Lanakila District Park

to Hawai'i Ckinawa Center

9:00 p.m.

. $338.00

$350.00




District Il - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enroliment |{( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
40. HALAWA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM (Complex Office 483-7850)
Fern Community Park 1202 Middle Street (832-7809)
Halawa District Park 99-795 IWAIWA ST. (483-7852)
(Mahalo Banquet)
7/30/18 |to Moanalua Community Park | (48) | 4:00 PM 1 ..amw_w“..oo $293.00 1 $350.00 $350.00
to Halawa District Park
to Hawaii Okinawan Center 9:15 PM
. $293.00 $350.00
41. KALAKAUA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM {Complex Office 832-7800)
Beretania Community Park: 1290 Aala Street (522-7022)
Kalakaua District Park: 720 Mcneill St. (832-7801)
(Mahalo Banquet)
7/30/2018 [to Beretania Community P{ (50) |4:00pm 1 |- $338.00 $338.00 1 $350.00 $350.00
to Kalakaua District Park
to Hawaii Okinawan Center 9:15 PM
. $338.00 $350.00




42, KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM (Complex Office 832-7811)
Kalihi Valley District Park: 1911 Kamehameha IV Road (832-7812)
Kalihi Uka Community Park: 2329 Kalihi Street (832-7807) |
Kamehameha Community Park: 1400 Kalihi Street {Enter thru Lohilani Street} (832-7819)
{Mahalo Banquet) .
7/30/18 |to Kamehameha CP (50) | 4:00 PM ©$338.00 $338.00 $350.00 $350.00
to Kalihi Uka CP .
to Kalihi Valley DP
to Hawaii Okinawan Center 9:15 PM
. $338.00 $350.00
43. MAKIKI COMPLEX TEENS
Makiki Complex Office; 1527 Keeaumoku Street (768-9285)
Makiki District Park: 1527 Keeaumoku Street (768-9291)
Sheridan Community Park: 833 Piikoi Street (592-7041)
(Mahalo Banquet) .
7/30/18 |to Sheridan CP (48) 4:00 PM ~ $338.00 $338.00 $350.00 $350.00
to Makiki District Park
to Hawaii Okinawa Center 9:00 PM
" $338.00 $350.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
44, ASING COMMUNITY PARK
91-1450 Renton Rd. (681-6435)
(Children)
6/20/18 |to Waikiki Aquarium 150 | 8:30 AM 3 | $296.00 $888.00 3 | $240.00 $720.00
p/u @ Honolulu Zoo parking lot 1:00 PM
6/27/18 |to Ice Palace 150 | 830AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $293.00 $879.00 3 [ $240.00 $720.00
7/11/18 |to Chuck E Cheese Dilingham | 150 | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 3 $293.00 $879.00 3 | $240.00 $720.00
7/18/18 [to Ala Moana BP 150 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $325.00 $975.00 3 [ 7$240.00 $720.00
7/27/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | 150 | 8:30 AM 1:.00PM | 3 | $325.00 $975.00 3 |$325.00 $975.00
$4,596.00
45, CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK
94-1220 Lumikula St. (671-4838)
{Children)
6/20/18 {to Ice Palace 100 | 8:30 AM 1:00PM | 2 | $260.00 $520.00 2 | $240,00 $480.00
6/20/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 100 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 2 | $260.00 $520.00 2 | $240.00 $480.00
(Dillingham)
6/27/18 |to Wet & Wild 200 | 8:30 AM 115PM | 4 | $260.00 $1,040.00 4 $220.0 $880.00
7/11/18 |to Ala Moana BP 200 | 8:30AM | 1115PM | 4 | $293.00 $1,172.00 4 | $240.00 $960.00
$3,262.00




46,

EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK

91-955 North Road (689-0370)

(Children)

6/15/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 125 | 8:45AM | 1:00 PM $260.00 $780.00 . $240.00 $720.00
(Peari City)

7/12/18 |to Koolau Theater 125 | 8:45AM | 12:00 PM $390.00 $1,170.00 | '$325.00 $975.00
to Kaneohe District Park 1:00 PM

7/26/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | 125 | 8:45 AM 1:00 PM $390.00 $1,170.00 e mmnmco $975.00
(Shuttle)

6/27/18 |to Makakilo Pool 125 | 8:45AM | 12:45 PM $500.00 $500.00 1'1$600,00 $600.00

7/11/18 |to Makakilo Pool 125 | 845AM | 12:45 PM $500.00 $500.00 ©'.$600.00 $600.00

$4,120.00 $3,870.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
‘ Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No| Date Estimated Enrollment )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
47. EWA MAHIKO DISTRICT PARK - LOWER
91-1205 Renton Road (681-8315)
(Children)
6/19/18 |to Alii Beach Park 200 | 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $390.00 $1,560.00 4 | $350.00 $1,400.00
6/26/18 |to Koolau Theater 200 | 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $358.00 $1,432.00 4 $350.00 $1,400.00
7/10/18 |{to Kaimana Beach Park | 200 | 8:45AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $325.00 $1,300.00 4 240.01 $960.00
7M17/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 200 | 9:00 AM 1:15 PM 4 $260.00 $1,040.00 4 $920.00
(Pearl City)
7/24/18 |to Gunstock Ranch 200 | 8:30AM | 12:30PM | 4 | $390.00 $1,560.00 4 $350.00 $1,400.00
$6.892.00 $6,080.00
48. EWA MAHIKO DISTRICT PARK - UPPER
91-1205 Renton Road (681-8315)
(Children)
6/26/18 |to Alii Beach Park 200 | 845AM | 12:45PM | 4 | $325.00 $1,300.00 4 | " $350.00 $1,400.00
7/110/18 |to Koolau Theater 200 | 8:45AM | 12:30PM | 4 | $358.00 $1,432.00 4 | $350.00 $1,400.00
7/17/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 200 | 8:45AM | 12:00PM | 4 | $260.00 $1,040.00 4 | $240.00 $960.00
(Kalihi) .
7/24/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | 200 | 8:45 AM 1245PM | 4 $390.00 $1,560.00 4 | .$350.00 $1,400.00
{Shuttle) .
6/21/18 }to Makakilo Pool 200 | 845 AM 11:30 AM 1 $500.00 $500.00 1 mmun.”oo $600.00
$5,832.00 $5,760.00




49.

EWA COMPLEX TEENS - MAHALO

Makakilo Community Park

92-1120 MAKAKILO DRIVE (672-8465)

7/24/18 |Makakilo Community Park| 36 | 2:15 PM " $325.00 $325.00 $400.00 $400.00
to Asing Community Parl 2:30 PM
fo Alii Beach Park 8:.00 PM
" $325.00 $400.00
50. Ewa Beach Community Park
91-955 North Road (689-0370)
7/30/18 |Ewa Beach Community Pal 42 | 8:45 AM  $325.00 $325.00 $400.00 $400.00
to Ewa Mahiko District Park 9:00 AM .
to Alii Beach Park 3:00 PM
©°$325.00 $400.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No.| Date Estimated Enrollment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
51, HO AE"AE COMMUNITY PARK

94-709 Kaaholo Street (676-8832)

{Children)
6/20/18 |to San SouciBeach Park | 175 | 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $293.00 $1,172.00 4 | $280.00 $1,120.00
6/27/18 |to San Souci Beach Park | 175 | 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $293.00 $1,172.00 4 [7.7$280.00 $1,120.00
7/3/18 |to Ice Palace 100 | 845AM | 1:30PM | 2 | $260.00 $520.00 2 | '$230.00 $460.00
7/3/18 |to Ala Moana Beach Park | 75 | 845AM | 1:00PM | 2 | $293.00 $586,00 2 | $270.00 $540.00
7/11/18 |to San Souci Beach Park | 175 | 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $203.00 $1,172.00 4 | ‘$280.00 $1,120.00
7/25/18 {to San Souci Beach Park | 175 | 8:45 AM 1:00PM | 4 | $293.00 $1,172.00 4 | $280.00 $1,120.00

$5,794.00 . '$5,480.00
52, KALANIANAOLE BEACH PARK

89-269 Farrington Highway (668-1137)

(Children) .
6/25/18 |to Polynesian Cultural Center 200 | 7:45 AM 1245PM | 4 $455.00 $1,820.00 4 |- ”.who@.”.o_o“” $1,600.00
7/16/18 |to Wet & Wild 200 [ 8:45AM | 145PM | 4 | $260.00 $1,040.00 4 | $210.00 $840.00
7/23/18 |to Ice Palace 200 | 830AM | 1:15PM | 4 | $325.00 $1,300.00 4 | $275.00 $1,100.00

$4,160.00 $3,540,00




53.

MAILI COMMUNITY PARK

|

87-360 Kulaaupuni Street (696-4766)

(Children)
6/28/18 |to Ice Palace 175 | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 4 $325.00 $1,300.00 $1,140.00
7/112/18 |to Wet & Wild” 175 8:30 AM 1:30 PM 4 $293.00 $1,172.00 $1,000.00
7/26/18 |to Polynesian Cultural Center 175 | 7:45 AM 1245PM | 4 $455.00 $1,820.00 $1,600.00
$4,292.00  $3,740.00
54, MAKAHA COMMUNITY PARK
84-730 Manuki Street (695-9466)
{Children)
6/20/18 |to lce Palace 125 8:00 AM 1:00 PM 3 $320.00 $1,170.00 $1,050.00
7M11/18 |to Wet & Wild 125 8:15 AM 1:15 PM 3 $325.00 $975.00 $900.00
7/25/18 |to Pearlridge Theater 125 | 8:15 AM 1:00 PM 3 $390.00 $1,170.00 $900.00
$3,315.00 $2,850.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No.| Date Estimated Enrollment | ( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
55. MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK
92-1140 Makakilo Drive (672-8465)
(Children) ‘
6/15/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 300 | 8:45 AM 1:15 PM 6 | $325.00 $1,950.00 6 |:7$265.00 $1,590.00
(Dillingham)
6/29/18 |to Sea Life Park 300 8:30 AM 1:45 PM 6 $390.00 $2,340.00 6 $2,190.00
7/6/18  |to Polynesian Cultural Center 300 8:45 AM 1:00 PM 6 $390.00 $2,340.00 6 $2,400.00
7/13/18 |to Aiea Bowl 300 | 8:45AM 1245PM | 6 $293.00 $1,758.00 . 6 $1,440.00
(Shuttle)
7/24/18 |to Makakilo Pool 300 | 8:50 AM 115PM | 1 $563.00 $563.00 1 | $600.00
(Teen) i
6/21/18 |to Ice Palace 50 [ 5:30PM | 9:30PM | 1 | $293.00 $293.00 1 |- '$350.00 $350.00
6/28/18 |to Ward Theater 50 | 2:30PM | 830PM | 1 | $203.00 $293.00 1 | $350.00 $350.00
7/7/18 |to Bay View Mini Putt 50 | 3:15PM 8:15 PM 1 $325.00 $325.00 1 | "$350.00 $350.00
7/13/18 |to Mililani District Park 50 | 4:45PM | 9:15PM | 1 | $293.00 $293.00 1 | $265.00 $265.00
$10,155.00 $8,935.00




56.

MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - LOWER

94-1150 Lanikuhana Avenue (623-5258)

(Chiidren)
6/28/18 to Polynesian Cultural Center 225 | T:30AM | 12:30 PM +$420,00 $2,100.00 No bid No bid
7/6/18 |to K-Bay Lanes 225 | 8:30AM | 1:45PM . '$350.00 $1,750.00 No bid No bid
7/26/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 225 | 9:00 AM | 12:30 PM - $350.00 $1,750.00 No bid No bid
(Dillingham)
“$5,600.00 No Bid
57. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - UPPER
94-1150 Lanikuhana Avenue (623-5258)
{Children)
6/28/18 |to Polynesian Cultural Center 200 | 7:30 AM 12:30 PM .a&..n.?oo $1,680.00 No bid No bid
7/6/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 200 | 9:00AM | 1:00 PM - $350.00 $1,400.00 No bid No bid
(Dillingham)
7/26/18 |to K-Bay Lanes 200 | 8:30 AM 1:45 PM wwma._.oo $1,400.00 No bid No bid
' $4,480.00 No Bid




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
58, MILILANI COMPLEX TEEN - MAHALO
94-1150 Lanikuhana Avenue (623-3170)
(Teen)
7/30/18 |Wahiawa Distirct Park 48 8:30 AM 1 | mw._moc $315.00 1 No bid No bid
to Crestview Community Park 8:45 AM
fo Wet & Wild 2:30 PM
7/30/18 |Whitmore Community Park 48 8:30 AM 1 | «3 moo $315.00 1 No bid No bid
to Mililani District Park 8:45 AM
to Wet & Wild 2:30 PM
$630.00 No Bid
59. PACIFIC PALISADES COMMUNITY PARK
2282 Auhuhu Street (453-7557) *Pick up at Palisades Elementary School (2306 Auhuhu St}
(Children) ‘
7/5/18 |to Ice Palace 75 | 830AM | 1:115PM | 2 | $280.00 $560.00 2 | $240.00 $450.00
7/5118 |to Chuck E Cheese 50 | 9:.00AM | 1:15PM | 1 | s$280.00 $280.00 1 | $240.00 $240.00
{Pearl City)
7/11/18 (to Alii Beach Park 125 | 8:30 AM 1:15PM | 3 | $385.00 $1,155.00 3 | $385.00 $1,155.00
7/18/18 |[to Waimea Bay Beach Par| 125 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $420.00 $1,260.00 3 |- $400.00 $1,200.00
7/27/18 |to Alii Beach Park-westen] 125 | 830AM | 1:15PM | 3 | $385.00 $1,155.00 3 | :$385.00 $1,155.00
$4,410.00 $4,230.00




60. PEARL CITY DISTRICT PARK |
785 Hoomaemae Street (453-7550)
(Children)
6/22/18 |to Pearlridge Theater 250 | 9:00AM | 12:30 PM $260.00 $1,300.00 - $240.00 $1,200.00
6/29/18 |to Waimea Bay Beach Par| 250 9:00 AM 12:45 PM $390.00 $1,950.00 - gal 0,00 $2,000.00
7/13/18 |[to Polynesian Cultural Cente] 250 | 8:00 AM | 12:45 PM $423.00 $2,115.00 $400.00 $2,000.00
$5,365.00  $5,200.00
61. PEARL CITY COMPLEX TEEN - MAHALO
785 Hoomaemae Street (453-7551)
{(Teen)
7/30/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 75 | 830AM | 1:30 PM - '$358.00 $716.00 $385.00 $770.00
 $716.00 $770.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per | | of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus| Bus Bus Bus
62. PILILAAU COMMUNITY PARK
85-166 Plantation Road (696-4442}
{Children) ‘
6/22/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 75 | 830AM | 1:00PM | 1 | $325.00 $325.00 1 $265.00 $265.00
(Pearl City)
6/22/18 lio Ice Palace 75 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 2 $325.00 $650.00 2 $300.00 $600.00
6/29/18 |to Pearlridge Theater 150 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $325.00 $975.00 3 | $265.00 $795.00
7/13/18 |to Wet & Wild 150 | 8:30AM | 4:00PM | 3 | $293.00 $879.00 3 | $280.00 $840.00
$2,829.00 $2,500,00
63. WAHIAWA DISTRICT PARK
1129 Kilani Avenue (621-5663)
(Children)
6/20/18 |to Mililani Theater (175)| 9:30AM | 1:.00PM | 4 | '$280.00 $1,120.00 4 | NoBid No Bid
6/27/18 |to Gunstock Ranch (175)| 8:45 AM 1:00PM | 4 | $420.00 $1,680.00 4 | NoBid No Bid
7/11/18 |to Chuck E Cheese | (175)| 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 { $315.00 $1,260.00 4 | NoBid No Bid
(Pearl City) ‘
7/18/18 |to Ice Palace (175)| 845AM | 1:00PM | 4 | '$315.00 $1,260.00 4 | NoBid No Bid
$5,320.00 No Bid




64. WAIANAE DISTRICT PARK |
85-601 Farrington Highway (696-5039)
{Children)
71318 [to Sea Life Park 200 7:30 AM 1:30 PM $390.00 $1,560.00 $1,600.00
7/10/18 |to Polynesian Cultural Center 200 7:30 AM 12:40 PM $423.00 $1,692.00 $1,600.00
7/24/18 |to Wet & Wild 200 8:45 AM 1:30 PM $293.00 $1,172.00 $960.00
$4,424.00 $4,160.00
65. WAIANAE COMPLEX TEEN
85-601 Farrington Highway (696-5039)
(Teen)
7/30/18 |Waianae District Park 100 | 9:00 AM . $358.00 $716.00 $380.00 $760.00
to McCoy Pavillion 9:00 PM
Kalanianaole Beach Park | 50 | 9:00 AM - $325.00 $325.00 $380.00 $380.00
to McCoy Pavillion 9:00 PM
-$1,041.00 $1,140.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No{ Date Estimated Enrollment | ( Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
86. WAIAU DISTRICT PARK
98-1650 Kaahumanu Street (453-7555)
(Children) .
6/20/18 |to Koolau Theater 175 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $325.00 $1,300.00 4 $300.00 $1,200.00
7/6/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 175 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM [ 4 | $293.00 $1,172.00 4 $240.00 $960.00
(Dillingham) T
7/12/18 " |to Waimea Bay Beach Park 175 | 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 4 | $380.00 $1,560.00 4 $350.00 $1,400.00
(Shuttle)
6/29/18 {to Manana Pool 175 | 830AM | 1:30PM | 1 [ $325.00 $325.00 1 $600.00 $600.00
7/24/18 |to Manana Pool 175 | 8:30 AM 1:30 PM 1 | $32500 $325.00 1 $600.00 $600.00
°$4,682.00 $4,760.00
69. WAIKELE COMMUNITY PARK
94-870 Lumiaina Street (676-7855)
(Children)
6/19/18 {to San Souci Beach Park | 100 | 845AM | 1:15PM | 2 | $358.00 $716.00 2 | $285.00 $570.00
6/26/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 100 | 845AM | 1:15PM | 2 | $325.00 $650.00 2 | $300.00 $600.00
7/10/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 100 | 8:45AM | 1:30PM | 2 | $260.00 $520.00 2 | . $220.00 $440.00
(Pearl City)
7/17/18 |to Hanauma Bay Beach Pk 100 | 8:45 AM 1:15PM | 2 | $325.00 $650.00 2 | $350.00 $700.00
7/24/18 |to Ice Palace 100 | 8:45AM | 1115AM | 2 | $260.00 $520.00 2 |- $230.00 $460.00
$3,056.00 1$2,770.00




|

WAIPAHU DISTRICT PARK

94-230 Paiwa Street {675-7129)

(Children)
6/22/18 |to Ala Moana Beach Park | 125 | 9:00 AM 1:15PM | 3| $325.00 $975.00 3 [ $265:00 $795.00
7/20/18 [to Waimea Bay Beach Park 100 | 9:00AM | 1:15PM | 2 | $325.00 $650.00 2 | . s325.00 $650.00
7/27/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 100 | 9:00AM | 1:15PM | 2 | $325.00 $650.00 2 | $300.00 $600.00

**Request for bus route using H2 Freeway to destination

$2,275.00 $2,045.00




District lll - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport inc.
Group No Date Estimated Enrollment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per _of Per
Of Trip ) Time . " Time |Bus| Bus Bus| Bus
_
71. WAIPAHU COMPLEX TEEN -MAHALO
94-230 Paiwa Street (676-7855)
(Teen)
7/31/18 [Ho'ae'ae Community Park| 50 | 3:30 PM 1 | $325.00 $325.00 1 $385.00 $385.00
to Waikele Community Pk 3:45 PM
to Waipahu District Park 4:00 PM . $325.00 $385.00
to Ala Moana Hotel 10:00 PM
72, WHITMORE COMMUNITY PARK
1259 Whitmore Avenue (622-2420)
(Children)
7/17/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 100 8:30 AM 1:15 PM 2 |.$315.00 $630.00 2 No Bid No Bid
7/25/18 |to Chuck E Cheese 100 | 8:45 AM 1116 PM | 2 | $385.00 $770.00 2 No Bid No Bid
(Dillingham)
$1,400.00 No Bid




73. AHUIMANU COMMUNITY PARK
47-450 Hui Aeko Place (239-6594)
(Children)
6/19/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (175)| 8:40 AM 1:00 PM - $340.00 $1,360.00 No Bid No Bid
{Shuttle)
6/26/18 lto Kaneohe District Park Pool | (175)| 8:45 AM 1:00 PM '$563.00 $563.00 No Bid No Bid
7/17/18 |to Kaneohe District Park Pool | (175)| 8:45 AM 1:00 PM $563.00 $563.00 No Bid No Bid
7/24/18 |to Kaneohe District Park Pool | (175)| 8:45 AM 1:00 PM _'$563.00 $563.00 No Bid No Bid
+$3,049.00 No Bid
74. BLANCHE POPE ELEMENTARY
41-133 Huli St. {259-9106)
{Children)
6/28/17 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (100)| 8:30 AM | 1:00 PM $425.00 $850.00 No Bid No Bid
7/12/17 |to Chuck E. Cheeses (Dillinghamj (100) | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM '$425.00. $850.00 No Bid No Bid
7/19/17 |to Ice Palace (100)| 8:30 AM 1:15 PM 1$425.00 $850.00 No Bid No Bid
- $2,550.00 No Bid




District IV - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No..| Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
75, ENCHANTED LAKE COMMUNITY PARK SUMMER FUN
770 Keolu Drive, Kailua, HI 96734 (266-7665)
(Children) .
6/22/18 |K-Bay Bowling Center (125)| 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $383.00 $1,149.00 3 | NoBid No Bid
6/27/17 |Kailua District Park Pool | (125) 830AM | 1:00PM | 3 |-$383.00 $1,149.00 3 | NoBid No Bid
7/6/18 |Kualoa Regional Park | (125)| 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 [ $425.00 $1,275.00 3 | NoBid No Bid
7/20/18 _|Chuck E. Cheese - Dilingham | (125)| 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $283.00 $1,149.00 3 | NoBid No Bid
_$4,722.00 No Bid
76. HAUULA COMMUNITY PARK
54-040 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5564)
{Children) .
6/21/18 |Kualoa Beach Park (100} | 8:50 AM 1:30 PM 2 | '$468,00 $936.00 2 No Bid No Bid
7/5/118 [Hickam Air Force Bowling { (100)| 8:50 AM 1250 PM | 2 | $383.00 $766.00 2 No Bid No Bid
7/20/18 [Chuck E Cheese -Pearl City (100)| 8:30 AM 12245PM | 2 | _mhn_mba $850.00 2 No Bid No Bid
$2,552.00 No Bid




77. HEEIA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
46-202 Haiku Road (233-7335)
(Children)
6/28/18 [to Honolulu Zoo (250)| 9:00 AM 1:00 PM - $408.0( $2,340.00 '5 No Bid No Bid
7/12/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (250)] 8:30 AM | 1:00 PM - $425.00 $2,125.00 5 | NoBid No Bid
7/19/18 |to Chuck E. Cheese (Dillngham)] (250)| 8:45AM | 1:00 PM "~ $425.00 $2,125.00 5 | NoBid No Bid
. $6,590.00 No Bid
78. KAHALUU SUMMER FUN
47-280 Waihee Rd. (239-8726)
{Children)
2/127/18 |[to Haleiwa Surf Center | (100)| 8:30AM | 1:15 PM '$468.00 $936.00 2 | NoBid No Bid
7111118 |to Kalihi Valley Pool (100)| 8:30AM | 1:30 PM *'$383.00 $766.00 2 | NoBid No Bid
7117118 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (100)| 8:30 AM | 1:30 PM $340.00 $680.00 2 | NoBid No Bid
$2,382.00 No Bid




District IV - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area . Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Ing.
Group No Date Estimated Enrollment | ( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
79. KAHUKU DISTRICT PARK
56-576 Kamehameha Highway (293-5116)
(Children)
6/22/18 |to Hoomaluhia Gardens | (125)| 8:30AM | 1:00PM | 3 | $425.00 $1,275.00 3 | NoBid No Bid
6/29/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center (125)| 8:30 AM 1:00 PM 3 | "$383.00 $1,149.00 3 No Bid No Bid
7/19/18 |to Kalihi Swimming Pool | (125)| 8:30 AM 1:00PM | 3 | .$510.00 $1,530.00 3 No Bid No Bid
$3,954.00 No Bid
-~ 80. KAILUA SUMMER FUN
- 315 Kuulei Road (266-7650)
{Children) .
6/26/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (250)| 8:30AM | 1:16PM | 5 | '$383.00 $1,915.00 5 | NoBid No Bid
7/3/118  |to Honolulu Zoo (250)| 8:30AM | 12:45PM | 5 |- '$383.00 $1,915.00 5 No Bid No Bid
7110118 |to Sea Life Park (250)| 8:30 AM | 12:45PM | 5 | $383.00 $1,915.00 5 | NoBid No Bid
$5,745.00 No Bid




81.

KAINALU ELEMENTARY SUMMER FUN

165 Kaiholu St (266-7655)

(Children)
7/11/18 |to Sea Life Park (125)| 830 AM | 1:15PM $383.00 $1,149.00 No Bid No Bid
7/19/18 |to K-Bay Lanes (125} 8:30AM | 12:00 PM - $340.00 $1,020.00 No Bid No Bid
7/25/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (125)| 8:30 AM 12:45 PM - $383.00 $1,149.00 No Bid No Bid
'$3,318.00 No Bid
82. KANEOHE DISTRICT PARK
45-660 Keaahala Rd. (768-8991)
(Teens)
6/23/18 |to McCoy Pavillion (48) | 545PM | 8:45PM | $383.00 $383.00 No Bid No Bid
7/16/18 |to Tiki's Family Fun Center (48) | 815AM | 1:45PM . $340.00 $340.00 No Bid No Bid
'$723.00 No Bid
83. KAPUNAHALA NEIGHBORHOOD PARK
45-800 Anoi Road (233-7316)
(Children)
7/3/18  |to Chuck E Cheese (Dillingham) | (250) 8:30 AM 1:00 PM - $383.00 $1,915.00 No Bid No Bid
7/10/18 |to Malackahana State Recreation Area| (250) | 8:30 AM 1:00 PM '$425.00 $2,125.00 No Bid No Bid
56-207 Kamehameha Hwy. Kahuku, Hi
7/17118 |to K-Bay Lanes (250)| 8:30AM | 1:30PM $340.00 $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid
$5,740.00 No Bid




District IV - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enrollment | ( )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
84. LAIE SUMMER FUN
55-109 Kulanui (768-8998)
(Children)
6/19/18 |to Haleiwa Surf Center (125)| 8:30 AM 1:30 PM 3 [ mnmmoo $1,404.00 3 No Bid No Bid
7/10/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (125)| 8:30AM | 1:30PM | 3 |- $425.00 $1,275.00 3 | NoBid No Bid
7/25/18 [to Kalihi Valley Pool (125)| 8:30 AM 1:15PM | 3 | $425.00 $1,275.00 3 No Bid No Bid
$3,954.00 No Bid
85. SUNSET BEACH NEIGHBORHOOD PARK
59-360 KAMEHAMEHA Hwy. (638-7213)
(Children) .
7/3118  |to Waikiki Aquarium (100)| 830AM | 12:40PM | 2 | $510.00 $1,020.00 2 | NoBid' No Bid
7/25/18 |Ali'i Beach Park (100)] 8:45 AM 1:30PM | 2 | :$425.00 $850.00 2 No Bid No Bid
$1,870.00 No Bid




© 86. WAIALUA DISTRICT PARK
67-180 Goodale Ave. (637-9721)
{Children)
6/29/18 |to Gunstock Ranch (225)| 8:00AM | 12:45PM ' $425.00 $2,125.00 No Bid No Bid
7/27/18 |to Chuck E. Cheese (Pearl City) | (225)| 8:45 AM | 12:45 PM "$468.00 $2,340.00 No Bid No Bid
-|{Teens)
6/23/18 |to McCoy Pavilion (48) 4:30PM|  8:15PM - $510,00 $510.00 No Bid No Bid
$4,975.00 No Bid
87. WAIMANALO DISTRICT PARK SUMMER FUN
41-415 Hihimanu St. (259-8926)
(Children)
6/26/17 |to K-Bay Bowling Center | (100)| 8:30 AM 1:00 PM $850.00 No Bid No Bid
7/13/17 to Kualoa Regional Park | (100)}| 8:30 AM 1:00 PM $936.00 No Bid No Bid
7/24/18 |10 Chuck e Cheese (Dilingham) | (100)| 8:30 AM | 1:00 PM $850.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid




District IV - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018
Pragram Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No] Date Estimated Enroliment |( )| Departure | Departure | of Per | | of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
88. KAHALUU COMPLEX TEENS
Kahuku High School _
56-490 KAMEHAMEHA Hwy. (293-5116)
6/23/18 |to Laie Elementary | 50) | s:00PM | 845PM | 1 | $s53.00 $553.00 1 | NoBid No Bid
to Hauula Community Park
to Kahaluu Community Park " $553.00 No Bid
to McCoy Pavillion
89. Laie Elementary Cafeteria
55-109 Kulanui (768-8998)
(Mahalo)
7/30/18 {to Hauula Community Park (50) | 12:00 PM 1 | $595.00 $595.00 1 | NoBid . No Bid
to Croc Center 12:15 PM A
to Ewa Mahiko District Park 5:45PM | 7:00 PM ©.$595,00 No Bid
90. Kahuku High School
56-490 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5116)
{(Mahalo)
7/30/18 |to Kahaluu Community Paf (50) | 12:00 PM 1 | $595.00 $595.00 1 No Bid No Bid
to Croc Center 12:15 PM
to Ewa Mahiko District Park 5:45PM | 7:00 PM " /$595.00 No Bid




91. KAI-WAIMANALO COMPLEX TEENS
41-415 Hihimanu St. (259-8015)
(Teens)
6/23/17 |to Enchanted Lake CP (48) | 5:00PM | 8:15PM '$425,00 $425.00 No Bid No Bid
to McCoy Pavilion
No Bid
{Mahalo) .
7/30/17 |to Enchanted Lake CP | (48) | 9:00AM | 3:00 PM | $425.00 $425.00 No Bid No Bid
to Ala Moana Beach Park
°$850.00 No Bid




District IV - Summer Bus REGULAR Excursion Schedule - 2018

Program Area, Destination Area Return No. Robert's Hawaii No. Ground Transport Inc.
Group No| Date Estimated Enrollment |{ )| Departure | Departure | of Per of Per
Of Trip Time Time Bus Bus Bus Bus
92. KANEOHE COMPLEX TEENS
Kaneohe District Park _
45-660 Keaahala Rd. {(768-8989)
(Mahalo)
7/31/18 |to Ahuimanu Community Park | (48) | 12:30 PM 1 |+ $425.00 $425.00 1 | NoBid No Bid
fo Kualoa Regional Park 7:30 PM
7/31/18 |to Kualoa Regional Park | (48) | 12:30PM | 7:30PM | 1 | $383.00 $383.00 1 No Bid No Bid
$808.00 No Bid
a3, WAIALUA COMPLEX TEENS
WAIALUA DISTRICT PARK
67-180 Goodale Avenue (637-9721)
{(Mahalo)
7/31/18 [to Wet N Wild (48) | 9:15 AM 4:00 PM 1 | '$468.00 $468.00 1 No Bid No Bid
.-$468.00 No Bid




