Opened: May 2, 2018
For- RFB-DFM-1038604 Hawaii Specialty
or: Aerial Trucks Bidder Braun Northwest, Inc. Vehicles, LLC
Item No. Description Quantity Unit Price Unit Price
New Ambulance- Price shall include all applicable costs for
1A installing Cot Mounting System. 4 $204,240.76 $816,963.04 $222,733.01 $890,932.04
Cot Mount Option No.1- Price to install City Furnished
1B Manual Load Cot Mount System 4 $500.00 $2,000.00 $261.78 $1,047.12
Cot Track Option No. 2- Price to Install City Furnished Power
1C Load Cot Mount System 4 $750.00 $3,000.00 $1,570.68 $6,282.72
Total Evaluated Price (New) $821,963.04 $898,261.88
Remounted Ambulance- Price Shall include all applicable
2A costs excluding costs for installing Cot Mounting System 4 $199,985.26| $ 799,941.04 No Bid
Cot Track Option No. 1- Price to install City Furnished
2B Manual Load Cot Mount System 4 $500.00| $ 2,000.00 No Bid
Cot Track Option No. 2- Price to install City Furnished Power
2C Load Cot Mount System 4 $750.00( $ 3,000.00 No Bid
2D Additional Repair Work- Labor Allowance 10 $100.00 $1,000.00 No Bid
The Cost to the
City shall be the
actual cost
charged to the
Contractor for the
2E Additional Repair Work- Material Allowance material
Total Evaluated Price (Remounted) $805,941.04 No Bid




