
City and County of Honolulu

Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2018

For:

International Trucks Of Hawaii, LLC

Hawaii Truck Parts, Sales and
Services LLC

Gordon Truck Center
Inc. dba Freightliner of

Hawaii Cutter Ford, Inc.

Item No. Description Quantity

1

35,000 lbs GVWR Truck Bobtail Design,

Service Body and 45 foot Insulated Articulating-
Telescoping Hydraulic Boom with Material
Handling Feature 2

Unit Price $ 277,436.00 288,852.67$ $ 278,215.00 No Bid
Total $ 554,872.00 577,705.34$ $ 556,430.00
Manufacturer: International Altec Mack Altec Freightliner Altec

Model:

MV TAM Series with Material Handling

GRANITE TA41M-L46

Freightliner Model M2

106 Altec Model TA41M-
L46

2

35,000 lbs GVWR Truck Bobtail Design,
Service Body and 45 foot Insulated Articulating-

Telescoping Hydraulic Boom 2
Unit Price $ 279,549.00 $ 290,975.28 $ 280,518.00 No Bid

Total $ 559,098.00 $ 581,950.56 $ 561,036.00
Manufacturer: International Altec Mack Altec Freightliner Altec

Model: MV TAM Series GRANITE TA41M-L46

Freightliner Model M2

106 Altec Model TA41M-
L46

3

35,000 lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis with
75-foot Articulating Aerial Device with 1-Man

Bucket, 10-foot Compensating Vertical
Elevator and 14.5 cubic yard Chip Box 1
Unit Price 334,973.69$ $ 341,107.38 $ 335,002.00

Total 334,973.69$ $ 341,107.38 $ 335,002.00 No Bid

Manufacturer: International Altec Mack Altec Freightliner Altec

Model: MV LR7-60E70 GRANITE LR7-60E70

Freightliner Model M2
106 Altec Model LR7-

60E70

4

58,000 lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis with

100-foot Aerial Device and Two-Man Bucket,

Compensating Boom with Vertical Elevator

Function and Material Handling 1
Unit Price No Bid $ 519,992.05 $ 544,190.00 No Bid
Total $ 519,992.05 $ 544,190.00

Manufacturer: Mack Altec Freightliner Altec

Model: GRANITE AA67-E100

Freightliner Model

114SD Altec Model
AA67-E100

5

Truck with Service Body and Telescopic

Articulating Aerial Device 2
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 156,895.22

Total $ 313,790.44
Manufacturer: Ford

Model:

F450 Chassis Cab

(F4G)

RFB-DFM-1038604
Aerial Trucks

Prepared by Purchasing 5/3/2018


