Furnish and Deliver Ammunition for a Twelve (12) Month Period
Solicitation No. RFB-HPD-1150235
Friday, January 26, 2018 2:00 PM HST

Opened by: ST/FS

Dooley
Enterprises, Harper Distribution
Item No. Estimated Units Unit Price Inc. Unit Price Group, LLC Unit Price Security Equipment Corp

1 30,000 |$ 045 $ 1350000 $ 0.72 % 21,600.00| $ 048 $ 14,400.00
Make & Model No. | Winchester, RA1200HD | Flocchi, 9 pellets Federal Cartridge, F127 00

2 50,000 | No Bid No Bid $ 050 $ 25,000.00| $ 094 % 47,000.00
Make & Model No. Sellier & Bellot, 55 grain Federal Cartridge, LE223T1

3 250,000 |$ 031 $ 76,750.00( $ 042 % 105,00000( $ 034 $ 85,000.00
Make & Model No. | Winchester, Q3131 Flocchi, 55 grain Federal Cartridge, AE223

4 200,000 [$ 0.18 $ 3540000 $ 0.28 $ 56,000.00| $ 0.20 $ 40,000.00
Make & Model No. | Winchester, USA9mm Aguila, 115 grain Federal Cartridge, AE9AP

5 30,000 |$ 048 $ 14,460.00( $ 173 % 51,900.00| $ 050 $ 15,000.00
Make & Model No. | Winchester, X12R515 Remington, 1 oz. Federal Cartridge, F127RS

6 2000(%$ 022 % 44800 $ 033 % 660.00| $ 035 $ 700.00
Make & Model No. | Winchester, TRGTL129 | Winchester Super Target, 8 shot Federal Cartridge, GMT115

7 2,000 | No Bid No Bid $ 200 $ 4,000.00| $ 590 $ 11,800.00
Make & Model No. Emac, Green Bag Combined Systems, 2581

8 150,000 |$ 031 $ 46,65000( $ 032 $ 48,000.00| $ 033 $ 49,500.00
Make & Model No. | Winchester, RA9BA Speer, 53618

9 60,000 | $ 032 $ 19,260.00 $ 042 $ 25,200.00| $ 0.40 $ 24,000.00
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Winchester, RA40BA

$ 021 $ 16,400.00
Winchester, USA405W

$ 036 $ 1,780.00
Winchester, X3851P

$ 039 $ 15,600.00
Winchester, RAQ45B

$ 025 $ 10,080.00
Winchester, Q4170

$ 1.04 $ 31,260.00
Winchester, RA1200SF

$ 135 $ 54,000.00
Winchester, RA12R55F

No Bid No Bid

$ 0.35 $246,400.00
Winchester, RA95F

$ 042 $ 20,850.00
Winchester, RA40SF

No Bid No Bid

$ 059 $ 58,800.00
Winchester, RA2235F

Sig Sauer V Crown, 165 grain

$ 041 $ 32,800.00
Fiocchi, 180 grain
$ 052 % 2,600.00

Mag Tech, 125 grain

$ 039 % 15,600.00
Sig Sauer V Crown, 200 grain

$ 038 $ 15,200.00
Sellier and Bellot, 230 grain

$ 106 $ 31,800.00
RWS Copper Matrix, 8 pellet

$ 206 $ 82,400.00
RWS Copper Matrix, 78 ounce

$ 222 % 4,440.00
Federal Gold Medal, 168 grain

$ 052 % 364,000.00
RWS Copper Matrix, 85 grain

$ 057 % 28,500.00
RWS Copper Matrix, 115 grain

$ 055 % 5,500.00
RWS Copper Matrix, 100 grain

$ 076 $
Winchester, 45 grain

76,000.00

Speer, 53970

$ 023 % 18,400.00
Speer, 53955

$ 035 % 1,750.00
Federal Cartridge, AE38B

$ 039 % 15,600.00
Federal Cartridge, P445HST2/P45HST2

$ 030 $ 12,000.00
Federal Cartridge, AE45A

$ 085 $ 25,500.00
Ruag Ammotec USA, CM0O0

$ 100 $ 40,000.00
Ruag Ammotec USA, CMSLUG

$ 170 $ 3,400.00
International Cartridge, 308-125CTNT

$ 040 $ 280,000.00
Federal Cartridge, BCONT3

$ 044 % 22,000.00
Federal Cartridge, BC40CT1

$ 049 % 4,900.00
Ruag Ammotech USA, CM38

$ 070 % 70,000.00

Federal Cartridge, BC223NTA
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$ 084 $ 16,780.00
Winchester, 5308M

$ 052 $ 10,380.00
Winchester, RA455F

$ 118 $ 23,600.00
Federal Gold Medal, 168 grain

$ 064 $ 12,800.00
RWS Copper Matrix, 135 grain

$ 081 $
Federal Cartridge, GM308M

$ 059 %
Federal Cartridge, BC45CT1

16,200.00

11,800.00




