Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-ENV-1037608
Project: Furnish and Deliver Various Pumps

Bid Opening: April 20, 2017

Engineered Systems, Inc. Hawaii Engineering Services, Inc.
Item . . . Manufacturer/ . . Manufacturer/
Group No. Description QTY | UOM | Unit Price Total Price QTY | UOM Unit Price Total Price
No. Model Model
1 1 Stage Pumps 3 EA | $65,071.20 [ § 195,213.60 || Cascade /36P 3 EA NO BID NO BID
44 HP Dry-Pit
Submersible Pumps Xylem Flygt /
2 1 3 EA NO BID NO BID 3 EA 68,205.51 204,616.53
(12 inch inlet) ? ? NZ3202.820
(Lualualei)
44 HP Dry-Pit
Submersible Pumps Xylem Flygt /
2 2 2 EA NO BID NO BID 2 EA 71,781.51 143,563.02
(10 inch inlet) (Ewa ? ? NZ3202.820
Gentry)
30 HP Dry-Pit Xylem Flygt /
2 3 | SsubmersiblePumps | 2 | EA NO BID NO BID 2 | EA | ¢ 4814838 96,296.76 | "M Ve
. NZ3171.820
(Punawai)
34 HP Dry-Pit Xylem Flygt /
2 4 | submersiblePump | 1 | EA NO BID NO BID 1 | EA |$ 61,292.95|¢ 61,202.95] "VEMTVE
NZ3171.185
(West Beach #1)
GROUP 1-TOTALPRICE=| $ 195,213.60 GROUP 1 - TOTAL PRICE = NO BID
GROUP 2 - TOTAL SUM BID PRICE = NO BID GROUP 2 - TOTAL SUM BID PRICE =| $ 505,769.26

All bids are subject to evaluation.
*NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results on the date of bid opening.




