CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DPR-1012533
Urban Forestry Services

BID RESULTS

2:00 p.m. HST on January 27, 2017
Opened by TW/SK



DISTRICT |

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning
Large Tree Removal
Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Island Lanscaping

Alatini Landscape, | Imua Landscaping| Hawaii Fill Tech B.L. Creations, [and Maintenance,
Inc. Co. Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc.
S 109.95( $ 300.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 300.00 No Bid
S 89.01( S 120.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 200.00 No Bid
S 4712 S 90.00 | $ 125.00 | S 100.00 No Bid
S 68.06 $ 60.00 | $ 100.00 | S 100.00 No Bid
S 392.67(S 350.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 35.00 No Bid
S 523.56( S 600.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 45.00 No Bid
S 392.67(S 380.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 35.00 No Bid
S 261.78| S 290.00 | S 25.00 | $§ 25.00 No Bid
No Bid| $ 16,000.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 2,800.00
No Bid| $ 12,000.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 2,100.00
No Bid| $ 7,500.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 1,500.00
No Bid| $ 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




DISTRICT |

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning
Large Tree Removal
Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Green Thumb LPN Landscaping Trees of Hawaii, H.T.M.
Incorporated & Tree Service LLC| Harlan T. Langi Inc. Contractors, Inc.
No Bid| $ 175.00 | S 80.00 No Bid| $ 75.00
No Bid| $ 100.00 | $ 55.00 No Bid| $ 65.00
No Bid| $ 80.00 | S 40.00 No Bid| $ 25.00
No Bid| $ 65.00 | S 45.00 No Bid| $ 34.50
No Bid| $ 375.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 375.00 | $ 150.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 250.00 | $ 130.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 250.00 | $ 100.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
6,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 9,000.00
5,500.00 | $ 500.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 7,000.00
3,650.00 | $ 350.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 5,000.00
No Bid| $ 7.00 | $ 20.00 No Bid| $ 3,000.00




DISTRICT |

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning
Large Tree Removal
Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Smalt & Company,

Tahitan Tree

Inc. Service, Inc. Royal Palm Group
S 104.97 | S 110.00 No Bid
S 6497 | S 72.00 No Bid
S 4497 | $ 45.00 No Bid
S 3691 | S 72.00 No Bid
S 497.00 | $ 165.00 No Bid
S 1,200.00 | S 165.00 No Bid
S 850.00 | $ 148.00 No Bid
S 250.00 | $ 145.00 No Bid
S 1,050.00 No Bid No Bid
S 800.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
S 600.00 No Bid| $ 200.00
S 125.97 No Bid| $ 75.00




DISTRICT Il

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning
Large Tree Removal
Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Alatini Landscape,

Imua Landscaping

Hawaii Fill Tech

B.L. Creations,

Island Lanscaping
and Maintenance,

Inc. Co. Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc.
S 99.48| S 270.00 | $ 350.00 | S 300.00 No Bid
S 68.06( $ 100.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 200.00 No Bid
S 36.65( S 80.00 | S 125.00 | S 100.00 No Bid
S 68.06| S 58.00 | S 100.00 | S 100.00 No Bid
S 392.67| S 350.00 | $ 30.00 | $§ 35.00 No Bid
S 523.56( S 500.00 | $ 45.00 | S 45.00 No Bid
S 392.67| S 300.00 | $ 40.00 | S 35.00 No Bid
S 261.78( S 280.00 | S 25.00 | $§ 25.00 No Bid
No Bid| $ 16,000.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 2,800.00
No Bid| $ 12,000.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 2,100.00
No Bid| $ 7,500.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 1,500.00
No Bid| $ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




DISTRICT Il

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning
Large Tree Removal
Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Green Thumb

LPN Landscaping

Trees of Hawaii,

H.T.M.

Incorporated & Tree Service LLC| Harlan T. Langi Inc. Contractors, Inc.
No Bid| $ 150.00 | S 75.00 | S 225.00 | $ 75.00
No Bid| $ 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 65.00
No Bid| $ 80.00 | S 40.00 | $ 65.00 | S 25.00
No Bid| $ 65.00 | S 35.00 No Bid| $ 42.50
No Bid| $ 375.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 375.00 | $ 130.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 250.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 250.00 | $ 100.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
6,400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 9,000.00
5,900.00 | $ 350.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 7,000.00
3,900.00 | $ 7.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 5,000.00

No Bid S 15.00 No Bid| $ 3,000.00




DISTRICT Il

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning
Large Tree Removal
Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Smalt & Company,

Tahitan Tree

Inc. Service, Inc. Royal Palm Group
S 94.97 | S 110.00 No Bid
S 4497 | S 72.00 No Bid
S 2497 | S 47.00 No Bid
S 4091 | S 72.00 No Bid
S 397.00 | $ 165.00 No Bid
S 900.00 | $ 165.00 No Bid
S 650.00 | $ 148.00 No Bid
S 150.00 | S 145.00 No Bid
S 8,500.00 No Bid No Bid
S 600.00 No Bid| $ 300.00
S 400.00 No Bid| $ 150.00
S 105.97 No Bid| $ 50.00




DISTRICT Il

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning

A Large Tree Removal

Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Island Lanscaping

Alatini Landscape, | Imua Landscaping| Hawaii Fill Tech B.L. Creations, [and Maintenance,
Inc. Co. Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc.
S 99.48( S 280.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 300.00 No Bid
S 68.06| $ 110.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 200.00 No Bid
S 41.88( S 80.00 | $ 125.00 | S 100.00 No Bid
S 68.06 $ 60.00 | $ 100.00 | S 100.00 No Bid
S 392.67(S 350.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 35.00 No Bid
S 523.56( S 550.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 45.00 No Bid
S 392.67|S 320.00 | S 40.00 | S 35.00 No Bid
S 261.78| S 290.00 | S 25.00 | $ 25.00 No Bid
No Bid| $ 16,000.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 2,800.00
No Bid| $ 12,000.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 2,100.00
No Bid| $ 7,500.00 No Bid No Bid| $ 1,500.00
No Bid| $ 26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




DISTRICT Il

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning

A Large Tree Removal

Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Green Thumb LPN Landscaping Trees of Hawaii, H.T.M.
Incorporated & Tree Service LLC| Harlan T. Langi Inc. Contractors, Inc.
No Bid| $ 150.00 | S 75.00 No Bid| $ 75.00
No Bid| $ 100.00 | $ 50.00 No Bid| $ 65.00
No Bid| $ 80.00 | S 40.00 No Bid| $ 25.00
No Bid| $ 65.00 | S 35.00 No Bid| $ 42.50
No Bid| $ 375.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 375.00 | $ 130.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 250.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
No Bid| $ 250.00 | $ 100.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
S 6,400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 9,000.00
S 5,900.00 | $ 500.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 7,000.00
S 3,900.00 | $ 350.00 | No Bid No Bid| $ 5,000.00
No Bid| $ 7.00 | $ 15.00 No Bid| $ 3,000.00




DISTRICT Il

Description
Large Tree Pruning
Medium Tree Pruning
Small Tree Pruning
Royal and Coconut Palm
Trimming
Specialty Tree Pruning

A Large Tree Removal

Medium Tree Removal

Small Tree/Shrub
Removal/Brush Clearing
Large Tree Planting
Medium Tree Planting
Small Tree Planting
Tree Maintenance
Services

Unit
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree

Per Tree
Per Hour
Per Hour
Per Hour

Per Hour
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Tree
Per Day

Smalt & Company,

Tahitan Tree

Inc. Service, Inc. Royal Palm Group
S 100.97 | S 88.00 No Bid
S 5497 S 67.00 No Bid
S 3497 | S 37.00 No Bid
S 4091 | S 72.00 No Bid
S 457.00 | $ 165.00 No Bid
S 1,000.00 | S 165.00 No Bid
S 750.00 | $ 148.00 No Bid
S 200.00 | $ 145.00 No Bid
$ 950.00 No Bid No Bid
S 700.00 No Bid| $ 350.00
S 500.00 No Bid| $ 200.00
S 115.97 No Bid| $ 75.00




