
Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-ENV-993507
Project: Furnish and Deliver Water Treatment Chemicals

Bid Opening: July 22, 2016

Sierra Chemical Co.

Item

No.
Description

Unit

Price
x

EST

QTY
UOM = Total Price Manufacturer Model

Packaging

Size

State of Hawaii

Registration

No.

Total Price

1
Calcium Hypochlorite, 85 to

100 lbs. per drum
$1.86 x 12,500 Lbs. = $23,250.00

Axiall

Corporation
Americhlor

100 lbs. per

drum
8991-12 No Bid

2

Sodium Hypochlorite, 53

gallon sealed drum, or

approved substitute drum

size

$185.71 x 3,640 Drums = $675,984.40 BEI Hawaii
Hypochlor

NaOC1

53 gallons

per drum
9430-87 No Bid

3
Sodium Hypochlorite, 250 to

330 gallon sealed totes
$3.12 x 47,850 Gallons = $149,292.00 BEI Hawaii

Hypochlor

NaOC1

330 gallon

tote
9430-87 No Bid

4

Sodium Hypochlorite, 15

gallon carboy, or approved

substitute carboy size

$74.30 x 1,895 Carboys = $140,798.50 BEI Hawaii
Hypochlor

NaOC1

15 galllon

carboys
9430-87 No Bid

5

Calcium Chloride, 50 lb.

bags, or approved substitute

bag size

$27.50 x 620 Bags = $17,050.00
Vitro Industria

del Alcali

94% Mini Prill

Calcium

Chloride

50 lbs. per

bag
N/A No Bid

6

Muriatic Acid, 1 gallon

plastic container, or

approved substitute

container size

$10.87 x 150 Containers = $1,630.50 HASA Muriatic Acid 1 gallon jug N/A No Bid

7
Cyanuric Acid, 40 lb. pails, or

approved substitute pail size
$98.10 x 80 Pails = $7,848.00 HASA

Pool

Conditioner
40 lb. pail N/A No Bid

8

Algae Prevention &

Remover, 1 gallon container,

or approved substitute

container size

$67.94 x 150 Containers = $10,191.00 Halosource Inc.

Sea Klear 90

Day Algae

Prevention

and Remover

1 gallon

container
N/A No Bid

All bids are subject to evaluation.

Phoenix V LLC dba BEI Hawaii


