Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-ENV-939006
Project: Furnish and Deliver Replacement Parts for the Trojan UV4000 Plus Ultraviolet Disinfection System

Bid Qpening: September 13, 2016

Hawaii Engineering Services, Inc. First Light Technologies, Inc. Pacific Isle Industrial Supply, LLC
Part E p Uni EST M
I:‘e: Description Unit Price |x ;?_: UOM|=| Total Price Manufacturer Nu:'lber Condition |] Unit Price |x Qs,:,: = Total Price Manufacturer Nu:1rl:er Condition Pr'i:::a ary =[ Total Price a:r::'-act Model | Condition
Lamp Assembly, Troian Trojan
1 Packaged, 28 ) 616.91 |x| 8,000 | EACH || $4,935,280.00 ) ! 441169- New x| 8,000 |= 8,000 |4 No Bid New
Technologles
Inches 028
Lamp Plug Trofan Trojan
2 Assembly, 14GA 5 171,73 |x| 200 |EACH|§ $34,346.00 / . 441055- New x| 200 |= 200 |+ No Bid New
Technologies
20 Feet 00s
Sleeve, Packaged Trojan Trojan First Light
3 ! ged. S 550.01 |x| 5,000 | EACH | $2,795,050.00 ) . 441143- New $ 200,00 x| 5,000 |=[ $1,000,000.00 || Technologies, | QZ220 New 5,000 |5 No Bid New
28 Inches Technologies
028 Inc.
Ballast, Trojan Trojan R
4 ,660.47 500 |EACH|=| $830,235.00 R N 500 |= 500 | No Bid N
Replacement Kit > 166 X ¢ > Technologies | 490291 oW X o ew
Cover Assembly, Trojan Trojan .
5 ! 3,545.29 12 | EACH!H ,543.48 i x| 12 |- 12 |4 No Bid N
LG MDL 5 35 * #42,5 Technologies | 418187 | N °H ew
Screw, Captive 1/4 Trojan Trojan .
] 8.22 1,000 H || 8,220.00 R N 1,000 |= 1,000 (< No B N
20X 72Float | ° ! EAC »8.2 Technologies | 013132 ew X o Bid ew
Board, MCB 24PT ‘ Trojan Trojan .
7 154, 36 ACH 15 75. N 36 |9 3 = NoB
JAVAC $ 3,154.87 |x E $113,575.32 Technologies | 912493 ew X 6 o Bid New
Board, CCP 7PT Trojan Trojan R
01.4 ACH |7 . = 12 |5
8 18VAC $ 400146 |x| 12 |E 548,017.52 Technologies | 912395 New x| 12 No Bid New
Harness, Wirin : Trojan Trojan
9 WIRNE & 6 " 4016 |x| 12 [EACH|  $481.92 130 1 912274- | New x| 12 |= 12 |[{ Nosid New
18 Inch Technologies
018
Harness, Wirin Trojan Trojan
10 ness, WINg: | ¢ 4162 |x| 12 |EACH|{ $499.44 BN 912274 | New x| 12 |= 12 |4 NoBid New
24 Inch Technologies
024
" . Trojan
1q | Harmess,Wiring, | « 44 oo I 12 |EAcH|d|  $499.44 Troan | 915074 | New x| 12 |= 12 |4 Noeid New
30 Inch Technologies
030
Harness, Wiri Trojan Trojan
12 WINNE, |« 4362 |x| 12 [eacH|| $499.44 130 | 912274- | New x| 12 |= 12 |4 Nosid New
36 Inch Technologies
036
Harness, Wiri Troja Trojan
13 WINNE, |« 3596 |x| 12 [EACH| $429.12 BN | 912274- | New x| 12 | 12 |4 NoBid New
42 Inch Technologies 042




Trajan

1q | Harmess, Wiring, | o a6 bl 10 |eac|{  $s2152 Trofan | 919974 | New x| 12 | W 12 |{ Nosid New
48 Inch Technologies
048
Harnass, Wirin, Trofan Trojan
15 PWINNE: |« 4969 x| 12 [EACH|{ $596.28 01 912974- | New x| 12 |= x 12 |4 Nogid New
54 Inch Technologies
054
Harness, Wirin Trojan Trojan
16 PWIE, | s 8267 x| 12 [EACH|{  $992.04 180 1 912274- | New x| 12 |4 X 12 | Nogid New
80 Inch Technologies
060
Harness, Wirin, Trojan Trojan
17 WINE. | ¢ sggs |x| 12 [eacH|d  $706.20 130 1 912274 | New x| 12 |4 x 12 |4 NoBid New
69 Inch Technologies 069
Leg Isolator Trojan Trojan .
18 , 12 EACH = 4,447.56 N 12 |= 12 |4 No Bid N
Assembly 5 37083 x 5 Technologies | 442157 i X * 0P aw
Nut, Mounting Trojan Trojan .
19 18.53 100 | EA = 1,853.00 N 100 |= 100 |4 No Bid New
Cylinder > * cH ? Technologies | 442044 ew X * 1
Trojan Trojan .
" . 1 =| 10,393.00 . N = 100 |4 No Bid N
20 Nut, Sleeve $ 10393 |x| 100 |EACH s Technologies | 442048 ew x| 100 X o Bi ew
21 Cylinder $ 4,907.59 |x| 100 |EAcH|{ $490,759.00 Trojan Trolan | pew x| 100 |- ¥ 100 |4 NoBid New
Assembly, Low%T e e Technologies | 442652
Desiccant, Trojan Trojan
22 | Humidsorb HXC | & 25.24 |x| 100 |EACH|=| $2,524.00 / . ! New x| 100 = x| 100 | NoBid New
Technologies | 901206
4X4
Wiper Assembly, Trojan Trojan .
. E . ,000 |+ , = N N
23 with Mixer Low%T $ 2,655.60 |x| 1,000 | EACH |+ $2,655,600.00 Technologies | 445049 New x| 1,00 % 1,000 o Bid ew
Wiper Yoke, Mach Trojan Trojan ’
452.83 H|= 45,283.00 N = 100 (4 No Bid N
24 50 s ] x| 100 |EAC S Technologies | 445052 ew x| 100 X o Bi ew
g5 | Seal-WiperGen | o o441 1 10,000| EacH|d| $547,100.00 Trojan Trojan | pew x| 10,000 |= $29.40 |x] 10,000 < $294,000.00|| Vanseal |vAss0944| New
3T Technologies | 445045
26 | BeArnE Wiper | o 5235 || 10,000| EACH|<| $283,200.00 Trojan Trojan | pow x| 10,000|= $15.20 |x| 10,000/ $152,000.00|| Vanseal | vA40631 | New
Seal Technologies | 445032
Bearing, Wiper Trojan Trojan
27 2.77 5,000 = $313, R 5,000 |+ 12.32 5,000 {5 $61,600.00 Vi VA40633 N
seal MXR3.25 | ° 9277 [¥ EACH|s $313,850.00 || o 1 ologies | 445085 | MoV X 5,000 3 X 3 anseal ew
Bearing, Wiper Trojan Trojan
28 70. 5,00 =] 50,500.00 N 50 = 12.32 5,000 |= 1,600.00 V. | | VA40B632 N
seal MXR335 | °  70-10|x| 5,000 | EACH|5 $350, Tachmologies | 445085 ew x| 5,000 $ X $61,6 ansea ew
Ring, Retaining SQ Trojan Trojan .
29 . 300 |EACH|4 12.00 300 §= 300 |= No Bid N
Wiper > 3.04 [x 5912.0 Technologies | 445035 New X X oS! oW
Mixer, Head Trojan Trojan .
30 . EACH |5 " . 850 |= = No 8id N
LowsT S 52.77 || 850 $44,854.50 Technologies | 445050 New X x| 850 o Bi ew
Trojan Trojan ,
2. , Hl 6, K N 2,500 |= , E No Bid
31 Clip, Mixer Insert $ 72 1 2,500 | EAC »6,800.00 Technologies | 445059 W x| 23 x| 2300 o New
Pressure Injector, Trojan Trojan -
32 . 6 = 1 . 6 J= 6 |= Bid N
Gel $ 17293 |x EACH $1,037.58 Technologies | 445054 New X X No Bi ew




Cleaner, Acticlean Trojan Trojan .
K 1,00 E . = . =] No Bid
33 Gel WW S 256.86 ,000 | EACH $256,860.00 Technologies 901507 New x| 1,000 1,000 o Bi New
Anode, Sacrificial Trojan Trojan .
34 25.24 , = , .00 ! , = 1,000 |4 No B N
Hex 3.625 Inches ? 1,000 | EACH 325,240.0 Technologies | 418429 New x| 1,000 o Bid ew
g | Adapter Anode | o 4556 111 000 [eacH || $43,560.00 Trojan —f Trojan | ., x| 1,000 |= 1,000 |4 NoBid New
Hex Technologies | 418430
Pad, Guide- Trojan Trojan -
36 ! 158.38 EACH |= .28 = 6 |= No Bid N
UHMW 315 6 5950 Technologies | 418445 | "W x| S oF ew
g7 | FedhGuide 1o 40747 6 |EAcH|{ $1,003.02 Trojan Trojan | o | 8 | 6 |4 Nogid New
Rubber ’ e Technologies | 418447
Pad, Module Trojan Trojan .

38 ! 97.17 EACH |5 .02 N 6 |= 6 |5 No 8id N
Guide, UHMW | ° 6 5583 Technologies | 418449 e X os ew
. . Trojan

Winch Assembly, Trojan .
: EACH |= . - = = No Bid N
39 18004 120V $22,476.90 1 H $22,476.90 Technologies 4152834 New x| 1 1 o Bi ew
Pump, Cool Trojan Trojan
40 |3HP/460V/60MZ/3| § 2,655.81 1 |EAcH|{ $2,655.81 san ; New x| 1 |= 1 |4 Nosid New
Technologies | 444393
PH/F
Pump, Hydraulic Trojan Trojan ’ ,
1,844. =] 1,844, X 1 = 1 |5 Bid
41 | o11s/2301 60| ® LBAA0 (X 1 |EACHIR SLB44A0 || L nologies | 444012 | W X No B New
Filter Unit Trojan Trojan .
4 ! 930.68 1 = 930.68 N 1 |= 1 | No Bid N
2 Monarch Pump ? : EACH ? Technologies | 444259 oW X ' W
. Trojan
Valve, Hydraulic Trojan .
. = 1 . - 2 = =
43 BIR TDM 115 DIN $  612.67 2 EACH $1,225.34 Technologies 41195:;5 New X 2 No Bid New
Valve, Control, . Trojan Trojan .
44 ! 164.66 2 EACH|= 29.32 N 2 = 2 |4 No Bid N
Hydraulic > 53 Technologies | 418462 ew X ' oW
Valve, Rubber Trojan Trojan .
45 8.53 ,000 | EACH |= 68,240.00 X N 8,000 |= 8,000 |7 No Bid N
Wiper $ 8 3 Technologies | 445044 e X I ew
IC, Isolated Trojan Trojan )
4 ' 110.00 EACH |= , . = 16 |4 No Bid
& |Rs485/422 Maxim| * 16 $L760.00 || o pnologies | o12519 | oV x| 16 e New
Module, DGTL IN Trojan Trojan .

47 53.56 16 H | 856.96 . N 16 |5 16 |9 No Bid N
24V/5V Logic ? EAC ? Technologies | 903326 ew X l e
Module, DGTL Trojan Trojan

48 54.66 1 E. = .56 N 1 = 16 |4 No Bi N
out 12(?V/5V ] & ACH $874.5 Technologies | 903327 ew X 6 o Bid ew

Logic
Module, DGTL Trojan Trojan .
49 ! 47.33 EACH|= .28 N = 16 |= No Bid N
OUT 28V/5V Logic| 7 16 HIY 5757 Technologies | 903805 ew x| 18 o i
Module, Trojan Trojan .

50 63.09 EACH |- 1,009.44 16 |5 16 |4 No 8id

Input/Output ; 16 31,009 Technologies | 503452 New X oH New




Trojan

Trojan

> Sjﬂgllgi? 5 17089 |4 4 |EACH| 68356 || ropnotogies | gosooa | OV I Sl e
52 5°'”tcil'::n‘i:;’;ette $ 8691|x 4 |[EACH|] $347.64 Tec;:’i?:g_les ool | New 4 |- 4 |4 Nobid New
53 c”"elt(t)en'n%:a”z $ 24785(x] 6 |EACH|{ $1,487.10 Tec;:’c"f:gies ;5;”22"2 New 6 |= 6 || Nogid New
54 | Xit-Seal Module | o o7y gg tl 12 |EACH|{ $8,062.56 frojan 41;0;32- New 12 |= 12 |4 NoBid New
Cover Technologies 001
55 Ri”g'csvrl‘;"d';‘"pe’ $ 1403 |y 200 [EacH|d $2,806.00 Tec;r:g?;gies :;;f)TS New 200 |- 200 | NoBid New
56 | PUmPS ":"d”'e $ 97.54|x 6 |EACH|{ $585.24 Tec;:'i?:gies ;;g”s New 6 |- 6 |4 Nosid New
57 | Corrosien inhibitor > 49.58 50 |EACH[ 5247900 Tec-I:::iT;gies ngggns New 50 |S 50 | NoBid New

All bids are subject to evaluation.




