
Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-DTS-926513
Project: Furnish and Deliver Traffic Signals for a Twelve (12) Month Period
Bid Opening: 2/4/2016

Item

No.
no.

Qty Unit Price Total Qty Unit Price Total
1. 30 $14,732.00 $441,960.00 30 $13,910.00 $417,300.00

2. 10 $4,029.00 $40,290.00 10 no bid

3. 300 $22.17 $6,651.00 300 $14.82 $4,446.00

4. 300 $25.58 $7,674.00 300 $28.86 $8,658.00

5. 300 $28.54 $8,562.00 300 $16.51 $4,953.00

6. 300 $121.70 $36,510.00 300 $120.15 $36,045.00

7. 50 $202.79 $10,139.50 50 $163.20 $8,160.00

8. 100 $130.82 $13,082.00 100 $95.20 $9,520.00

9 25 $1,620.00 $40,500.00 25 no bid

10 100 $37.09 $3,709.00 100 $45.00 $4,500.00

11 10 $39.22 $392.20 10 $48.10 $481.00

12 100 $39.22 $3,922.00 100 $45.63 $4,563.00

13 200 $20.07 4,014.00$ 200 $20.40 $4,080.00

14 50 $306.97 $15,348.50 50 $291.20 $14,560.00

15 100 $4.26 $426.00 100 $5.25 $525.00

16 300 $147.00 $44,100.00 300 $145.90 $43,770.00

17 100 $369.34 $36,934.00 100 $377.00 $37,700.00

18 100 $56.28 $5,628.00 100 $84.00 $8,400.00

19 10 $68.21 $682.10 10 $84.00 $840.00

20 100 $86.97 $8,697.00 100 $87.50 $8,750.00

21 50 $291.00 $14,550.00 50 no bid

22 50 $38.32 $1,916.00 50 $33.60 $1,680.00

23 50 $25.27 $1,263.50 50 $22.40 $1,120.00

24 20 $1,860.00 $37,200.00 20 $1,472.00 $29,440.00

Phoenix Pacific, Inc.

Khaliq N. Sha dba

Shah and Associates



25 100 $74.00 $7,400.00 100 $84.00 $8,400.00

26 no bid no bid

27 100 $30.00 $3,000.00 100 $30.40 $3,040.00

28 5 $1,551.00 $7,755.00 5 no bid

29 25 $141.20 $3,530.00 25 $139.46 $3,486.50

30 5 $149.33 746.65 5 $154.00 $770.00

31 10 $209.76 $2,097.60 10 $212.00 $2,120.00

32 2 $3,178.00 $6,356.00 2 $3,650.00 $7,300.00

33 3 $388.00 $1,164.00 3 $490.00 $1,470.00

34 3 $514.00 $1,542.00 3 $585.00 $1,755.00

35 100 $429.00 $42,900.00 100 $478.50 $47,850.00

36 5 $1,996.00 $9,980.00 5 no bid

37 2 $1,996.00 $3,992.00 2 no bid

38 15 $331.00 $4,965.00 15 $320.45 $4,806.75

39 3 $2,469.00 $7,407.00 3 no bid


