RFB-DFM-926105
Furnish and Deliver Passenger Vehicles
Bid Opening: 2/12/16

Cutter Ford, Inc.

Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

Item No. |Alternative No. [Units [Unit Cost Bid City MPG |Cost of Fuel |Total Fuel Cost |Total Evaluated Bid Item No. |Alternative No. [Unit Cost Bid City MPG |Cost of Fuel |Total Fuel Cost |Total Evaluated Bid
1 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 2[ $ 28,430.81 | $56,861.62 22 $2.13 $5,809.09 $68,479.80 6] $ 28,497.00 | $ 56,994.00 26 $2.13 $4,915.38 $66,824.77
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
2 1 No Bid 2 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 1] $ 27,589.97 | $ 27,589.97 22 $2.13 $5,809.09 $33,399.06 6[ $27,997.00 | § 27,997.00 26 $2.13 $4,915.38 $32,912.38
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
3 1 No Bid 3 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 2( $24,381.33 | $ 48,762.66 22 $2.13|$ 5,809.09 $60,380.84 6[ $23,997.00 | § 47,994.00 26 $2.13 $4,915.38 $57,824.77
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
4 1 No Bid 4 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $ 34,546.00 | $ 34,546.00 13 $2.13|$ 9,830.77 $44,376.77 3| $48,997.00 | § 48,997.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $59,647.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
5 1 No Bid 5 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 2( $31,232.64 | $62,465.28 13 $2.13|$ 9,830.77 $82,126.82 3[ $44,997.00 | $ 89,994.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $111,294.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
6 1 No Bid 6 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $ 40,305.93 | $40,305.93 13 $2.13|$ 9,830.77 $50,136.70 3| $45,797.00 | § 45,797.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $56,447.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
7 1 No Bid 7 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $ 27,201.57 | $27,201.57 15 $2.13|$ 8,520.00 $35,721.57 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
8 1 No Bid 8 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $ 27,201.57 | $27,201.57 15 $2.13|$ 8,520.00 $35,721.57 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
9 1 No Bid 9 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $35,241.20 | $35,241.20 10 $2.13|$ 12,780.00 $48,021.20 3| $33,747.00 | § 33,747.00 11 $2.13 $11,618.18 $45,365.18
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
10 1 No Bid 10 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
11 1 No Bid 11 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid




5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
12 1 No Bid 12 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 3[$27,778.37 | $83,335.11 13 $2.13 9,830.77 $112,827.42 3| $28,447.00 | $ 85,341.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $117,291.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
13 1 No Bid 13 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 2{ $36,215.70 | $72,431.40 11 $2.13 11,618.18 $95,667.76 3[ $34,447.00 | $ 68,894.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $90,194.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
14 1 No Bid 14 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 6[ $ 31,003.66 | $186,021.96 11 $2.13 11,618.18 $255,731.05 3| $ 28,997.00 | $ 173,982.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $237,882.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
15 1 No Bid 15 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $ 29,255.86 | $29,255.86 13 $2.13 9,830.77 $39,086.63 3| $30,597.00 | $ 30,597.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $41,247.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
16 1 No Bid 16 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 3[ $ 38,807.69 | $116,423.07 13 $2.13 9,830.77 $145,915.38 3| $ 35,997.00 | $ 107,991.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $139,941.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
17 1 No Bid 17 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 2{ $39,521.45 | $79,042.90 12 $2.13 10,650.00 $100,342.90 3[ $39,247.00 | $ 78,494.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $99,794.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid
Item No. |Alternative No. Item No. |Alternative No.
18 1 No Bid 18 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 1] $38,721.82 | $38,721.82 11 $2.13 11,618.18 $50,340.00 3[ $39,997.00 | § 39,997.00 12 $2.13 $10,650.00 $50,647.00
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid




