
Solicitation: RFB-DFM-921505

Description: Furnish and Deliver Various Work Vehicles

Bid Opening: 4/13/2016

Item # Description Quantity Unit Price Total Price

1

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Pick Up Truck With Standard Cab, 2WD,

SRW, Tool Box and Roof Beacon 2 33,199.06$ 66,398.12$

2

8,600 – 10,000 Lbs. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, 2WD, SRW,

Material Rack and Roof Beacon 1 34,105.32$ 34,105.32$

3

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, Tool Box, Lift

Gate, 2WD, SRW, and Roof Beacon 1 34,049.07$ 34,049.07$

4

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, 2WD, Utility

Body, Auxiliary Lighting, 2 Way Radio and Material Rack 2 47,199.11$ 94,398.22$

5

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, Service Body,

Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW, Material Rack and Roof Beacon 1 45,400.15$ 45,400.15$

6

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, Service Body,

Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW, Material Rack and Roof Beacon 1 45,400.15$ 45,400.15$

7

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, 98” Service

Body, 2WD, SRW, Material Rack, Auxiliary Lighting and 2-Way

Radio 1 47,199.11$ 47,199.11$

8

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Crew Cab (4-Door), 2WD,

Auxiliary Lighting, Stake Sides and 2-Way Radio 1 No Bid No Bid

9

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Crew Cab (4-Door), 2WD,

Auxiliary Lighting, Liftgate and 2-Way Radio 1 44,820.98$ 44,820.98$

10

8,600 – 10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Crew Cab (4-Door), 2WD,

Roof Beacon, Liftgate and Toolbox 1 39,692.84$ 39,692.84$

11

10,000 Lb. GVWR Cab and Chassis With Standard Cab, 2WD, SRW,

2-Way Radio, Lift Gate, Material Rack and Auxiliary Lighting 1 42,993.89$ 42,993.89$

12

10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW, 2-

Way Radio, Auxiliary Lighting, Lift Gate and Stake Sides 1 No Bid No Bid

13

10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW, 2-

Way Radio, Auxiliary Lighting and 50 Gallon Auxiliary Fuel Tank 1 43,105.35$ 43,105.35$

14

10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, 98” Low Profile Service

Body, Lift Gate, 4WD, SRW, 2-Way Radio, Material Rack and

Auxiliary Lighting 1 58,308.52$ 58,308.52$

15

10,000 Lb GVWR Truck With Standard Cab, 90 Gallon Auxiliary Fuel

Tank, Tool Box, Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW and Roof Beacon 1 37,690.75$ 37,690.75$

16

10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Extended Cab, Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW,

2-Way Radio, Auxiliary Lighting and Stake Sides 2 No Bid No Bid

17

10,000 Lb. GVWR Cab and Chassis With Extended Cab (4-Door),

4WD, SRW, Flatbed Dump Body With Stake Sides, Dual Function

Liftgate, Auxiliary Lighting and 2-Way Radio 1 No Bid No Bid

18

10,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Extended Cab, Lift Gate, 2WD, SRW,

2-Way Radio, Auxiliary Lighting and 50 Gallon Auxiliary Fuel Tank 1 44,886.60$ 44,886.60$

19

10,001 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis, Extended

Cab, 4WD With 108” Service Body and Auxiliary Lighting 1 62,610.62$ 62,610.62$

20

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis With

Standard Cab (2-Door), 108” Flatbed Body With Dump, Dual Action

Liftgate, Auxiliary Lighting, and 2WD. 2 No Bid No Bid

21

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis With

Standard Cab (2-Door), Flatbed Body With Dump, Dual Action

Liftgate, Auxiliary Lighting, 2-Way Radio and 2WD. 1 No Bid No Bid

22

13,400 Lb. – 16,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Std Cab (2-Door), 4WD,

108” Service Body, Combination Air Compressor/Arc Welder,

Auxiliary Lights and 2,000 Lb. Lift Capacity Crane 1 105,332.63$ 105,332.63$

23

13,400 Lb. – 16,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Std Cab (2-Door), 2WD,

108” Service Body, Combination Air Compressor/Arc Welder,

Auxiliary Lights and 2,000 Lb. Lift Capacity Crane 1 100,899.28$ 100,899.28$

24

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Cab and Chassis With Extended Cab,

2WD, 108” Flatbed Body, Extended Step Bumper and Tool Storage

Boxes 1 65,597.08$ 65,597.08$

25

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Cab and Chassis With Extended Cab,

2WD, 108” Flatbed Body, 2-Way Radio, Auxiliary Lighting and

Liftgate 2 67,534.59$ 135,069.18$

26

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis With

Extended Cab (4-Door), 108” Flatbed Body With Dump, Dual

Action Liftgate, 2-Way Radio, Auxiliary Lighting, and 4WD 1 No Bid No Bid

27

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis With Crew

Cab (4-Door), Combination Service/Dump Body, Auxiliary Lighting,

2-Way Radio and 2WD. 4 79,655.46$ 318,621.84$

28

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis With Crew

Cab (4-Door), Combination Service/Dump Body, Auxiliary Lighting,

2-Way Radio and 2WD. 5 79,655.46$ 398,277.30$

29

13,400 Lb. – 18,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis With Crew

Cab (4-Door), 108” Service Body, Auxiliary Lighting, 2-Way Radio

and Material Rack 1 83,412.77$ 83,412.77$

30

13,400 Lb. – 16,000 Lb. GVWR Truck With Crew Cab (4-Door),

2WD, 108” Service Body, Sliding Canopy With Lockable Rear

Enclosure 1 No Bid No Bid

Additive Option 1 Cab-Over Ladder Rack with Strobes and Directional Light Bar N/A N/A No Bid

Additive Option 2 2-Way Radio N/A N/A No Bid

Additive Option 3 Work/Area Floodlights N/A N/A No Bid

Inter Pacific Motors Inc. DBA Orchid

Isle Auto Center



Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

33,997.00$ 67,994.00$ 34,962.15$ 69,924.30$ 39,676.69$ 79,353.38$

34,747.00$ 34,747.00$ 38,233.18$ 38,233.18$ 43,035.85$ 43,035.85$

37,447.00$ 37,447.00$ 35,717.68$ 35,717.68$ 42,227.47$ 42,227.47$

48,497.00$ 96,994.00$ 51,326.49$ 102,652.98$ No Bid No Bid

45,997.00$ 45,997.00$ 48,555.70$ 48,555.70$ 54,725.89$ 54,725.89$

45,997.00$ 45,997.00$ 49,338.41$ 49,338.41$ 54,725.89$ 54,725.89$

48,477.00$ 48,477.00$ 46,852.33$ 46,852.33$ No Bid No Bid

43,997.00$ 43,997.00$ 45,486.89$ 45,486.89$ No Bid No Bid

45,997.00$ 45,997.00$ 45,069.09$ 45,069.09$ No Bid No Bid

41,977.00$ 41,977.00$ 41,897.36$ 41,897.36$ 42,996.06$ 42,996.06$

44,247.00$ 44,247.00$ 45,229.31$ 45,229.31$ No Bid No Bid

45,247.00$ 45,247.00$ 47,559.15$ 47,559.15$ No Bid No Bid

45,447.00$ 45,447.00$ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

53,747.00$ 53,747.00$ 51,286.15$ 51,286.15$ No Bid No Bid

39,947.00$ 39,947.00$ 38,802.86$ 38,802.86$ 43,959.41$ 43,959.41$

47,447.00$ 94,894.00$ 47,409.40$ 94,818.80$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 60,058.92$ 60,058.92$ No Bid No Bid

46,747.00$ 46,747.00$ 44,137.46$ 44,137.46$ No Bid No Bid

59,997.00$ 59,997.00$ 68,941.96$ 68,941.96$ 69,865.16$ 69,865.16$

No Bid No Bid 67,212.96$ 134,425.92$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 70,006.67$ 70,006.67$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 101,660.74$ 101,660.74$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 99,413.58$ 99,413.58$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 61,491.08$ 61,491.08$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 66,063.85$ 132,127.70$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 70,714.52$ 70,714.52$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 79,168.13$ 316,672.52$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 84,149.88$ 420,749.40$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 87,282.86$ 87,282.86$ No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 82,816.72$ 82,816.72$ No Bid No Bid

N/A No Bid N/A 4,842.93$ N/A No Bid

N/A No Bid N/A 5,026.18$ N/A No Bid

N/A No Bid N/A 1,884.82$ N/A No Bid

Rainbow Chevrolet Inc.

DBA Cutter Chevrolet Cutter Ford Inc. Honolulu Ford


