Bid Abstract

Solicitation No. RFB-DES-895907

Project: Furnish and Deliver Various Golf Course Mowers
Bid Opening: 3/31/2016

Item B. Hayman Co. (Hawaii) Hawthorne Pacific
No. Ltd. Corp. Pacific Golf & Turf LLC
no.

Qty Unit Price Total Qty  Unit Price Total Qty Unit Price Total
1. 1 $62,764.37 $62,764.37 1 $64,790.71 $64,790.71 1 $54,154.97 $54,154.97
2. 2 $48,115.16 $96,230.32 2 $53,823.37 $107,646.74 2 $45,250.34 $90,500.68
3. 1 $25,083.76 $25,083.76 1 No bid No bid 1 No bid No bid

4. 2 $21,916.22 $43,832.44 2 $30,531.57 $61,063.14 2 No bid No bid



