
Bid Abstract, Bid Opening November 4, 2016

RFB-DFM-851903

Furnish and Deliver Variouos Petroleum Products,

 for a twelve (12) month period. Aloha Petroleum, LLC Garlow Petroleum, Inc. Hawaii Truck Parts, Sales Hawaiian Isles Petroleum, Island Oil & Supply Co., NAPA Hawaii Parts Warehouse Pennzoil Distributors of
and Services, LLC LLC Inc. Distributors, Inc. Hawaii, Inc.

Item 

No.
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY

Unit of 

Measure Unit Price  Extended Price Unit Price  Extended Price Unit Price  Extended Price Unit Price  Extended Price Unit Price  Extended Price Unit Price  Extended Price Unit Price

 Extended 

Price Unit Price  Extended Price 

OIL, Motor, Single-Viscosity Grade, SAE 10. Must meet API Service Classification CF, 

SJ. TBN min 8.9, sulfated ash, wt.% maximum .99.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Citgo 600 10W No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Valvoline All Fleet Plus SAE No Bid No Bid

10 VV3909

1
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons, estimate 110 gallons, 2 drums.
2 Per Drum

625.09$        1,250.18$            X X X X X X X X 757.39$        1,514.78$            X X X X

2 Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) case per delivery.  Case holds 12 Quarts.2 Per Case X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X

OIL, Motor, Single-Viscosity Grade, API Service Classification SL, SAE 30.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 30W No Bid No Bid No Bid Valvoline All Fleet Plus 30W Valvoline All Fleet Plus SAE No Bid No Bid

30 VV3

3
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts.
26 Per Case

27.24$          708.24$               X X X X X X 39.06$          1,015.56$            X X X X X X

4
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in non-returnable 5-gal. pails. Minimum of one (1) 

pail per delivery. Pail hold 5 gallons.
2 Per Pail

40.33$          80.66$                X X X X X X 53.30$          106.60$               75.42$          150.84$               X X X X

5
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
2 Per Drum

432.16$        864.32$               X X X X X X 497.20$        994.40$               768.96$        1,537.92$            X X X X

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity Grade, SAE 5W-20, Fully Synthetic.  Must meet Ford Motor 

Company’s Specifications WSS-M2C945-A.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 5W20 SYN Chevron Havoline ProDS Full Petro-Canada America No Bid Valvoline Maxlife SYN 5W20 Valvoline Maxlife Motorcraft X05W20DFS Lubrigold Full Synthetic 5W-20

Synthetic 5W-20 Supreme Synthetic 5W20 809331 and X05W20QFS Coastal CTL405026

6
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
108 Per Drum

509.91$        55,070.28$          1,425.60$     153,964.80$       1,257.44$     135,803.52$          X X 768.35$        82,981.80$          883.28$        95,384.24$          744.36$        80,390.88$     490.68$        52,993.44$          

7
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 quarts..
2 Per Case

17.28$          34.56$                79.95$          159.90$              71.52$          143.04$                 X X 53.43$          106.86$               22.51$          45.02$                54.24$          108.48$          X X

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity Grade, SAE 5W-30 and 5W- 40.  Must meet API 

Classifications of "SG" and "SL" designations.  

SAE 5W-30  Synthetic, must meet Ford specification: WSS-M2C946-A.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 5W30 No Bid Petro-Canada America No Bid Valvoline Maxlife SYN 5W30 Valvoline Synpower Motorcraft X05W30DFS No Bid

Supreme Synthetic 5W30 691759 and X05W30QFS

8
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
2 Per Drum

495.51$        991.02$               X X 1,257.44$     2,514.88$              X X 768.35$        1,536.70$            1,081.05$     2,162.10$            744.36$        1,488.72$       X X

9 Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts.6 Per Case
16.97$          101.82$               X X 71.52$          429.12$                 X X 53.43$          320.58$               49.81$          298.86$               54.24$          325.44$          X X

SAE 5W-40  Synthetic, must meet Ford Specifications: WSS-M2C171-E.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Motor Craft X05W40DSP No Bid No Bid Total Rubia TIR 7900 Synthetic P66 Triton ECT Diesel 5W40 Valvoline Premium Blue Motorcraft X05W40DFS No Bid

NA SAE 5W-40 Extreme 5W40 #VV70516 and X05W40QFS

10 Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 500 gallons in bulk per delivery.  The Contractor shall fill the City's tank.2,000 Per Gallon 21.40$          42,800.00$          X X X X 14.06$          28,060.00$          15.04$          30,080.00$          X X X X X X

11
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
6 Per Drum

1,176.82$     7,060.92$            X X X X 771.73$        4,630.38$            827.20$        4,963.20$            1,195.10$     7,170.60$            935.11$        5,610.66$       X X

12
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts.
4 Per Case 40.85$          163.40$               X X X X X X 49.14$          196.56$               X X 74.76$          299.04$          X X

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity Grade, SAE 10W-30. Must meet  API Service Classification 

CE, CD/SG and Caterpillar TO-2 Fluid Specifications. 

SAE 10W-30

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 10W30 No Bid No Bid No Bid P66 Fleet Supreme EC 10W30 Valvoline Premium Blue No Bid No Bid

10W30 817317

13
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons..
2 Per Drum

501.27$        1,002.54$            X X X X X X 539.00$        1,078.00$            881.37$        1,762.74$            X X X X



SAE 15W-40,  OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity. Must meet API Service Classification CJ-4/SL; 

Cummins CES 20078, 20081. Super S Synthetic Blend is an acceptable substitution.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 15W40 SB Chevron Delo 400 LE Petro-Canada America Duron-E Mobil Fleet SAE 15W-40 P66 Fleet Supreme EC 15W40 Valvoline Premium Blue Motorcraft X015W40DSD No Bid

15W-40 15W40 VV70505 and X015W40QSD

14
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
80 Per Drum

429.28$        34,342.40$          724.35$        57,948.00$         884.81$        70,784.80$            382.41$        1,912.05$            431.20$        34,496.00$          867.15$        69,372.00$          489.46$        39,156.80$     X X

15 Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 500 gallons in bulk per delivery.  

Minimum of one (1) drum per delivery. 17,500 Per Gallon 6.86$            120,050.00$        13.17$          230,475.00$       16.09$          281,575.00$          6.95$            10,425.00$          7.21$            126,175.00$        X X X X X X

16 Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 330 gallons in bulk per delivery.  

Minimum of one (1) drum per delivery. Estimate 1 delivery and 330 gallons. 330 Per Gallon 6.86$            2,263.80$            13.17$          4,346.10$           16.09$          5,309.70$              6.95$            2,293.50$            7.21$            2,379.30$            X X X X X X

17
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts, estimate 312 Quarts, 26 case.
26 Per Case

32.12$          835.12$               49.47$          1,286.22$           55.32$          1,438.32$              X X 32.67$          849.42$               X X 33.12$          861.12$          X X

OIL, Motor, Grade 1, Multi-Viscosity SAE 15W-40.  Must meet API Service Classification 

CJ-4, CI-4, CH-4, CG-4, CF-4, CF, CE, CE/SL, SJ, SH; Caterpillar ECF-1; Cummins CES 

20078, 20077, 20076 & 20071; Mack EO-N Premium Plus, EO-M Plus, EO-M & EO-L 

Plus; Volvo VDS-3, VDS-2 & VDS; DDC/MTU Type 1 & 2; 10.0 min TBN; 1.4% or less 

sulfated ash. Super S Synthetic Blend is an acceptable substitution.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid P66 Fleet Supreme EC 15W40 All Fleet Plus 15W40 VV386 No Bid No Bid

18
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 5 gal. pails. Minimum of one (1) pail 

per delivery. Pail hold 5 gallons.
2 Per Pail

X X X X X X X X 49.55$          99.10$                71.37$          142.74$               X X X X

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity, SAE 15W-40.  Must meet API Service Classification CJ-4 or 

CI-4; Caterpillar ECF-1; Cummins CES 20078, 20077 & 20076; Mack EO-N Premium Plus 

3, EO-M Plus, MAN 271 & 3275; Detroit Diesel Types 1 and 2; Caterpillar TO-2 and 

Allison Transmission C-4 Fluid Specifications; 1.4% or less sulfated ash.  10.0-14.0 TBN 

rating.  Exxon XD3 Extra, Mobil 1300, Chevron Delo 400 or their equivalent. Super S 

Synthetic Blend is an acceptable substitution.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 15W40 SB No Bid Petro-Canada America Mobil Fleet SAE 15W-40 P66 Fleet Supreme EC 15W40 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Duron-E XL

19
Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 500 gal in bulk perdelivery. Contractor shall fill 

the City's tank.Each delivery shall be 500 gallon.
32,000 Per gallon

6.86$            219,520.00$        X X 17.78$          568,960.00$          6.95$            222,400.00$        7.21$            230,720.00$        X X X X X X

SAE 75W-90  Synthetic

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 75W90 No Bid No Bid No Bid Valvoline HD SYN Gear Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid

75W90

20 Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 400 pounds on a bulk per delivery.  The Contractor shall fill the City's tank.23,500 Per Pound 2.16$            50,760.00$          X X X X X X 3.16$            74,260.00$          X X X X X X

OIL, Transmission Gear, SAE 80-W-90  must meet API GL-4 and GL-5 and MT-1 

Designations.

Valvoline HD SYN Gear Oil 

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 80W90 No Bid Petro-Canada America Traxon No Bid 80W90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

21A
GL-4, Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of one 

(1) drum per delivery. Drum holds 120 pounds.
65 Per Drum

162.29$        10,548.85$          X X X X X X 157.21$        10,218.65$          X X X X X X

21B
GL-5, Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of one 

(1) drum per delivery. Drum holds 120 pounds.
65 Per Drum

162.29$        10,548.85$          X X 277.40$        18,031.00$            X X 157.21$        10,218.65$          X X X X X X

OIL, All synthetic gear oil, SAE 80W-140 API GL-5 Hypoid Gear Oil, must be in the oil 

Quality designation, either by itself or Combined with other designation such as API GL-5 

and MIL PRF-2105E.

Petro-Canada America Valvoline HD SYN Gear Oil Valvoline Heavy Duty Synthetic

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 80W140 No Bid Traxon Synthetic No Bid 80W140 80W-140 #VV70045 No Bid No Bid

22
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery.  Drum holds 55 gallons.
2 Per Drum

1,162.53$     2,325.06$            X X 1,939.44$     3,878.88$              X X 1,307.57$     2,615.14$            1,659.73$     3,319.46$            X X X X

OIL, Transmission Gear, SAE 85W-140 must meet API GL-4 and GL-5 and MT-1 

Designations.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S 80W140 Chevron Multigear EP-5 No Bid No Bid Valvoline HD SYN Gear Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid

85W-140 85W140

23A
GL-4, Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 400 Pounds in bulk per delivery.  

Contractor shall fill the City's tank. 
5,100 Per Pound

1.33$            6,783.00$            2.14$            10,914.00$         X X X X 1.81$            9,231.00$            X X X X X X

23B
GL-5, Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 400 Pounds in bulk per delivery.  

Contractor shall fill the City's tank. 
5,100 Per Pound

1.33$            6,783.00$            2.14$            10,914.00$         X X X X 1.81$            9,231.00$            X X X X X X

24
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 120 lb. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 120 lbs.
3 Per Drum

586.33$        1,758.99$            856.00$        2,568.00$           X X X X 223.11$        669.33$               X X X X X X



OIL, Hydraulic (high pressure and speed application), Grades ISO 22 and 68. Megaflow 

HVI Hydraulic Oil. Must meet service requirements of Abex-Denison for hydraulic fluids in 

severe duty applications in both piston and vane pumps, HF-0, HF-1 and HF-2.  Cincinnati 

Machine for P-68, P-69, P-70, and anti-wear hydraulics.  Vickers M-2950-S, for mobile 

hydraulics and 1-286-S for industrial hydraulics.  Sundstrand Hydrostatics and United 

States Steel 127 extra duty anti-wear hydraulic oil.

ISO 22:

Petro-Canada America 

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ No Bid No Bid Hydrex MV22 No Bid P66 Megaflow HVI 22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

25
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery.  Drum holds 55 gallons.
2 Per Drum

X X X X 965.94$        1,931.88$              X X 848.10$        1,696.20$            X X X X X X

26
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in non-returnable 5 gal. pails. Minimum of one (1) 

pail per delivery. Pail hold 5 gallons.
2 Per Pail

X X X X 94.06$          188.12$                 X X 79.20$          158.40$               X X X X X X

ISO 68:

Must meet service requirements of Abex-Denison for hydraulic fluids in severe duty 

applications for hydraulic fluids in severe duty applications in both piston and vane pumps,  

HF-0, HF-1 and HF-2.  Cincinnati Machine for P-68, P-69, P-70, and anti-wear hydraulics.  

Vickers M-2950-S, for mobile hydraulics and 1-286-S for industrial hydraulics.  Sundstrand 

Hydrostatics and United States Steel 127 extra duty anti-wear hydraulic oil.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S AW68 Chevron Rando HD 68 Petro-Canada America No Bid Valvoline AW 68 Valvoline AW 68 No Bid No Bid

Hydrex MV 68

27 Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 300 gals. in bulk per delivery.  Each delivery shall be 300 gal.11 Per Gallon 6.08$            66.88$                11.66$          128.26$              18.08$          198.88$                 X X 6.60$            72.60$                X X X X X X

28
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
12 Per Drum

377.45$        4,529.40$            641.30$        7,695.60$           1,056.69$     12,680.28$            X X 393.25$        4,719.00$            698.87$        8,386.44$            X X X X

29
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in non-returnable 5 gal. pails. Minimum of one (1) 

pail per delivery. Pail hold 5 gallons.
2 Per Pail

36.67$          73.34$                78.45$          156.90$              102.31$        204.62$                 X X 39.70$          79.40$                68.85$          137.70$               X X X X

OIL, Automatic Transmission, fluid specifications and meeting the latest performance 

requirements specified by Ford Mercon V. Requirements of Dextron VI, shall function as a 

universal transmission fluid.  Must meet the requirements of  to meet Ford and GM 

specifications.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S ATF MERCV No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Valvoline Maxlife ATF No Bid No Bid

VV326 & W3246

30
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons, estimate 550 gallons, 10 drums.
10 Per Drum

691.32$        6,913.20$            X X X X X X X X 973.34$        9,733.40$            X X X X

31
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of  one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts.
2 Per Case

46.09$          92.18$                X X X X X X X X 29.43$          58.86$                X X X X

OIL, Automatic Transmission, Type F, fluid specifications and meeting the latest 

performance requirements specified by Ford M2C-33F.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S ATF TYPE F No Bid No Bid No Bid P66 Type F ATF Valvoline Type F ATF 822 387 No Bid No Bid

32
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts.
2 Per Case

40.85$          81.70$                X X X X X X 31.50$          63.00$                24.05$          48.10$                X X X X

OIL, Automatic Transmission, MD-3.

Chevron Automatic 

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S ATF MD3 Transmission Fluid MD-3 No Bid No Bid P66 Super ATF Valvoline DEX MERC ATD No Bid No Bid

33
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in cases of 12 qt. containers. Minimum of one (1) 

case per delivery. Case holds 12 Quarts.
2 Per Case

27.24$          54.48$                45.53$          87.06$                X X X X 28.59$          57.18$                20.46$          40.92$                X X X X

34
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
2 Per Drum

432.16$        864.32$               747.45$        1,494.90$           X X X X 441.65$        833.30$               781.80$        1,563.60$            X X X X

OIL, Universal Tractor Fluid.  Formulated for use in transmissions, final drives and and 

hydraulic systems and shall meet the requirements of Allis Chalmers (Hydraulic 

Fluid PF821, Part No. 926371), Case (JIC 145-TCH Fluid, JIC 143-TFD Oil, JIC 185, MS-

1204, MS-1204, MSs 1207 and MSs 1210), John Deere (J14B, J14C, J20A-Hy-Gard), 

Ford (M2C41B, M2C53A, M2C86A and M2C134B), IHC (B-6 - Hy-Tran), 

Kubota (UDT Hydraulic/Transmission Fluid), Massey-Ferguson (M-1110, M-1127, M-

1129A-Permantron and M-1135), Sundstrand Hydrostatic Transmission and White Farm 

Equipment (Q-1722 and Q-1766-UHTF).

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S THF Chevron 1000 THF No Bid No Bid P66 Hydaulic Tractor Fluid Valvoline Unitrac No Bid No Bid

36
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums. Minimum of one (1) 

drum per delivery. Drum holds 55 gallons.
2 Per Drum

386.09$        772.18$               845.35$        1,690.70$           X X X X 443.30$        886.60$               721.12$        1,442.24$            X X X X

37
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in non-returnable 5 gal. pails. Minimum of one (1) 

pail per delivery. Pail hold 5 gallons.
2 Per Pail

36.15$          72.30$                82.10$          164.20$              X X X X 46.70$          93.40$                74.88$          149.76$               X X X X



OIL, Power Steering, meets service auto manufacturer's power steering requirements, be 

compatible and can be mixed with GM #1050017, Chrysler Spec 5931, Ford Spec 

M2C128 C & D, AMC Spec 4060 power steering fluids. Equal to Pyroil, Solder Seal M27-

13P or Car Quest 57000.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S Power Steer No Bid No Bid No Bid Valvoline Pyroil Power Valvoline Power Steering No Bid No Bid

Steering Fluid

38
Bid price shall be based on deliveries of twelve (12) 12 fluid oz..container per case. 

Minimum of one (1) case per delivery. Case holds 12/12 oz. (total of 144 oz.).
10 Per Case

12.36$          123.60$               X X X X X X 15.85$          158.50$               28.67$          286.70$               X X X X

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, Union Unoba EP2 Green NGLI 0 or 00, or Chevron Ultra-Duty 

Grease EP NLGI 0, or Chevron Dura-Lith Grease EP NGLI 0 or 00.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S MP Grease No Bid No Bid No Bid P66 UNOBA EP 00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

39
Bid price shall be based on deliveries in non-returnable 35 lb. pails.  Minimum of one (1) 

pail per delivery. Pail hold 35 lbs.
2 Per Pail

54.71$          109.42$               X X X X X X 75.25$          150.50$               X X X X X X

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, Red, lithium complex soap, base oil and fortified with additive, 

NLGI Grade 2, penetration @ 25°C ADTM worked - 325, texture -smooth; Timken OK 

load - 80 lbs.; dropping point - 271°C; viscosity index - 75; flashpoint 242 ºC V.I., Unocal 

Multiplex EP.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Super S MP Grease Red No Bid No Bid No Bid P66 Multiplex Red #2 Valvoline Cerulean #2 No Bid No Bid

40
Bid prices shall be based on deliveries of returnable 120 lb. drums.                                                                

Minimum of one (1) drum per delivery. Drum holds 120 lbs.
8 Per Drum

210.45$        1,683.60$            X X X X X X 327.60$        2,620.80$            334.74$        2,677.92$            X X X X

41
Bid prices shall be based on deliveries of returnable 35 lb. pails.                                                                

Minimum of one (1) pail per delivery. Pail holds 35 lbs.
2 Per Pail

66.23$          132.46$               X X X X X X 99.40$          198.80$               98.03$          196.06$               X X X X

Lubriplate 1200-2: NLGI NO.2 grade grease. DO NOT SUBSTITUTE. Lithium base non-

corrosive, water repellent, specifically designed as one lubricant to take care of wheel 

bearings, all chassis points including ball joints, universal joints, fire pumps and fifth 

wheels.  Dropping Point 400 degrees, color (beige), wheel bearing test 0.35 grams 

leakage.  Shall pass Timken OK Load, 40 lbs.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ Lubriplate 1200-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Valvoline Crimson #2 No Bid No Bid

42
Bid prices shall be based on deliveries returnable 400 lb. drums.                                                                           

Minimum of one (1) drum per delivery. Drum holds 400 lbs.
1 Per Drum

2,599.37$     2,599.37$            X X X X X X X X 1,040.89$     1,040.89$            X X X X

43
Bid prices shall be based on deliveries returnable 120 lb. drums.                                                                  

Minimum of one (1) drum per delivery. Drum holds 120 lbs.
2 Per Drum

787.04$        1,574.08$            X X X X X X X X 269.96$        539.92$               X X X X

44
Bid price shall be based on deliveries of ten (10) 14 oz. cartridge per case. Minimum of 

one (1) case per delivery. Case holds 10/14 oz. (total 140 oz).
3 Per Case

X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X

Synthetic Transfluid, Transynd, meeting Allison Transmissions specifications for severe 

duty and extended craw intervals (TES-295) or approved equal. SuperSyn is an 

acceptable substitution.

Brand Name and NO. of Product Offered:_______________________________________ No Bid No Bid No Bid Mobil Delvac Synthetic ATF Castrol Transynd EMGARD No Bid No Bid

45 Bid price shall be based on deliveries in returnable 55 gal. drums.. 6 Per Drum X X X X X X 1,358.59$     5,434.36$            1,695.65$     10,173.90$          2,116.31$     12,697.86$          X X X X

46
Bid price shall be based on a minimum of 400 gallons in bulk per delivery.  The Contractor 

shall fill the City's tank. 
5,000 Per Gallon

X X X X X X 24.70$          123,500.00$        30.83$          154,150.00$        X X X X X X


