SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-851208
OPENED: April 29, 2016
By: RM&TW

BID RESULTS

Walker-Moody

Furnish Asphaltic Concrete, Emulsified Asphalt Black Grace Halawa Pavement Products
and Pothole Patching Cold Mix Material Plumeria Pacific Asphalt & Equipment Ltd
for a Twelve (12) Month Period LLC LLC LLC dba
SealMaster Hawaii
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE, per ton
Driveway Mix, C&C Mix #5 NO BID
248 Sand Island Access Rd $150.00
Kapaa Plant, Kapaa Quarry Rd $122.00
Kalaeloa Plant, 91-500 Malakole St $122.00
Makakilo Quarry, H-1 Exit 3, Palehua Rd $122.00
Halawa Valley St, Aiea $109.99
Resurfacing Mix, C&C Mix #4 NO BID
248 Sand Island Access Rd $145.00
Kapaa Plant, Kapaa Quarry Rd $118.50
Kalaeloa Plant, 91-500 Malakole St $118.50
Makakilo Quarry, H-1 Exit 3, Palehua Rd $118.50
Halawa Valley St, Aiea $109.99
Asphalt Treated Base NO BID
248 Sand Island Access Rd $140.00
Kapaa Plant, Kapaa Quarry Rd $107.00
Kalaeloa Plant, 91-500 Malakole St $107.00
Makakilo Quarry, H-1 Exit 3, Palehua Rd $107.00
Halawa Valley St, Aiea $99.99
Wearing Course, C&C Mix #3 NO BID
248 Sand Island Access Rd $142.50
Kapaa Plant, Kapaa Quarry Rd $114.50
Kalaeloa Plant, 91-500 Malakole St $114.50
Makakilo Quarry, H-1 Exit 3, Palehua Rd $114.50

Halawa Valley St, Aiea

$104.99
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EMULSIFIED ASPHALT, per gallon
Quick Setting, Grade RS-1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Slow Setting, Grade SS-1 NO BID NO BID
Kapaa Plant, Kapaa Quarry Rd $15.10
Kalaeloa Plant, 91-500 Malakole St $9.30
Makakilo Quarry, H-1 Exit 3, Palehua Rd $9.30
Halawa Plant, 99-1300 Halawa Valley Rd $9.30
2927 Mokumoa St $3.56
POTHOLE PATCHING COLD MIX MATERIAL, per pound
Instant Road Repair, or approved substitute NO BID NO BID
GP Roadway Solutions, 660 Mapunapuna St $0.85
DMS-9203
2927 Mokumoa St $0.79
Instant Road Repair
AguaPhalt, or approved substitute NO BID NO BID NO BID
2927 Mokumoa St $1.20
Road Stone
AquaPhalt 4mm
PatchMaster, or approved substitute NO BID NO BID NO BID
2927 Mokumoa St $0.27
SealMaster Hawaii
PatchMaster
QPR, or approved substitute NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Wespro, or approved substitute NO BID NO BID $0.85 NO BID
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Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




