BID RESULTS FOR GOODS, SERVICES, AND CONCESSIONS
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-HPD-829407
OPENED: January 26, 2017
By: LSandRM

Furnish and Deliver Various Police
Equipment Accessories for a Twelve (12)
Month Period to the Honolulu Police

aeﬁalrtrlnerﬁt, \%it% and County of Honolulu, Lawmen's & Shooters Elite L.N. Curtis LC Action Guradian Security
onolulu, Hawa Supply, Inc. Products LLC Police Supply Protective Equipment
Devices Corp
GROUP A (Item Nos. 1 - 4)
1 Holsters — Safariland ALS Level III Retention Duty Part No. 6360-83-61 — Right Hand
Bid Price:
Unit: 200 each No bid No bid $135.60 $118.88 No bid $132.20
Total $27,120.00 $23,776.00 $26,440.00
2 Holsters — Safariland ALS Level III Retention Duty Part No. 6360-83-62 — Left Hand
Bid Price:
Unit 100 each No bid No bid $135.60 $118.88 No bid $132.20
Total $13,560.00 $11,888.00 $13,220.00
3 Magazine Pouch — Aker Double for Glock 17 Part No. A510-BP-3-Nkl
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each No bid No bid $32.35 $20.85 No bid $30.00
Total $3,235.00 $2,085.00 $3,000.00
4 Magazine Pouch — Aker Double for Glock 17 Part No. A510-BP-3-Brass
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each No bid No bid $22.50 $20.85 No bid $30.00
Total $2,250.00 $2,085.00 $3,000.00
GROUP A Total (Line Nos. 1 - 4 Inclusive): No bid No bid $46,165.00 $39,834.00 No bid $45,660.00
GROUP B (Item Nos. 5 - 8)
5 Sally Brown Waist Belts; 11 ounce bends, plain
Bid Price:
Unit: 300 each No bid No bid $86.55 $74.28 No bid $41.80
Total $25,965.00 $22,284.00 $12,540.00
6 Sally Brown Waist Belts; 6-1/2 to 7 ounce, plain, Right
Bid Price:
Unit 50 each No bid No bid $86.55 $74.28 No bid $45.90
Total $86.55 $3,714.00 $2,295.00

7 Sally Brown Waist Belts; 6-1/2 to 7 ounce, plain, Left
Bid Price:
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Unit 50 each No bid No bid $86.55 $74.28 No bid $45.90
Total $4,327.50 $3,714.00 $2,295.00
8 Brass Buckle, Polished Brass
Bid Price:
Unit 200 each No bid No bid $10.75 $9.96 No bid $8.85
Total $2,150.00 $1,992.00 $1,770.00
GROUP B Total (Line Nos. 5 - 8 Inclusive): No bid No bid $32,529.05 $31,704.00 No bid $18,900.00
GROUP C (Item Nos. 9 - 14)
9 Police Caps for Officers Standard Type All sizes
Bid Price:
Unit: 500 each No bid $47.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total $23,500.00
10 Police Caps for Officers, with One (1) Row of Gold Braid All sizes for Lieutenants
Bid Price:
Unit: 50 each No bid $97.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total $4,850.00
11 Police Caps for Officers, with One (1) Row of Gold Braid All sizes for Captains and Above
Bid Price:
Unit: 50 each No bid $99.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total $4,950.00
12 Police Cap Bands, Chrome band, snake chrome cap strap for band
Bid Price:
Unit 300 each No bid $9.95 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total $2,985.00
13 Police Cap Bands, Gold band, gold cap strap for band
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each No bid $9.95 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total $995.00
14 Police Cap Covers
Bid Price:
Unit: 300 each No bid $4.95 No bid No bid No bid No bid
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Total $1,485.00
GROUP C Total (Line Nos. 9 - 14 Inclusive): No bid $38,765.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
GROUP D (Item Nos. 15 - 17)
15 Expandable Baton
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each No bid No bid No bid $81.96 No bid $97.00
Total $8,196.00 $9,700.00
16 Baton Case Holder
Bid Price:
Unit 100 each No bid No bid No bid $34.21 No bid $40.60
Total $3,421.00 $4,060.00
17 Baton Grip Cap
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each No bid No bid No bid $11.04 No bid $13.80
Total $1,104.00 $1,380.00
GROUP D Total (Line Nos. 15 - 17 Inclusive): No bid No bid No bid $12,721.00 No bid $15,140.00
GROUP E (Item Nos. 18 - 20)
18 Handcuffs
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each $25.09 No bid No bid $22.94 No bid $30.35
Total $2,509.00 $2,294.00 $3,035.00
19 Handcuff Pouches, Nickel Chrome Snap
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each $24.10 No bid No bid $38.46 No bid $26.00
Total $2,410.00 $3,846.00 $2,600.00
20 Handcuff Pouches, Brass Snap
Bid Price:
Unit: 100 each $24.10 No bid No bid $38.85 No bid $26.00
Total $2,410.00 $3,885.00 $2,600.00
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GROUP E Total (Line Nos. 18 - 20 Inclusive): $7,329.00 No bid No bid $10,025.00 No bid $8,235.00
GROUP F (Item Nos. 21 - 29)
21 Magnetic Finger Print Powder, 16 ounce
Bid Price:
Unit: 50 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $39.00
Total $1,950.00
22 Magnetic Wand Applicator, Red Pencil Style
Bid Price:
Unit 100 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $16.20
Total $1,620.00
23 Finger Print Powder, 8 ounce
Bid Price:
Unit 100 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $15.00
Total $1,500.00
24 Finger Print Brush, Fiberglass Bristles
Bid Price:
Unit: 300 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $7.75
Total $2,325.00
25 Finger Print Lifting Tape
Bid Price:
Unit: 500 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.50
Total $2,750.00
26 Finger Print Ink, 2 ounce
Bid Price:
Unit: 20 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.00
Total $100.00
27 Finger Print Ink Roller
Bid Price:
Unit 10 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $16.00
Total $160.00
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28 Finger Print Reprint Labels
Bid Price:
Unit 10 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $23.00
Total $230.00
29 Finger Print Kit Box with Custom Decal
Bid Price:
Unit: 50 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $30.00
Total $1,500.00
GROUP F Total (Line Nos. 21 - 29 Inclusive): No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $12,135.00
GROUP G (Item Nos. 30 - 33)
30 Gloves, White, Cotton, Size Small
Bid Price:
Unit 50 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.20
Total $260.00
31 Gloves, White, Cotton, Size Medium
Bid Price:
Unit 150 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.20
Total $780.00
32 Gloves, White, Cotton, Size Large
Bid Price:
Unit: 200 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.20
Total $1,040.00
33 Gloves, White, Cotton, Size X-Large
Bid Price:
Unit 100 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.20
Total $520.00
GROUP G Total (Line Nos. 30 - 33 Inclusive): No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $2,600.00

GROUP H (Item Nos. 34 - 36)

34 Pepper Spray Pouch
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Bid Price:
Unit 300 each No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $26.00
Total $7,800.00
35 Pepper Spray Service - Fog
Bid Price:
Unit: 500 each No bid No bid No bid No bid $6.50 No bid
Total $3,250.00
36 Pepper Spray, Training-Inert
Bid Price:
Unit: 200 each No bid No bid No bid No bid $5.50 No bid
Total $1,100.00
GROUP H Total (Line Nos. 34 - 36 Inclusive): No bid No bid No bid No bid $4,350.00 $7,800.00
GROUP I (Item Nos. 37 - 39 Award by Item)
37 Measuring Wheels
Bid Price:
Unit 60 each No bid No bid No bid $44.12 No bid $25.95
Total $2,647.20 $1,557.00
GROUP I Total (Line No. 37): No bid No bid No bid $2,647.20 No bid $1,557.00
38 Whistle, Chrome
Bid Price:
Unit 144 each $7.34 No bid No bid $13.53 No bid $7.50
Total $1,056.96 $1,948.32 $1,080.00
GROUP I Total (Line No. 38): $1,056.96 No bid No bid $1,948.32 No bid $1,080.00
39 Whistle, Brass
Bid Price:
Unit 144 each $7.46 No bid No bid $16.17 No bid $7.70
Total $1,074.24 $2,328.48 $1,108.80
GROUP I Total (Line No. 39): $1,074.24 No bid No bid $2,328.48 No bid $1,108.80




BID RESULTS FOR GOODS, SERVICES, AND CONCESSIONS
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-HPD-829407
OPENED: January 26, 2017
By: LSandRM

Furnish and Deliver Various Police
Equipment Accessories for a Twelve (12)
Month Period to the Honolulu Police
Department, City and County of Honolulu,
Honolulu, Hawalii

Lawmen's & Shooters
Supply, Inc.

Elite
Products LLC

L.N. Curtis

LC Action
Police Supply

Guradian
Protective
Devices

Security
Equipment
Corp

Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




