Bid Tabulation Summary

Project: Furnishing Crushed Rock and Sand, for a twelve month period.

Solicitation No. RFB-DFM-1026202

Bid Opening: November 21, 2016, 2:00 pm

BIDS RECEIVED

Grace Pacific LLC

Pacific Agricultural Sales & Services, Inc .

Pacific Ag Warehouse, Kapolei

Pacific Agricultural Sales & Services, Inc .

Oahu Jobsite

Phoenix V LLC dba BEI Hawaii

Makai Ranch, Kahuku

ILI(E)M DESCRIPTION E;Sg}?;[tevd Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Grade “A” Crushed Rock

1 Surge: 250 44.96 11,240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 No. 2 Coarse: 120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grade “A” Crushed Rock (cont)

3 No. 3 Coarse: 40 37.65 1,503.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 No. 3 Medium; 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 No. 3 Fine: 100 37.65 3,765.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Chips — Gravel: 100 41.85 4,185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Commercial No. 4: 100 42.90 4,290.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grade “B” Crushed Rock

8 Crusher Run 1-1/2 in. 500 35.55 17,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Borrow Material

9 Crusher Waste: 250 23.00 5,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Bone Material: 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Crushed Limestone

11 Crusher Run 1-1/2 in.; 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 Limestone base course 1-1/2 in.: 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 5 in. or better limestone Bone material: 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sand

14 [Natural Beach (Golf Course): 180 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 87.96 15,832.80

15 |Natural Beach or Manufactured 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Construction):

16 Sandblast Sand: 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Masonry Sand: 200 70.05 14,010.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 |Silica Sand: 50 No Bid No Bid $ 563.60 28,180.00 | $ 583.60 29,180.00 No Bid No Bid
Molokai Cinderlite

19 Molokai Cinderlite 3/8 fine: 750 73.20 54,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Volcanic Cinder

20 Crushed Volcanic Cinder: 50 No Bid No Bid $ 103.60 5,180.00 | $ 118.60 5,930.00 No Bid No Bid

21 |Top Soil (Screened): 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 [Nursery Mix #1: 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




