
Bid Abstract

RFB-HFD-911503 Provide Fire Extinguisher inspection replacement and recharing services

Fire hose inspection replacement and repair Bid opening 1/25/2016 By SK TW

Oahu Fire Protection

Description Est Qty Unit Unit Price Total Price

1.     

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls 30.00$ 1,500.00$

2.     

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 30.00$ 1,500.00$

3.  

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 50.00$ 2,500.00$

4.   Inspection Rate 5000 Each 2.00$ 10,000.00$

5.  

Hydrostatic Testing

Rate 100 Each 15.00$ 1,500.00$

6.   Disposal Rate 300 Each 5.00$ 1,500.00$

7.  

ABC Recharging

Rate 250

Price per

pound 5.00$ 1,250.00$

8.  

Co2 Recharging

Rate 500

Price per

pound 5.00$ 2,500.00$

9 Repair Rate 50 Per Hour 30.00$ 1,500.00$

10

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement

Extinguisher. 50%

23,750.00$

11

2.5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 105.20$ 52.60$ 52.60$ x 25 1,315.00$

12

5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 138.80$ 69.40$ 69.40$ x 25 1,735.00$

13

10 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 228.80$ 114.40$ 114.40$ x 25 2,860.00$

14

20 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 386.60$ 193.30$ 193.30$ x 25 4,832.50$

15

15 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 719.50$ 359.80$ 359.70$ x 25 8,992.50$

16

20 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 886.00$ 443.00$ 443.00$ x 25 11,075.00$

30,810.00$

Total Sum Evaluated

Bid Price Group A:

(Sum of Items No. 1 – 9, 11 – 16) 54,560.00$



17

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls 30.00$ 1,500.00$

18

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 30.00$ 1,500.00$

19

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 50.00$ 2,500.00$

20 Inspection Rate 200 Each 3.00$ 600.00$

21 Repair Rate 100 Per Hour 110.00$ 11,000.00$

17,100.00$

22

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement Hoses. % 20

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price Est Qty total price

23 1.50” Hose 50 feet 292.00$ 58.40$ 233.60$ x 25 5,840.00$

24 1.5” Hose 75 feet 398.00$ 79.60$ 318.40$ x 25 7,960.00$

25 Hose Cabinet 617.00$ 123.40$ 493.60$ x 25 12,340.00$

26 Hose Reel 374.00$ 74.80$ 299.20$ x 25 7,480.00$

33,620.00$

Total Sum Evaluated

Bid Price Group

B:(Sum of Items No.

17 – 21, 23 - 26) 50,720.00$

Safety Systems

Description Est Qty Unit Unit Price Total Price

1.     

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls 63.00$ 3,150.00$

2.     

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 63.00$ 3,150.00$

3.  

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 63.00$ 3,150.00$

4.   Inspection Rate 5000 Each 6.30$ 31,500.00$

5.  

Hydrostatic Testing

Rate 100 Each 33.00$ 3,300.00$

6.   Disposal Rate 300 Each 5.30$ 1,590.00$

7.  

ABC Recharging

Rate 250

Price per

pound 2.53$ 632.50$

8.  

Co2 Recharging

Rate 500

Price per

pound 3.21$ 1,605.00$



9 Repair Rate 50 Per Hour 24.00$ 1,200.00$

10

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement

Extinguisher. 22.87%

49,277.50$

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price Est Qty total price

11

2.5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 42.60$ 8.66$ 33.94$ x 25 848.50$

12

5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 60.00$ 13.23$ 46.77$ x 25 1,169.25$

13

10 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 89.25$ 21.21$ 68.04$ x 25 1,701.00$

14

20 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 176.20$ 43.74$ 132.46$ x 25 3,311.50$

15

15 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 319.30$ 52.47$ 266.83$ x 25 6,670.75$

16

20 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 481.73$ 144.52$ 337.21$ x 25 8,430.25$

22,131.25$

Total Sum

Evaluated Bid Price

Group A:

(Sum of Items No. 1 – 9, 11 – 16) 71,408.75$

17

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls No Bid No Bid

18

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls No Bid No Bid

19

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls No Bid No Bid

20 Inspection Rate 200 Each No Bid No Bid

21 Repair Rate 100 Per Hour No Bid No Bid

22

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement Hoses. % No Bid

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price Est Qty total price

23 1.50” Hose 50 feet 292.00$ 58.40$ No Bid x 25 #VALUE!



24 1.5” Hose 75 feet 398.00$ 79.60$ No Bid x 25 #VALUE!

25 Hose Cabinet 617.00$ 123.40$ No Bid x 25 #VALUE!

26 Hose Reel 374.00$ 74.80$ No Bid x 25 #VALUE!

#VALUE!

Total Sum

Evaluated Bid Price

Group B:(Sum of

Items No. 17 – 21,

23 - 26) No Bid

Elite Fire Service

Description Est Qty Unit Unit Price Total Price

1.     

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls 78.53$ 3,926.50$

2.     

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 78.53$ 3,926.50$

3.  

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 78.53$ 3,926.50$

4.   Inspection Rate 5000 Each 5.24$ 26,200.00$

5.  

Hydrostatic Testing

Rate 100 Each 52.36$ 5,236.00$

6.   Disposal Rate 300 Each 5.24$ 1,572.00$

7.  

ABC Recharging

Rate 250

Price per

pound 20.94$ 5,235.00$

8.  

Co2 Recharging

Rate 500

Price per

pound 20.94$ 10,470.00$

9 Repair Rate 50 Per Hour 89.00$ 4,450.00$

10

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement

Extinguisher. 30%

64,942.50$

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price Est Qty total price

11

2.5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 59.69$ 17.91$ 41.78$ x 25 1,044.50$

12

5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 74.35$ 22.31$ 52.04$ x 25 1,301.00$

13

10 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 123.56$ 37.07$ 86.49$ x 25 2,162.25$

14

20 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 224.08$ 67.22$ 156.86$ x 25 3,921.50$



15

15 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 423.04$ 126.91$ 296.13$ x 25 7,403.25$

16

20 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 515.18$ 154.55$ 360.63$ x 25 9,015.75$

24,848.25$

Total Sum

Evaluated Bid Price

Group A: 89,790.75$

(Sum of Items No. 1 – 9, 11 – 16)

17

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls 78.53$ 3,926.50$

18

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 78.53$ 3,926.50$

19

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 78.53$ 3,926.50$

20 Inspection Rate 200 Each 7.33$ 1,466.00$

21 Repair Rate 100 Per Hour 89.00$ 8,900.00$

22,145.50$

22

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement Hoses. % 25 Est Qty total price

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price 25 2,454.25$

23 1.50” Hose 50 feet 130.89$ 32.72$ 98.17$ x 25 2,945.00$

24 1.5” Hose 75 feet 157.07$ 39.27$ 117.80$ x 25 4,908.25$

25 Hose Cabinet 261.78$ 65.45$ 196.33$ x 25 1,472.50$

26 Hose Reel 78.53$ 19.63$ 58.90$ x 11,780.00$

11,780.00$

Total Sum

Evaluated Bid Price

Group B:(Sum of

Items No. 17 – 21,

23 - 26) 33,925.50$

National Fire

Protection

Description Est Qty Unit Unit Price Total Price

1.     

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls 125.00$ 6,250.00$



2.     

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 125.00$ 6,250.00$

3.  

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls 125.00$ 6,250.00$

4.   Inspection Rate 5000 Each 6.50$ 32,500.00$

5.  

Hydrostatic Testing

Rate 100 Each 45.00$ 4,500.00$

6.   Disposal Rate 300 Each 7.50$ 2,250.00$

7.  

ABC Recharging

Rate 250

Price per

pound 5.00$ 1,250.00$

8.  

Co2 Recharging

Rate 500

Price per

pound 12.00$ 6,000.00$

9 Repair Rate 50 Per Hour 110.00$ 5,500.00$

10

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement

Extinguisher. 15%

70,750.00$

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price Est Qty total price

11

2.5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 55.41$ 8.31$ 47.10$ x 25 1,177.50$

12

5 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 68.23$ 10.23$ 58.00$ x 25 1,450.00$

13

10 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 117.80$ 17.67$ 100.13$ x 25 2,503.25$

14

20 lbs ABC

Extinguisher 214.36$ 32.15$ 182.21$ x 25 4,555.25$

15

15 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 404.41$ 60.66$ 343.75$ x 25 8,593.75$

16

20 lbs Co2

Extinguisher 492.56$ 73.88$ 418.68$ x 25 10,467.00$

28,746.75$

Total Sum

Evaluated Bid Price

Group A: 99,496.75$

(Sum of Items No. 1 – 9, 11 – 16)

17

District I Service Call

Rate 50 Calls No Bid No Bid

18

District II Service

Call Rate 50 Calls No Bid No Bid

19

District III Service

Call Rate 50 Calls No Bid No Bid



20 Inspection Rate 200 Each No Bid No Bid

21 Repair Rate 100 Per Hour No Bid No Bid

22

Percentage

Discount Off of

Published

Manufacturer Price

Sheet for

Replacement Hoses. % No Bid Est Qty total price

Description Mfg Price Discount Unit Price 25 No Bid

23 1.50” Hose 50 feet No Bid No Bid No Bid x 25 No Bid

24 1.5” Hose 75 feet No Bid No Bid No Bid x 25 No Bid

25 Hose Cabinet No Bid No Bid No Bid x 25 No Bid

26 Hose Reel No Bid No Bid No Bid x -$

-$

Total Sum

Evaluated Bid Price

Group B:(Sum of

Items No. 17 – 21,

23 - 26)


