Bid Abstract Urban Forestry Services
RFB-DUF-824706 open by SK & MH

Opened 5/26/2015

Smalt & Company Trees of Hawaii Royal Palm HTM Contractors
Group |
Maintenance
Services Per Tree or Estimated
Shrub Qty UOM Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  Total Price
ITEM 1 700 PerDay | $ 1,350.00 | $ 945,000.00 S 500.00 | $ 350,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 980,000.00
ITEM 2 500 PerDay | $ 1,150.00 | $ 575,000.00 S 500.00 | $ 250,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 700,000.00
ITEM 2 400 PerDay | $ 1,250.00 | $ 500,000.00 S 500.00 | $ 200,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 560,000.00
Total $ 2,020,000.00 | No Bid $ 800,000.00 $ 2,240,000.00
Group Il Tree/Shrub
Installation Services
Per Tree or Shrub
District |
ITEM 4 200 Each S 600.00|$ 120,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 300,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 300,000.00
ITEM 5 25 Each S 900.00|$ 22,500.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 52,500.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 75,000.00
ITEM 6 10 Each $ 1,400.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
ITEM 7 50 Each S 300.00]$ 15,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 400.00]|$ 20,000.00
ITEM 8 75 Each S 600.00|$ 45,000.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 11,250.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 11,250.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 45,000.00
ITEM 9 75 Each S 900.00|$ 67,500.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 60,000.00
District Il
ITEM10 150 Each S 400.00|$ 60,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 75,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 225,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 225,000.00
ITEM 11 25 Each S 800.00|$ 20,000.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 52,500.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 75,000.00
ITEM 12 10 Each $ 1,200.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
ITEM 13 25 Each $ 150.00]$ 3,750.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 400.00]| s 10,000.00
ITEM 14 25 Each $ 350.00]$ 8,750.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 3,750.00| $ 600.00 | $ 15,000.00
ITEM 15 25 Each $ 550.00$ 13,750.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 5,000.00| $ 800.00]$ 20,000.00
District 1l
ITEM 16 50 Each S 600.00|$ 30,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 75,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 75,000.00
ITEM 17 10 Each S 900.00]$ 9,000.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
ITEM 18 5 Each $ 1,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 12,500.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
ITEM 19 25 Each $ 300.00]$ 7,500.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 400.00]| s 10,000.00
ITEM 20 25 Each S 600.00|$ 15,000.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 3,750.00| $ 600.00 | $ 15,000.00
ITEM 21 25 Each S 900.00|$ 22,500.00 | $ 200.00]$ 5,000.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 5,000.00| $ 800.00]|$ 20,000.00
Total Sum Group Il $ 493,250.00 $ 504,750.00 $ 839,250.00 $ 1,095,000.00




Smalt & Com

pany

Trees of Hawaii

Royal Palm

HTM Contractors

Group Il Tree
Pruning per Tree
and Large Tree
Removal per Hourly
Rate

ITEM 22 11400 Each
ITEM 23 5700 Each
ITEM 24 1900 Each
ITEM25 12000 Each
ITEM 26 6000 Each
ITEM 27 2000 Each
ITEM 28 4200 Each
ITEM 29 2100 Each
ITEM 30 700 Each
ITEM 31 100 Each
ITEM 32 10 Each
ITEM 33 32 Each
ITEM 34 130 Per Hour
ITEM 35 100 Per Hour
ITEM 36 100 Per Hour
Total Sum Group Il

Group IV Royal

Palm and Coconut

Tree Trimming per

Tree

ITEM 37 5000 Each
ITEM 38 2000 Each
ITEM 39 2000 Each
Total Sum IV
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45.97
65.97
125.97
25.97
45.97
95.97
35.97
55.97
105.97
85.97
65.97
75.97
1,350.00
1,050.00
1,250.00

34.90
42.91
42.91
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524,058.00
376,029.00
239,343.00
311,640.00
275,820.00
191,940.00
151,074.00
117,537.00

74,179.00
8,597.00
659.70
2,431.04
175,500.00
105,000.00
125,000.00
2,678,807.74

174,500.00
85,820.00
85,820.00

346,140.00
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235.00
225.00
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80.00
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1,425,000.00
1,140,000.00
522,500.00
900,000.00
600,000.00
310,000.00
441,000.00
367,500.00
164,500.00
22,500.00
800.00
2,560.00
26,000.00
20,000.00
20,000.00
5,962,360.00

400,000.00
160,000.00
160,000.00
720,000.00

No Bid

No Bid
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32.00
65.00
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364,800.00
370,500.00
161,500.00
384,000.00
390,000.00
170,000.00
134,400.00
136,500.00

59,500.00
100.00

10.00

32.00

130.00

100.00

100.00
2,171,672.00

133,300.00
53,320.00
53,320.00

239,940.00




Smalt & Com

pany

Trees of Hawaii

Royal Palm

HTM Contractors

Group V
Small/Medium Tree
and Shrub Tree
Removal per Hourly
Rate

ITEM 40 100 Per Hour
ITEM 41 100 Per Hour
ITEM 42 100 Per Hour
ITEM 43 100 Per Hour
ITEM 44 100 Per Hour
ITEM 45 100 Per Hour
Total Sum Group V

Group VI Specialty

Pruning

ITEM 46 500 Per Hour
ITEM 47 2000 Per Hour
ITEM 48 1000 Per Hour
ITEM 49 100 Per Hour
ITEM 50 100 Per Hour
ITEM 51 100 Per Hour
Total Sum VI

Group VII' Allowance

for Groups | through

VI

ITEM 52 1 Each
ITEM 53 1 Each
ITEM 54 1 Each

1,200.00
1,080.00
1,100.00
1,500.00
1,180.00
1,400.00

1,300.00
1,080.00
1,200.00
1,300.00
1,080.00
1,200.00

120,000.00
108,000.00
110,000.00
150,000.00
118,000.00
140,000.00
746,000.00

R7, SRV SRV AV NV SRV SV

$  650,000.00
$ 2,160,000.00
$ 1,200,000.00
$  130,000.00
$  108,000.00
$  120,000.00
$ 4,368,000.00

$ 25,000.00
$ 10,000.00

$ 6,000.00
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160.00
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15,000.00
15,000.00
15,000.00
15,000.00
15,000.00
15,000.00
90,000.00

80,000.00
320,000.00
160,000.00

17,000.00

16,000.00

17,000.00

610,000.00

25,000.00
10,000.00
6,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 25,000.00
$ 10,000.00
$ 6,000.00
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50.00
50.00
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50.00
50.00
50.00

50.00
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wvW»vn vV v nn wv»vn vV v nn

v n

5,000.00
5,000.00
5,000.00
5,000.00
5,000.00
5,000.00
30,000.00

25,000.00
100,000.00
50,000.00
5,000.00
5,000.00
5,000.00
190,000.00

25,000.00
10,000.00
6,000.00




Alatini Local Landscaping Imua Landscaping LPN Landscaping
Group |
Maintenance
Services Per Tree or Estimated
Shrub Qty UOM Unit Price  Total Price Unit Price  Total Price Unit Price  Total Price Unit Price  Total Price
ITEM 1 700 Per Day $ 190.00] $ 133,000.00 | $ 25.00] $ 17,500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 350,000.00
ITEM 2 500 Per Day $ 170.00] $ 85,000.00] $ 20.00]S$ 10,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 250,000.00
ITEM 2 400 Per Day S 140.00] S 56,000.00] $ 25.00]S$ 10,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 200,000.00
Total No Bid $  274,000.00 $ 37,500.00 $  800,000.00
Group Il Tree/Shrub
Installation Services
Per Tree or Shrub
District |
ITEM 4 200 Each $1,480.00 | $ 296,000.00 | $ 250.00 $ 50,000.00
ITEM 5 25 Each $2,200.00 | $ 55,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 12,500.00
ITEM 6 10 Each $3,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
ITEM 7 50 Each S 50.00]$ 2,500.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 2,500.00
ITEM 8 75 Each S 70.00]$ 5,250.00 | $ 75.00| $ 5,625.00
ITEM 9 75 Each S 95.00]$ 7,125.00 | $ 125.00]$ 9,375.00
District Il
ITEM10 150 Each $1,400.00 | $ 210,000.00 | $ 250.00 $ 37,500.00
ITEM 11 25 Each $2,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 12,500.00
ITEM 12 10 Each $2,800.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
ITEM 13 25 Each S 50.00]$ 1,250.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 1,250.00
ITEM 14 25 Each S 60.00]S 1,500.00 | $ 75.00| $ 1,875.00
ITEM 15 25 Each S 80.00]S 2,000.00 | $ 125.00]$ 3,125.00
District 1l
ITEM 16 50 Each $1,400.00 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 12,500.00
ITEM 17 10 Each $2,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 5,000.00
ITEM 18 5 Each $2,800.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
ITEM 19 25 Each S 50.00]$ 1,250.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 1,250.00
ITEM 20 25 Each S 60.00]S 1,500.00 | $ 75.00| $ 1,875.00
ITEM 21 25 Each S 80.00]S 2,000.00 | $ 125.00]$ 3,125.00
Total Sum Group Il No Bid No Bid $ 797,375.00 $  185,000.00




Alatini Local Landscaping Imua Landscaping LPN Landscaping
Group Il Tree
Pruning per Tree
and Large Tree
Removal per Hourly
Rate
ITEM 22 11400 Each $ 5500]$ 627,000.00 | $ 45.00] $ 513,000.00 | $ 62.00]$ 706,800.00 | $  75.00] $ 855,000.00
ITEM 23 5700 Each $ 8500]$ 484,500.00| $ 75.00]$ 427,500.00 | $ 90.00| $ 513,000.00 | $ 115.00| $ 655,500.00
ITEM 24 1900 Each $ 12000]$ 228,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 190,000.00 | $ 140.00| $ 266,000.00 | $ 200.00]$ 380,000.00
ITEM25 12000 Each $ 4500]$ 540,000.00 | $ 45.00] $ 540,000.00 | $ 47.00] $ 564,000.00 | $ 45.00] $ 540,000.00
ITEM 26 6000 Each $ 6500]$ 390,000.00 | $ 70.00]$ 420,000.00| $ 74.00]$ 444,000.00 | $ 75.00] $ 450,000.00
ITEM 27 2000 Each $ 105.00] ¢ 210,000.00 | $ 95.00] $ 190,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 200,000.00 | $ 150.00] $ 300,000.00
ITEM 28 4200 Each $ 5500]$ 231,000.00 | $ 45.00] $ 189,000.00 | $ 50.00]$ 210,00000|$ 70.00]$ 294,000.00
ITEM 29 2100 Each $ 7500]$ 157,500.00 | $ 70.00]| $ 147,000.00 | S 88.00]$ 184,800.00 | $ 100.00] $ 210,000.00
ITEM 30 700 Each $ 12000]$ 84,000.00| $ 95.00]$ 66,500.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 77,000.00 | $ 175.00] $ 122,500.00
ITEM 31 100 Each $ 9500]¢ 9,500.00| $ 80.00]$ 8,000.00|$ 78.00]$ 7,800.00 | $ 70.00]$ 7,000.00
ITEM 32 10 Each $ 9500]¢ 950.00| $ 80.00]$ 800.00|$ 75.00]$ 750.00]$ 70.00|$ 700.00
ITEM 33 32 Each $ 9500]¢ 3,040.00| $ 80.00]$ 2,560.00| $ 80.00]$ 2,560.00|$ 70.00]$ 2,240.00
ITEM 34 130 Per Hour| $ 500.00 | $ 65,000.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 24,700.00 | $ 625.00] $ 81,250.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 71,500.00
ITEM 35 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 55,000.00
ITEM 36 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 170.00| $ 17,000.00 | $ 595.00| $ 59,500.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 55,000.00
Total Sum Group Il $ 3,130,490.00 $ 2,754,060.00 $ 3,367,460.00 $ 3,998,440.00
Group IV Royal
Palm and Coconut
Tree Trimming per
Tree
ITEM 37 5000 Each S 6000]s 300,000.00 | $ 65.00]$ 325,000.00| s 62.00]$ 310,000.00 | $ 70.00] $ 350,000.00
ITEM 38 2000 Each $ 6000]s 120,000.00 | $ 50.00] S 100,000.00 | S 54.00] s 108,000.00 | s 70.00] s 140,000.00
ITEM 39 2000 Each S 6000]s 120,000.00 | $ 55.00] S 110,000.00 | S 60.00] S 120,00000| s 70.00] S 140,000.00
Total Sum IV $ 540,000.00 $  535,000.00 $ 538,000.00 $  630,000.00




Alatini Local Landscaping Imua Landscaping LPN Landscaping
Group V
Small/Medium Tree
and Shrub Tree
Removal per Hourly
Rate
ITEM 40 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 50,000.00 | $ 190.00] $ 19,000.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 25,000.00
ITEM 41 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 50,000.00 | $ 170.00] $ 17,000.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 250.00 ] $ 25,000.00
ITEM 42 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 50,000.00 | $ 155.00] $ 15,500.00 | $ 325.00| $ 32,500.00 | $ 250.00] $ 25,000.00
ITEM 43 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 50,000.00 | $ 190.00] $ 19,000.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 250.00]$ 25,000.00
ITEM 44 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 50,000.00 | $ 170.00] $ 17,000.00 | $ 325.00| $ 32,500.00 | $ 250.00 ] $ 25,000.00
ITEM 45 100 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 50,000.00 | $ 155.00] $ 15,500.00 | $ 375.00| $ 37,500.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 25,000.00
Total Sum Group V $ 300,000.00 $ 103,000.00 $ 207,500.00 $  150,000.00
Group VI Specialty
Pruning
ITEM 46 500 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 250,000.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 95,000.00 | $ 340.00]$ 170,000.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 275,000.00
ITEM 47 2000 Per Hour| $ 500.00|$ 1,000,000.00|$ 160.00| $ 320,000.00 | $ 295.00| $ 590,000.00 | $ 550.00]$ 1,100,000.00
ITEM 48 1000 Per Hour| $ 500.00] $ 500,000.00 | $ 145.00| $ 145,000.00 | $ 360.00] $ 360,000.00 | $ 550.00]$ 550,000.00
ITEM 49 100 Per Hour| $ 750.00] $ 75,000.00 | $ 190.00] $ 19,000.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 55,000.00
ITEM 50 100 Per Hour| $ 750.00] $ 75,000.00 | $ 160.00] $ 16,000.00 | $ 285.00 | $ 28,500.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 55,000.00
ITEM 51 100 Per Hour| $ 750.00] $ 75,000.00 | $ 145.00]$ 14,500.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 55,000.00
Total Sum VI $ 1,975,000.00 $ 609,500.00 $ 1,218,500.00 $ 2,090,000.00
Group VII' Allowance
for Groups | through
VI
ITEM 52 1 Each S 25,000.00 S 25,000.00 S 25,000.00 S 25,000.00
ITEM 53 1 Each S 10,000.00 S 10,000.00 S 10,000.00 S 10,000.00
ITEM 54 1 Each S 6,000.00 S 6,000.00 S 6,000.00 S 6,000.00




Tahitian Tree Services

AM Landscaping

Loves Landscaping

Group |

Maintenance

Services Per Tree or Estimated

Shrub Qty UOM Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price  |Total Price

ITEM 1 700 Per Day $ 21.00|$ 14,700.00| S 500.00]$ 350,000.00
ITEM 2 500 Per Day $ 21.00|$ 10,500.00|S$ 500.00]S$ 250,000.00
ITEM 2 400 Per Day $ 4500 $ 18,000.00|S 500.00]S$ 200,000.00
Total No Bid $ 43,200.00 $ 800,000.00
Group Il Tree/Shrub

Installation Services

Per Tree or Shrub

District |

ITEM 4 200 Each $1,000.00 | $ 200,000.00
ITEM 5 25 Each $1,500.00 | $ 37,500.00
ITEM 6 10 Each $2,000.00 S 20,000.00
ITEM 7 50 Each $ 250.00] S 12,500.00
ITEM 8 75 Each $ 350.00] S 26,250.00
ITEM 9 75 Each $ 450.00] S 33,750.00
District Il

ITEM10 150 Each $1,000.00| $ 150,000.00
ITEM 11 25 Each $1,500.00 | $ 37,500.00
ITEM 12 10 Each $2,000.00| $ 20,000.00
ITEM 13 25 Each $ 250.00] S 6,250.00
ITEM 14 25 Each $ 350.00] S 8,750.00
ITEM 15 25 Each $ 450.00] S 11,250.00
District 1l

ITEM 16 50 Each $1,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
ITEM 17 10 Each $1,500.00 | $ 15,000.00
ITEM 18 5 Each $2,000.00 S 10,000.00
ITEM 19 25 Each $ 250.00] S 6,250.00
ITEM 20 25 Each $ 350.00] S 8,750.00
ITEM 21 25 Each $ 450.00] S 11,250.00
Total Sum Group Il No Bid No Bid $ 665,000.00




Tahitian Tree Services

AM Landscaping

Loves Landscaping

Group Il Tree
Pruning per Tree
and Large Tree
Removal per Hourly

Rate

ITEM 22 11400 Each
ITEM 23 5700 Each
ITEM 24 1900 Each
ITEM25 12000 Each
ITEM 26 6000 Each
ITEM 27 2000 Each
ITEM 28 4200 Each
ITEM 29 2100 Each
ITEM 30 700 Each
ITEM 31 100 Each
ITEM 32 10 Each
ITEM 33 32 Each
ITEM 34 130 Per Hour
ITEM 35 100 Per Hour
ITEM 36 100 Per Hour
Total Sum Group Il

Group IV Royal

Palm and Coconut

Tree Trimming per

Tree

ITEM 37 5000 Each
ITEM 38 2000 Each
ITEM 39 2000 Each
Total Sum IV

$ 52.50
$ 98.45
$ 181.75
$ 52.50
$ 7825
$ 160.45
$ 5217
$ 71.25
$111.45
$ 160.00
$ 160.00
$ 160.00
$ 650.00
$ 650.00
$ 600.00

598,500.00
561,165.00
345,325.00
630,000.00
469,500.00
320,900.00
219,114.00
149,625.00

78,015.00
16,000.00
1,600.00
5,120.00
84,500.00
65,000.00
60,000.00
3,604,364.00

BT R RV AV ¥ S SV IV SRV SRV SV SV SRV SV IV SV S

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

70.00
80.00
90.00
80.00
100.00
110.00
70.00
80.00
90.00
110.00
110.00
110.00
450.00
450.00
450.00

RV IRV RV NV SV S SV IV SRV SRV SV SV SRV SV R VY
VOOV nn

$ 12000 ¢
$ 12000 ¢
$ 12000 ¢

$

798,000.00
456,000.00
171,000.00
960,000.00
600,000.00
220,000.00
294,000.00
168,000.00
63,000.00
11,000.00
1,100.00
3,520.00
58,500.00
45,000.00
45,000.00

3,894,120.00

600,000.00
240,000.00
240,000.00

1,080,000.00




Tahitian Tree Services

AM Landscaping

Loves Landscaping

Group V
Small/Medium Tree
and Shrub Tree
Removal per Hourly

Rate

ITEM 40 100 Per Hour
ITEM 41 100 Per Hour
ITEM 42 100 Per Hour
ITEM 43 100 Per Hour
ITEM 44 100 Per Hour
ITEM 45 100 Per Hour
Total Sum Group V

Group VI Specialty

Pruning

ITEM 46 500 Per Hour
ITEM 47 2000 Per Hour
ITEM 48 1000 Per Hour
ITEM 49 100 Per Hour
ITEM 50 100 Per Hour
ITEM 51 100 Per Hour
Total Sum VI

Group VII' Allowance

for Groups | through

VI

ITEM 52 1 Each
ITEM 53 1 Each
ITEM 54 1 Each

$ 375.00
$ 375.00
$ 375.00
$ 437.50
$ 437.50
$ 437.50

$ 462.00
$ 462.00
$ 462.00
$ 462.00
$ 562.00
$ 462.00

wvw»vn vV nn wv vV v nn

v n n

37,500.00
37,500.00
37,500.00
43,750.00
43,750.00
43,750.00
243,750.00

231,000.00
924,000.00
462,000.00

46,200.00
56,200.00
46,200.00
1,765,600.00

25,000.00
10,000.00
6,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 25,000.00
$ 10,000.00
$  6,000.00

350.00
450.00
350.00
550.00
560.00
550.00

w v v v n
wv VvV n

120.00
150.00
120.00
500.00
500.00
500.00
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wv n

35,000.00
45,000.00
35,000.00
55,000.00
56,000.00
55,000.00
281,000.00

60,000.00
300,000.00
120,000.00

50,000.00

50,000.00

50,000.00

630,000.00

25,000.00
10,000.00
6,000.00




