SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-812508
OPENED: February 6, 2015

By:

CK & LS

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Hawaiian Island

National Industrial

Pacific Tire Group

United Tire &

Tire Co., Inc. Tire of Hawaii Recapping Co., Ltd.
Item
No.
PASSENGER CAR TIRES:
1 P225/70R15
Bid Price: $86.91 $108.00 $91.10 $95.00
Unit 120 each
Total $10,429.20 $12,960.00 $10,932.00 $11,400.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. CHAMPIRO VP1, GRAND PRIX PERF. HANKOOK OPTIMO | 13137 NEXEN ROHTX
PC#100A1564 100T 47B45 H724 (#1013908) 1005
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock Stock
2 P235/75R15
Bid Price: $99.48 $89.32 $91.10 $93.00
Unit 40 each
Total $3,979.20 $3,572.80 $3,644.00 $3,720.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GT CHAMPIRO VP1, | CENTRON WW 35C64 HANKOOK OPTIMO | 13128 NEXEN ROHTX
PC#100A266 H724 (#1010988) 1095
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock Stock
3 P235/70R17-XL
Bid Price: $124.61 $152.23 $125.65 $128.00
Unit 40 each
Total $4,984.40 $6,089.20 $5,026.00 $5,120.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GT SAVERO HT2 XL, WILD SPIRIT ATS GLADIATOR 413142 NEXEN ROHTX
PC#100A1442 111S TBWS8T89 QR700-SUV 111T
(#193-233-6735)
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock
4 P225/60R17
Bid Price: $94.08 $87.37 $102.50 $105.00
Unit 70 each
Total $6,585.60 $6,115.90 $7,175.00 $7,350.00 (NO BID)




SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-812508
OPENED: February 6, 2015

By:

CK & LS

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Hawaiian Island

National Industrial

Pacific Tire Group

United Tire &

Tire Co., Inc. Tire of Hawaii Recapping Co., Ltd.
Item
No.
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GT CHAMPIRO VP1, DORAL SDL A 99T HANKOOK OPTIMO 11407 NEXEN CP672
PC#100A1550 TB5713068 H724 (#1011703) 98H
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock Stock
TRUCK TIRES:
5 8X14.5,12 PR
Bid Price: $112.04 $102.97 $108.95 $90.00
Unit 70 each
Total $7,842.80 $7,207.90 $7,626.50 $6,300.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. CARLISLE SPORT P.K. LOWBOQY DLB29 SAMSON HDRB453 PROSTAR HIGHWAY
TRAIL, PC#5195061 (#12520-2)
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock Stock
6 LT225/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $130.89 $111.74 $125.65 $126.00
Unit 50 each
Total $6,544.50 $5,587.00 $6,282.50 $6,300.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GT SAVERO HT2, CRTION LT 115 GLADIATOR 12685 NEXEN ROHTX
PC#100A1455 TBH FLTO02 QR500-HT 115/112Q
(#193-230-2763)
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock
7 LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $138.22 $139.14 $134.00 $139.00
Unit 180 each
Total $24,879.60 $25,045.20 $24,120.00 $25,020.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GT SAVERO HT2, CRTION LT 120 GLADIATOR 11851 NEXEN ROHTX
PC#100A1451 TBH FLTO04 QR500-HT 120/116Q
(#193-220-4763)
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock




SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-812508
OPENED: February 6, 2015

By:

CK & LS

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Hawaiian Island
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Pacific Tire Group

United Tire &

Tire Co., Inc. Tire of Hawaii Recapping Co., Ltd.
Item
No.
8 LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $232.00 $139.14 $362.85
Unit 60 each
Total $13,920.00 $8,348.40 (NO BID) $21,771.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. | GOODYEAR G949 RSA CRTION LT 120 139082305
PC#139082303 TBH FLT04 GOODYEAR G947
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock
9 LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $131.75 $121.87 $122.00 $129.00
Unit 160 each
Total $21,080.00 $19,499.20 $19,520.00 $20,640.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GOODYEAR WRGR CRTION LT 115 GLADIATOR 11857 NEXEN ROHTX
RSA, PC#179751217 TBH FLTO1 QR500-HT 115/112Q
(#193-220-1863)
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock
10 LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $221.93 $121.87 $346.15
Unit 630 each
Total $139,815.90 $76,778.10 (NO BID) $218,074.50 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. |GOODYEAR G947 RSS, CRTION LT 115 139081305
PC#139081305 TBH FLTO1 GOODYEAR G947
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock
11 LT235/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $138.22 $139.66 $122.00 $135.00
Unit 100 each
Total $13,822.00 $13,966.00 $12,200.00 $13,500.00 (NO BID)




SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-812508
OPENED: February 6, 2015

By:

CK & LS

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES East Bay Tire Hawaiian Island National Industrial Pacific Tire Group United Tire &
Tire Co., Inc. Tire of Hawaii Recapping Co., Ltd.
Item
No.
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. GT SAVERO HT2, CRTION LT 120 GLADIATOR 11859 NEXEN ROHTX
PC#100A1459 TBH FLTO3 QR500-HT 120/116Q
(#193-220-3863)
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock
12 225/70R19.5, 14PR, SBR
Bid Price: $167.54 $175.97 $186.00 $153.00
Unit 60 each
Total $10,052.40 $10,558.20 $11,160.00 $9,180.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. ROADLUX R216, SAILUN S637 GLADIATOR 1133702796
PC#RLA0172 D8244383 QR55-ST DOUBLE COIN RT600
(#193-329-2195) PREMIUM
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock
13 225/70R19.15, 12 PR, SBR
Bid Price: $166.92 $175.97 $176.00 $139.00
Unit 90 each
Total $15,022.80 $15,837.30 $15,840.00 $12,510.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. ROADLUX R216, SAILUN S637 GLADIATOR 1133702795
PC#RL2257019.5-1 D8244383 QR55-ST DOUBLE COIN RT600
(#193-329-2194) PREMIUM
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock
14 255/70R22.5, 16 PR
Bid Price: $203.14 $272.08 $240.00 $183.00
Unit 60 each
Total $12,188.40 $16,324.80 $14,400.00 $10,980.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. ROADLUX R216, SAILUN S627 GLADIATOR 1133395726
PC#RLA0154 D8244185 QR55-ST DOUBLE COIN RT500
(#193-329-5226) PREMIUM
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock




SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-812508
OPENED: February 6, 2015

By:

CK & LS

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Hawaiian Island

National Industrial

Pacific Tire Group

United Tire &

Tire Co., Inc. Tire of Hawaii Recapping Co., Ltd.
Item
No.
15 315/80R22.5, 20 PR
Bid Price: $289.01 $462.12 $370.00 $300.00 $429.32
Unit 1,800 each
Total $520,218.00 $831,816.00 $666,000.00 $540,000.00 $772,776.00
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. ROADLUX R201, SAILUN S607 GLADIATOR 1133671258 FIRESTONE
PC#RLA0087 D8244871 QR55-ST DOUBLE COIN RR680 FS820 20 PLY
(#193-329-3120) SMARTWAY #233874
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock Import
16 425/65R22.5, 20 PR
Bid Price: $476.44 $601.50 $550.00 $475.00
Unit 20 each
Total $9,528.80 $12,030.00 $11,000.00 $9,500.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. ROADLUX R526, SAILUN S825 GT GT876 1133642258
PC#RLA0097 D8244655 (#100E850G) DOUBLE COIN
RLB9004 ULTRA
Stock or Import Stock Stock Stock Stock
17 11R22.5-H, 16 PR
Bid Price: $248.11 $341.85 $318.00 $243.00 $300.14
Unit 400 each
Total $99,244.00 $136,740.00 $127,200.00 $97,200.00 $120,056.00
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. ROADLUX R216, SAILUN S606 GLADIATOR 1133671256 FIRESTONE
PC#RLA0007 D1001396 QR55-ST DOUBLE COIN RR680 FS561 16 PLY
(#193-329-1226) SMARTWAY #248324
Stock or Import Stock Stock Import/Stock Stock Import
DOZER, LOADER, PAVER:
18 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR (without disposal)




SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-812508
OPENED: February 6, 2015
By: CK&LS

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Hawaiian Island

National Industrial

Pacific Tire Group

United Tire &

Tire Co., Inc. Tire of Hawaii Recapping Co., Ltd.
Item
No.
Bid Price: $3,350.78 $3,673.65 $3,210.00 $4,290.00
Unit 5 each
Total $16,753.90 $18,368.25 $16,050.00 $21,450.00 (NO BID)
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO. TITAN LD150 L-4, TITAN LD 150 L4, ARMOUR (XH) MAXOM 202 20PR L4
PC#6DE923TTB T6DER23 E4/L4-20PR
(#2110112)
Stock or Import Stock Import Stock Import
19 Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price: $400.00 $250.00 $300.00 $125.00
Unit 5 each
Total $2,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,500.00 $625.00 (NO BID)
TOTAL BID PRICE (ITEM NO. 18 PLUS ITEM NO. 19) $18,753.90 $19,618.25 * $17,550.00 $22,075.00

* Corrected Amount, Arithmetical Error
Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the
date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




