
Furnish and Deliver Various Work Vehicles

Bid Opening: 5/5/15

By: AP/EP

Solicitation No. RFB-DFM-801109

Unit Price Total Bid Price Year/Make/Model Unit Price Total Bid Price Year/Make/Model Unit Price Total Bid Price Year/Make/Model Unit Price Total Bid Price Year/Make/Model

Item No. Quantity

GROUP A Item 1 1 34,556.03$ 34,556.03$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 35,073.03$ 35,073.03$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 2 1 34,892.57$ 34,892.57$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 35,635.53$ 35,635.53$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 3 1 35,489.81$ 35,489.81$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 36,528.24$ 36,528.24$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 4 2 32,555.71$ 65,111.42$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 32,175.10$ 64,350.20$ 2016 Ford F250 31,716.17$ 63,432.34$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid

Item 5 1 44,540.47$ 44,540.47$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 47,265.78$ 47,265.78$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 6 8 33,739.81$ 269,918.48$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 37,254.29$ 298,034.32$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 7 4 34,472.31$ 137,889.24$ Ford F250 Superduty 35,888.66$ 143,554.64$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 8 2 35,439.06$ 70,878.12$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 38,626.37$ 77,252.74$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 9 4 47,293.51$ 189,174.04$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty 50,098.08$ 200,392.32$ 2016 Ford F250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 10 4 47,586.49$ 190,345.96$ 2016 Ford F250 Superduty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE

GROUP A (Item No. 1 thru 10) 1,072,796.14$

GROUP B Item 11 1 48,481.59$ 48,481.59$ 2016 Ford F350 Superduty 52,067.87$ 52,067.87$ 2016 Ford F350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 12 1 52,380.15$ 52,380.15$ 2016 Ford F350 Superduty 54,850.18$ 54,850.18$ 2016 Ford F350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 13 1 57,814.72$ 57,814.72$ 2016 Ford F450 Superduty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 14 1 47,910.14$ 47,910.14$ 2016 Ford F350 Crew Cab No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 15 1 52,256.73$ 52,256.73$ 2016 Ford F350 Chassis Cab 55,037.68$ 55,037.68$ 2016 Ford F350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 16 1 55,086.05$ 55,086.05$ 2016 Ford F350 Chassis Cab 63,371.04$ 63,371.04$ 2016 Ford F450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 17 2 63,705.78$ 127,411.56$ 2016 Ford F350 Superduty 72,847.11$ 145,694.22$ 2016 Ford F450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 18 2 68,335.56$ 136,671.12$ 2016 Ford F450 Superduty 69,608.56$ 139,217.12$ 2016 Ford F450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 19 1 No Bid No Bid 95,006.55$ 95,006.55$ 2016 Ford F450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 20 6 89,006.07$ 534,036.42$ 2016 Ford F450 Superduty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Additive Option No. 1 6

Additive Option No. 2 6

Additive Option No. 3 6

Total Bid Price + Additive

Option No. 1
Total Bid Price + Additive

Option No. 1 & 2

Total Bid Price + Additive

Option NO. 1, 2 & 3

Item 21 1 142,598.90$ 142,598.90$ 2016 Ford F450 Superduty NoBid NoBid 121,477.23$ 121,477.23$ 2016 Ford F450 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE Group

B (Item 11 thru 21)
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE +

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR

ADDITIVE OPTION NO. 1

Cutter Ford, Inc. Inter Pacific Motors Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Valley Isle Motors, Ltd. Jim Falk Motors of Maui



TOTAL SUM BID PRICE +

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR

ADDITIVE OPTION NO. 1 & 2

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE +

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR

ADDITIVE OPTION NO. 1, 2 &

3

GROUP C Item 22 4 34,354.83$ 137,419.32$ 2015 Ford Transit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33,789.57$ 135,158.28$ 2016 Chevrolet CG33405-3500 Cargo Van

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE Group

C (Item No. 22) 137,419.32$ 135,158.28$
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