Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-ENV-777011
Project: Furnish and Provide Laboratory Services for Testing of Priority Pollutants for a Twelve (12) Month Period

Bid Opening: November 19, 2014

TestAmerica Laboratories, Inc.

Items Description Unit Price | x| Est Qty [=| Total Price

Laboratory Test of Marine Sediment for EPA Priority Pollutants and Organochlorine Compounds, less

1 cyanide, less dioxin; complete as specified hereinafter $3,002.00 | x 12 |=| $36,024.00

2 Laboratory Test of Marine Sediment for 2, 3, 7, 8 - TCDD; complete as specified hereinafter $599.00 |x 12 |=| $7,188.00
Laboratory Test of Fish Tissue for EPA Priority Pollutants and Organochlorine Compounds, less

3 asbestos; complete as specified hereinafter $4,722.00 | x 12 |=| $56,664.00
Laboratory Test of Fish Tissue for EPA Priority Pollutants and Organochlorine Compounds, less

4 asbestos and dioxins; complete as specified hereinafter $3,882.00 | x 12 |=| $46,584.00

5 Laboratory Test of Fish Tissue for 2, 3, 7, 8 - TCDD; complete as specified hereinafter $840.00 |x 12 |=| $10,080.00
Laboratory Test of Dewatered Sludge for EPA Priority Pollutants and Chlorinated Pesticides, less

6 asbestos, cyanide, and total phenols; complete as specified hereinafter $4,305.00 | x 10 |=| $43,050.00
Laboratory Test of Dewatered Sludge for EPA Priority Pollutants, less asbestos, cyanide, and total

7 phenols; complete as specified hereinafter $3,412.00 | x 1 =| $3,412.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for EPA Priority Pollutants and

8 301(h) Pesticides, less asbestos and cyanide; complete as specified hereinafter $3,050.00 | x 3 =| $9,150.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for Asbestos; complete as specified

9 hereinafter $325.00 |x 2 =| $650.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for EPA Priority Pollutant - Organics

10 |- Acid Compounds; complete as specified hereinafter $598.00 |x 14 |=| $8,372.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for EPA Priority Pollutant - Organics

11 |- Base/Neutral Compounds, less dioxin; complete as specified hereinafter $598.00 |x 14 |=| $8,372.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for EPA Priority Pollutants - Metals;

12 |complete as specified hereinafter $270.00 |x 5 =| $1,350.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for EPA Priority Pollutant -

13 Pesticides - Organochlorines; complete as specified hereinafter $370.00 |x 5 =| $1,850.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for Semi-Volatiles; complete as

14 |specified hereinafter $379.00 |x 14 |=| $5,306.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for Organotin; complete as

15 |specified hereinafter $1,365.00 | x 14 |=| $19,110.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for Acrolein and Acrylonitrile;

16 |complete as specified hereinafter $346.00 |x 16 |=| $5,536.00
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for 3,3' - Dichlorobenzidine

17 [(Method 605); complete as specified hereinafter No Bid | x 14 = No Bid
Laboratory Test of Plant Influent, Effluent, and Receiving Waters for Hexachlorobenzene (Method

18 [612); complete as specified hereinafter No Bid | x 14 = No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE (Item Nos. 1 through 18) = | $262,698.00

All bids are subject to evaluation.




