
Bid Abstract to remove

furnish and install

bindery equipment.

RFB-CSD-677203A

Open: 1/28/2015

By: SK & EL Item Qty Toshiba

United

American

Graphics K wilson

Group 1 Unit price Total Unit price Total Unit price Total

Booklet maker 1 1 116,754.00$ 116,754.00$ -$ -$ 128,272.20$ 128,272.20$

Removal & Disposal 2 1 1,500.00$ 1,500.00$ -$ 2,000.00$ 2,000.00$

Make & Model Duplo 600i NO BID NO BID HORIZON

VC100A&C,

SPF200L, FC200L

Maintenance 3 5 7,087.00$ 35,435.00$ -$ 6,750.00$ 33,750.00$

Group 1 sum bid 153,689.00$ -$ 164,022.20$
Group 2

Paper folder 1 1 -$ 62,128.00$ 62,128.00$ 60,150.00$ 60,500.00$

Make & Model NO BID NO BID Baum 20-3PFF Baum 20-3PFF

Removal & Disposal 2 1 -$ -$ -$ -$ 1,650.00$ 1,650.00$

Group 2 sum bid -$ 62,128.00$ 62,150.00$


