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Item No. Alt No. Item No. Alt No. Item No. Alt No. Item No. Alt No.

1 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid 1 1 No Bid
2 No Bid 2 No Bid 2 No Bid 2 No Bid

3 273,516.66$ 12 3.09$ 92,700.00$ 366,216.66$ 3 No Bid 3 170,550.54$ 12 3.09$ 92,700.00$ 263,250.54$ 3 No Bid

4 No Bid 4 No Bid 4 No Bid 4 No Bid

5 No Bid 5 181,633.44$ 14 3.61$ 92,828.57$ 274,462.01$ 5 No Bid 5 165,828.00$ 16 3.61$ 81,225.00$ 247,053.00$

6 262,038.66$ 16 3.61$ 81,225.00$ 343,263.66$ 6 181,633.44$ 14 3.61$ 92,828.57$ 274,462.01$ 6 No Bid 6 No Bid

*total Bid calculation corrected

*City MPG corrected

SERVCO PACIFIC Inc. dba SERVCO AUTO LEEWARD Cutter CJD, Inc. INTER PACIFIC MOTORS INC. DBA ORCHID ISLE AUTO CENTER RAINBOW CHEVROLET INC. DBA CUTTER CHEVROLET


