ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-655109 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

OPENED: SEPTEMBER 18, 2013

For the furnishing and delivery of TRAFFIC SIGNAL SUPPLIES
for a twelve-month period beginning October 15, 2013 and GP ROADWAY PHOENIX SHAH &
ending October 14, 2014 to the Department of Transportation SOLUTIONS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. ASSOCIATES
Services, City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO.
1. MODEL 332A CONTROLLER CABINET
Bid Price Unit 3 Each $13,731.77 $13,791.00 NO BID
Total $41,195.31 $41,373.00
Brand and No.: Econolite TBD332CAB MTS 170E+332
2. CCTV TRAFFIC CAMERA ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 20 Each NO BID $3,450.00 NO BID
Total $69,000.00
Brand and No.: Pelco ES41P36-5W
3. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING ELBOW
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $23.27 $20.00 $14.35
Total $2,327.00 $2,000.00 $1,435.00
Brand and No.: Econolite E1004P2G Pelco SE-4091 TSH-0174F
4. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING SHURLOCK
TEE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $17.45 $28.00 $26.30
Total $1,745.00 $2,800.00 $2,630.00
Brand and No.: Econolite E1056P2G Pelco SE-4092 TSH-0205F
5. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING REAMED TEE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $20.94 $28.00 $13.25
Total $2,094.00 $2,800.00 $1,325.00
Brand and No.: Econolite E1051P2G Pelco SSE-4029 TSH-0202F
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ITEM SOLUTIONS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. ASSOCIATES
NO.
6. ADA PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON ASSSEMBLY
W/HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 300 Each $155.90 $115.00 $113.50
Total $46,770.00 $34,500.00 $34,050.00

Brand and No.:

MODEL 400 MODEM BOARD
Bid Price Unit
Total

50 Each

Brand and No.:

TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE POST-TOP ADAPTER WITH

FOUR SIDE PORTS
Bid Price Unit
Total

75 Each

Brand and No.:

STAINLESS STEEL 100A METER SOCKET WITH

BREAKER
Bid Price Unit

Total

25 Each

Brand and No.:

12 INCH RED LED RETROFIT TRAFFIC SIGNAL

MODULE

Bid Price Unit
Total

100 Each

Brand and No.:

Econolite SIGTBD

$201.28
$10,064.00
Econolite 0711910050

$64.57
$4,842.75
Econolite E2046G?2

NO BID

NO BID

DCC 57H+VRS+4EVRRND

$182.00
$9,100.00
PDC MDM-97

$85.95
$6,446.25
Pelco SE3176

$1,620.00
$40,500.00
B-Line 214MTBMS43SS

$44.77
$4,477.00
Dialight
433-1210-003XL

Polara BDL3-X

$142.25
$7,112.50
PDC Model 400

$74.25
$5,568.75
TSH-0056F, 4 way PT

NO BID

$43.25
$4,325.00
Duralight
JXC-300 HFR-01
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1. 12 INCH YELLOW LED RETROFIT TRAFFIC SIGNAL
MODULE
Bid Price Unit 10 Each NO BID $48.29 $48.35
Total $482.90 $483.50
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight
433-3230-001XL JXC300-HFY-01
12. 12 INCH GREEN LED RETROFIT TRAFFIC SIGNAL
MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $48.29 $47.15
Total $4,829.00 $4,715.00
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight
433-2220-001XL JXC300-HFG-01
13. TRAFFIC SIGNAL VISOR
Bid Price Unit 200 Each $25.60 $19.95 NO BID
Total $5,120.00 $3,990.00
Brand and No.: Econolite E8165P4-14 MTS-M1973
14. 210 CONFLICT MONITOR
Bid Price Unit 25 Each $325.77 $337.00 $418.00
Total $8,144.25 $8,425.00 $10,450.00
Brand and No.: Econolite 0712010330 EDI-210C EDI MODEL 210
15. SINGLEMODE VIDEO RECEIVER AND DATA
TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID $1,501.00 NO BID
Total $6,004.00

Brand and No.:

1FS-VR1930WDM
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16. SINGLEMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER AND DATA
TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID $1,480.00 NO BID
Total $5,920.00
Brand and No.: 1TFSVT1930WDM
17.  ORNAMENTAL CAP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $8.14 $4.00 $3.55
Total $814.00 $400.00 $355.00
Brand and No.: Econlite E1205P4 Pelco SE-4088 Traffic Parts 1109G
18. COUNTDOWN LED PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 300 Each NO BID $151.00 $145.00
Total $45,300.00 $43,500.00
Brand and No.: Dialight 430-6479-001XA| Duralight JXM-400VIEIL
19. MULTIMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER/DATA RECEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID $1,291.00 NO BID
Total $5,164.00
Brand and No.: 1FS VT1920 WDM
20. MULTIMODE VIDEO RECEIVER/DATA TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID $1,230.00 NO BID
Total $4,920.00
Brand and No.: 1FS VR1920WDM
21. LED VEHICLE TRAFFIC SIGNAL
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $355.00 $425.00
Total $35,500.00 $42,500.00

Brand and No.:

MTS M31515+BP
Dialight LED Lamps

Peek 3-Sec Poly
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22. RED LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $54.89 $67.75
Total $5,489.00 $6,775.00
Brand and No.: Dialight P46-3R33-003|Electro Tech PV18X10RD
23. YELLOW LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 10 Each NO BID $54.89 $67.75
Total $548.90 $677.50
Brand and No.: Dialight P46-3Y33-004| Electro Tech PV18X10YL
24. GREEN LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $76.43 $98.25
Total $7,643.00 $9,825.00
Brand and No.: Dialight P46-3G33-005]| Electro Tech PV30X6BG
25. AUDIO PEDESTRIAN BUTTON
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID $252.00 NO BID
Total $12,600.00
Brand and No.: Pelco SE-2039
26. MODEL 242 DC ISOLATOR
Bid Price Unit 50 Each $39.56 $35.00 $40.60
Total $1,978.00 $1,750.00 $2,030.00
Brand and No.: Econolite 0744500010 PDC DCI-82-242 PDC Model 242
27. MODEL 200 LOAD SWITCH LAMP

Bid Price Unit
Total

50 Each

Brand and No.:

$27.92
$1,396.00
Econolite 0754100270

$22.67
$1,133.50
PDC SSS-88

$27.75
$1,387.50
PDC Model 200
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28. MODEL 170E CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit 20 Each $1,749.85 $2,015.00 $1,355.00
Total $34,997.00 $40,300.00 $27,100.00
Brand and No.: Econolite 288035A170 MTS 170E DTS Model 170E
29. PEDESTRIAN TRAFFIC SIGNAL HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $102.50 $100.75
Total $10,250.00 $10,075.00
Brand and No.: MTS M64648 Tr. Parts
SSPED-PNN-R2N-Y
w/Open Face Door
30. TRAFFIC SIGNAL BULB
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total
Brand and No.:
31. FLASH TRANSFER RELAY
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $33.74 $35.10 $38.65
Total $3,374.00 $3,510.00 $3,865.00
Brand and No.: Econolite 0767104810 MTS M11556 PDC Model FTR-91
32. LOCAL FIRMWARE W/EPROM FOR 170E CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit 5 Each $1,883.65 $1,499.00 NO BID
Total $9,418.25 $7,495.00
Brand and No.: Econolite BITRAN MTS 233
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33. ASTRO-BRACKET FOR 3-SECTION STANDARD SIGNAL

ON MAST-ARMS

Bid Price Unit 25 Each $29.09 $127.00 $147.40

Total $727.25 $3,175.00 $3,685.00

34.

35.

36.

37.

Brand and No.:

ASTRO-BRACKET FOR 4-SECTION STANDARD SIGNAL

ON MAST-ARMS
Bid Price Unit
Total

5 Each

Brand and No.:

ASTRO-BRACKET FOR 3-SECTION PROGRAMMED

SIGNAL ON MAST-ARMS
Bid Price Unit
Total

10 Each

Brand and No.:

TYPE 1 - SIGNAL LOOP CABLE
Bid Price Unit 2 REELS

Total
Brand and No.:

10 FEET TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE

Bid Price Unit 100 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

Econolite AB-0116-3-29

$137.29
$686.45
Econolite AB-0116-4-29

$174.52
$1,745.20
Econolite AB-0103-3-29

NO BID

NO BID

Pelco AB-0116-3-29

$134.00
$670.00
Pelco AB-0116-4-29

$189.00
$1,890.00
Pelco AB-0152-3-29

$4,155.90
$8,311.80
Falcon 98261420-1-0

$882.00
$88,200.00
Ameron HITR10-10

TP EZBRAC 3-SEC

$162.00
$810.00
TP EZ Brac 4-Sec

$198.25
$1,982.50
TP EZ Brac PVS

NO BID

$475.00

$47,500.00
Valmont Type I-10'
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38. MPEG-2/MPEG-4/H.264 VIDEO/DATA ENCODER
Bid Price Unit 5 Each $2,323.44 $1,996.00 NO BID
Total $11,617.20 $9,980.00
Brand and No.: Econolite VCL-7401, Cortec
PB7400 DUB7400| VCX-7401+PB7400+DN7400
39. MPEG-2/MPEG-4/H.264 VIDEO/DATA DECODER
Bid Price Unit 2 Each $2,169.87 $1,996.00 NO BID
Total $4,339.74 $3,992.00
Brand and No.: Econolite VCL-7401-R Coretec VCX-7401-R
40. PLUG IN 170 CONTROLLER ETHERNET CARD
Bid Price Unit 15 Each $388.60 $331.00 NO BID
Total $5,829.00 $4,965.00
Brand and No.: Econolite 1133-148 MTS - M3332A
41. EXTERNAL FSK TO SERIAL MODEM
Bid Price Unit 3 Each $460.73 $962.00 NO BID
Total $1,382.19 $2,886.00
Brand and No.: Econolite Modem TBD MTS-M11528
42. MANAGED HARDENED ETHERNET SWITCH
Bid Price Unit 3 Each NO BID $2,349.00 NO BID
Total $7,047.00
Brand and No.: Comnet

CNGE3FE7MS2 +SFP-7




