RFB-HFD-605206
Furnish and Deliver PPE Ensembles and Ensemble Elements opened 3/17/2014 by SK & EL

PAGE 1 All Star LNCurtis Ricochet Hawaii Specailty Vehicle
Group A |[Structural
Item No. |Description Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
1 T/0O jacket 150 | S 964.65 $144,697.50]|S 999.00 $ 149,850.00 | No bid S S 942.33 $ 141,349.95
2 T/O Pants 150 $ 61030 S 91,545.00|S 741.00 S 111,150.00 | No bid S S 746.57 S 111,985.50
3 Boots 200| S 284.65 S 56,930.00| S 283.00 S 56,600.00 | No bid S S 33011 S 66,022.00
4 Helmet 100|$ 14175 S 14,175.00| S 198.00 S 19,800.00 | No bid S S 131.72 S 13,172.00
5 Hood 200|s 2700 $§ 5,40000]$ 29.00 S 5,800.00 | No bid S S 3204 S 6,408.00
6 Gloves 140|$ 5775 S 8,085.00]S 80.00 S 11,200.00 | No bid S S 79.89 S 11,184.60
7 Gear Bag 100|S 6240 $ 6,240.00]S 6000 $ 6,000.00 | No bid S S 57.08 S 5,708.00
8 ANSI Vest 100]$ 3560 S 3,560.00]S 34.00 S 3,400.00 | No bid S S 3211 S 3,211.00
Total $ 330,632.50 $ 363,800.00 S $ 359,041.05
Group B [Wildland
Item No.
1 Coat S, M,L & XL 60 | No bid S - S 125.00 $ 7,500.00 | No bid S No bid S -
2 Coat XXL 60 | No bid S - S 130.00 $ 7,800.00 | No bid S No bid S -
3 Coat XXXL 20 | No bid S - S 138.00 $ 2,760.00 | No bid S No bid S -
4 Coat XXXXL 20 | No bid S - S 145.00 $ 2,900.00 | No bid S No bid S -
Pant XS, S, M, L&
> XL 60 | No bid S - S 140.00 $ 8,400.00 | No bid S No bid S -
6 Pants XXL 60 | No bid S - S 147.00 $ 8,820.00 | No bid S No bid S -
7 Pants XXXL 20 | No bid S - S 155.00 $ 3,100.00 | No bid S No bid S -
8 Pants XXXXL 20 | No bid S - S 163.00 $ 3,260.00 | No bid S No bid S -
9 Heat Shield 40 | No bid S - S 65.00 $ 2,600.00 | No bid S No bid S -
10 Goggles 60 | No bid S - S 32.00 $ 1,920.00 | No bid S No bid S -
11 Helmet 60 | No bid S - S 4200 $ 2,520.00 | No bid S No bid S -
12 Gloves S 5 No bid S - S 3200 S 160.00 | No bid S No bid S -
13 Gloves M 20 | No bid S - S 3200 S 640.00 | No bid S No bid S -
14 Gloves L 60 | No bid S - S 32.00 $ 1,920.00 | No bid S No bid S -
15 Gloves XL 60 | No bid S - S 3200 $ 1,920.00 | No bid S No bid S -
16 Gloves XXL Jumbo |50 | No bid S - S 32.00 $ 1,600.00 | No bid S No bid S -
Total S - $ 57,820.00 S S -




Page 2 All Star LNCuris Ricochet HSV
Group C |EMS Jacket
Item No.
. Jacket S, M, L, & XL |60 | No Bid S - S 290.00 $ 17,400.00|$ 265.00 S 15,900.00 | No bid S -
2 Jacket XXL 30 | NoBid S - S 290.00 $§ 8,700.00|S$ 265.00 S 7,950.00 | No bid S -
3 Jacket XXXL 5 No Bid S - S 290.00 $ 1,450.00|$ 265.00 S 1,325.00 | No bid S -
4 Jacket XXXXL 3 No Bid S - S 370.00 $§ 1,110.00|S$ 265.00 S 795.00 | No bid S -
Total S - $ 28,660.00 $ 25,970.00 S -
Group D |Station Duty Boots
Item No.
1 Boot 6-15 A-8E 200 | S 180.55 $ 36,110.00 | No Bid S - No bid S - S 252.77 S 50,554.00
Total $ 36,110.00 $ - $ - $ 50,554.00




PAGE 3 Pacific Isle Ind. Supply Red the Uniform Tailor

Group A |[Structural

Iltem No. |Description Qty |Unit Total Unit Total
1 T/0O jacket 150 | $1,142.00 $ 171,300.00 | No Bid S
2 T/0 Pants 150 | $ 831.00 $ 124,650.00 | No Bid S
3 Boots 200 | S 392.00 $ 78,400.00 | No Bid S
4 Helmet 100|$ 180.25 $ 18,025.00 | No Bid S
5 Hood 200|S 48.00 $ 9,600.00 | No Bid S
6 Gloves 140 |$ 127.00 $ 17,780.00 | No Bid S
7 Gear Bag 100]S 6130 $ 6,130.00 | No Bid S
8 ANSI Vest 100|$ 88.00 $ 8,800.00 | No Bid S

Total $ 434,685.00 $

Group B |Wildland

Item No.
1 CoatS,M,L&XL |60 |$ 127.00 $ 7,620.00 | No Bid S
2 Coat XXL 60 |$ 134.00 $ 8,040.00 | No Bid S
3 Coat XXXL 20 |S 139.00 $ 2,780.00 | No Bid S
4 Coat XXXXL 20 |$ 147.00 $ 2,940.00 | No Bid S
5 PantXS,S,M,LXL |60 |S 143.00 $ 8,580.00 | No Bid S
6 Pants XXL 60 | S 150.00 $ 9,000.00 | No Bid S
7 Pants XXXL 20 |$ 154.00 $ 3,080.00 | No Bid S
8 Pants XXXXL 20 |S 156.00 $ 3,120.00 | No Bid S
9 Heat Shield 40 |$ 68.00 S 2,720.00 | No Bid S
10 Goggles 60 |S 63.00 $ 3,780.00 | No Bid S
11 Helmet 60 |$ 4950 $ 2,970.00 | No Bid S
12 Gloves S 5 S 4360 S 218.00 | No Bid S
13 Gloves M 20 |$ 4360 S 872.00 | No Bid S
14 Gloves L 60 |S 43.60 $ 2,616.00 | No Bid S
15 Gloves XL 60 |$ 43.60 $ 2,616.00| NoBid S
16 Gloves XXLJumbo |50 |$ 43.60 $ 2,180.00 | No Bid S

Total $ 63,132.00 S
PAGE 4 Pacific Isle Ind. Supply Red the Uniform Tailor




Group C |EMS Jacket
Item No.
! Jacket S, M, L, & XL |60 | No bid S No bid S
2 Jacket XXL 30 | No bid S No bid S
3 Jacket XXXL 5 No bid S No bid S
4 Jacket XXXXL 3 No bid S No bid S
Total S $
Group D |Station Duty Boots
Item No.
1 Boot 6-15 A-8E 200 | No bid S No bid S
Total S S




