Furnish and Deliver Various Work Trucks

Bid Opening: 1/14/2014
ltem No. RFB-DFM-681410
Inter Pacific Motors Inc, | Rainbow Chevrolet Inc,
DBA Orchid Isle Auto DBA Cutter Chevrolet
Group Item Center Inc. Honolulu Ford Cutter Ford
A 1 61,674.00 No Bid 58,121.16 58,675.62
2 33,588.00 No Bid 31,930.51 32,488.59
3 No Bid No Bid 63,360.81 No Bid
4 No Bid No Bid 40,951.85 38,443.56
5 34,675.00 No Bid 32,766.30 32,822.65
14 No Bid No Bid 150,800.56 152,230.32
B 6 *116,002.00 No Bid *101,253.00 106,370.84
7 70,806.00 No Bid 69,759.80 61,775.53
8 55,892.00 No Bid 53,018.19 45,762.39
9 76,034.00 No Bid 74,751.63 72,754.58
10 76,334.00 No Bid 69,605.03 70,769.61
11 552,978.00 No Bid 528,029.22 527,778.78
C 12 No Bid 36,099.00 26,628.96 25,639.22
13 No Bid 36,572.00 27,102.52 28,373.89

*bid calculation correction group B item 6




