Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-DPR-663813

Project: Furnishing and Deliery of Fungicides, Herbicides, Insecticides and Fertiliers to Vaious city Agencies

Bid Opening: 11/19/2013

Item No. and Description

. Pentathion LF, or approved equl

. Insignia or approved equal
. Sencor 75 Turf, or approved equal

. Quik Pro herbicide, or approved equal

. Roundup Custom, or approved equal

. Honcho Plus, Ranger Pro, or approved equal
. Roundup Pro Concentrate, or approved equal
10. Roundup ProMax, or approved equal

11. Ronstar G, or approved equal

12. Ronstar Flo, or approved equal

13. Specticle FLO, or approved equal
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14. Goosegrass/Crabgrass Control, or approved equal

15. Revolver, or approved equal

16. Sedge Hammer or approved equal

17. Crossbow, or approved equal

18. Dursban Pro, Chlorovpryifos, or approved equal
19. Amdro, or approved equal

20. Turf Mark, Loveland or approved equal

21. Excel 90-NF, Loveland, or approved equal
22. Sustain Spreader Sticker, or approved equal
23.21-4-11 + S, Fe & Mn

24. 18-9-18 + FE + Mn

25. 18-6-12

26. 16-2-16

27.24-4-16 + Fe

28. 22-5-10

29.19-3-19

30. 18-2-24

31. 22-2-11 with plymer coated urea

32. 21-0-20 + 1.38 Oxaldiazon

. Daconil Weather Stik, Mainsail 6.0F or approved equal

. MSMA-6 Plus Surfactant, Turfmax, or approved equal

Quantity

80
100
50
100
400
100
85
150
150
150
203
57
70
100
120
81
25
15
30
122
58
50
250
150
200
200
200
1000
200
200
605
200

UoM

Phoenix V LLC Services
Gallon $ 2,806.40 $
Gallon $ 3,063.00 No Bid
Container No Bid $
Bag $ 35,463.00 $
Container $ 33,192.00 No Bid
Container $ 7,141.00 | $
Container $ 4568.20 ' $
Container $ 7,461.00 $
Container $ 7,596.00 | $
Container $ 9,12750 | $
Bag $ 14,433.30 ' $
Container $ 23,87388 $
Pouch $ 107,748.20 $
Bag No Bid No Bid
Container $ 67,852.80 $
Container $ 7,429.32 $
Container $ 580.00 $
Containel
Container $ 5,493.60 No Bid
Container $ 8,176.44 | $
Container $ 1,073.58 $
Container No Bid No Bid
Bag
Bag No Bid No Bid
Bag No Bid No Bid
Bag No Bid No Bid
Bag $ 5,820.00 No Bid
Bag $ 38,590.00 No Bid
Bag No Bid No Bid
Bag $ 11,530.00 No Bid
Bag $ 21,798.15 | No Bid

Crop Production

Bag No Bid No Bid

Pacific

AgriculturalSales

& Services, Inc.

2,520.00 | $
$

19,832.50 $
36,125.00 ' $
$

5,400.00 $
4,150.55 $
6,750.00 | $
7,32450 $
7,737.00 $
13,195.00 $
23,873.88 $
107,748.20 $
$

67,852.80 $
7,643.97 | $
587.50 | $

$

8,077.62 $
977.30 | $

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

N

$

2,504.00
3,432.00
20,599.50
35,084.00
33,072.00
7,118.00
4,607.85
6,445.50
8,131.50
9,672.00
13,663.93
23,874.45
107,748.90
9,434.00
67,852.80
5,356.53
533.50

6,572.10
9,121.94

928.00
4,641.50

8,010.00
6,516.00
6,662.00
6,580.00
32,110.00
10,680.00
9,902.00

o Bid

13,770.00



33. 20-4-10 + 1.0% Ronstar

34. 22-0-10 + 1.0% Oxadiazon

35. 16-6-8 with herbicide and dimensions
36. Dimension 0.25% Plus Fertilizer 19-0-19 or approved equal
37.16-8-8

38. 22-5-6

39. Di-Ammonium Phosphate 18-46-0

40. 5-3-1

41. 6-2-10

42, 4-6-4

43. 15-15-15 with substance 4-6-4

44. apex 14-14-14 NPK

45. 10-30-10

Total Item nos. 1 thru 45

*Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.

All bids are subject to evaluation

150
150
150
150
200
200
150
180
180
100
100
100
100

Legend: Green - apparent low bidder Red - no bid Yellow - tie bids

Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag
Bag

$ 8,758.50
No Bid

$ 6,498.00
No Bid

$ 5,130.00
$ 6,290.00
$ 4,729.50
No Bid

No Bid

$ 2,819.00
$ 2,493.00
$ 6,462.00
$ 2,156.00
$470,153.37

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$

$

No Bid
$ 7,888.50
$ 6,402.00
$ 7,084.50
$ 4,412.00
$ 5,236.00
$ 4,909.50
$ 5,214.60
$ 6,429.60
No Bid
No Bid
$ 5,218.00
2,600.00 $ 2,538.00
322,395.87 $ 529,956.70



