SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-579004
OPENED: April 16, 2013

By:

RM & AP

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Pacific Tire Group Inc

Item
No.

PASSENGER CAR TIRES:
P225/70R15
Bid Price:
Unit 120 each
Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

P235/75R15
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

40 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

P235/70R17 XL
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

40 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

P225/60R17
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

70 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

TRUCK TIRES:
8 X 14.5, 12 PR
Bid Price:
Unit 40 each
Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

7.50 X 16, 10 PR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

40 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

160 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR

$93.25
$11,190.00
GT MAXTOUR, PC# 100A742

Stock

$100.62
$4,024.80
GT CHAMPIRO, PC# 100A266

Stock

$128.77
$5,150.80
GT SAVERO HT2, PC# 100A1442

Stock

$117.90

$8,253.00

GOODYEAR ASSURANCE FUEL MAX,
PC# 738168571
Stock

$111.00

$4,440.00

CARLISLE SPORT TRAIL, PC#
5195061
Stock

$129.00

$5,160.00

DURO HF506 LT HWY, PC#
DR75016EHY2
Stock

$139.00

$22,240.00
GT SAVERO HT2, PC# 100A1457

Stock

$94.00

$11,280.00
NEXEN RO-HT 100S 520A/B 50K

Stock

$93.00

$3,720.00
NEXEN RO-HT 105S 520A/B 50K

Stock

$129.00

$5,160.00
NEXEN RO-HT 108S 520A/B 50K

Stock

$104.00

$7,280.00

NEXEN CP672 500 A/B 60K
Stock

NO BID

NO BID

$137.00

$21,920.00
NEXEN RO-HT 119Q 10 PLY

Stock




SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DFM-579004
OPENED: April 16, 2013

By:

RM & AP

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Pacific Tire Group Inc

Item
No.

10

11

12

13

14

15

Bid Price:
Unit 60 each

Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

160 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price:
Unit 630 each

Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

LT235/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

60 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G114 or
comparable, SBR, Trailer service
Bid Price:
Unit 30 each
Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

225/70R19.15, 12 PR, SBR
Bid Price:
Unit 75 each

Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

255/70R22.5, 16 PR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

60 each

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

315/80R22.5, 20 PR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

1,300 each

$256.49

$15,389.40

GOODYEAR G949 RSA PC#
139082303
Stock

$125.23

$20,036.80

GOODYEAR WRANGLER RSA PC#
179751217

Stock

$249.01

$156,876.30

GOODYEAR G947 RSS PC#
139081305
Stock

$125.00

$7,500.00
GT SAVERO HT2, PC# 100A1459

Stock

$201.00

$6,030.00
GT GT879 16 P.R., PC# 100EV5886

Stock

$219.50

$16,462.50
GT GT279, PC# E6506

Stock

$299.00

$17,940.00
GT GT279, PC# E5991G

Stock

$392.64

$510,432.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$136.00
$8,160.00
NEXEN RO-HT 116Q 10 PLY

Stock

$185.00
$5,550.00
DOUBLE COIN RT500

Stock

$188.00
$14,100.00
DOUBLE COIN RT600 PREMIUM A/P

Stock

$244.00

$14,640.00

DOUBLE COIN RT500 MULTI USE
A/P
Stock

$373.00

$484,900.00
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By:

RM & AP

BID RESULTS

UNMOUNTED PNEUMATIC TIRES

East Bay Tire

Pacific Tire Group Inc

Item
No.

16

17

18

19

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

425/65R22.5, 20 PR
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

20 each

Stock or Import

11R22.5-H, 16 PR
Bid Price:

Unit 400 each

Total
MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

Stock or Import

DOZER, LOADER, PAVER:

23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR (without disposal)
Bid Price:
Unit
Total

MANUFACTURER, MODEL, STOCK / CATALOG NO.

5 each

Stock or Import

Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price:
Unit 5 each
Total

Stock or Import

TOTAL BID PRICE (ITEM NO. 18 PLUS ITEM NO. 19)

* Corrected Amount, Arithmetical Error

Note:

These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the

date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.

GT GT01, PC# GT3158022.5-1

Stock

$647.12

$12,942.40

GOODYEAR G286A SS, PC#
759313200

Stock

$322.65

$129,060.00
GT GT879 AP, PC# E615G

Stock
$3,625.00
$18,125.00
TITAL LD150 20 P.R. L-4, PC#
6DE923TTB
Stock
$400.00
$2,000.00
Stock
$20,125.00

DOUBLE COIN RR200L 5RIB
HIGHWAY

Stock

$562.00

$11,240.00
DOUBLE COIN RLB900+ WIDE BASE

Stock

$327.00

$130,800.00
DOUBLE COIN RT606+ 5RIB

Stock

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




