
Furnish and Deliver Various Passenger Vehicles

RFB-DFM-558022

Bid City MPG Cost of Fuel Total Fuel Cost Total Evaluated Bid Bid City MPG Cost of Fuel Total Fuel Cost Total Evaluated Bid
Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.

1 1 No Bid 1 1 112,848.36$ 47 3.21$ 16,391.49$ 129,239.85$
2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 76,150.00$ 20 3.21$ 38,520.00$ 114,670.00$ 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 82,339.48$ 22 3.21$ 35,018.18$ 117,357.66$
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
2 1 No Bid 2 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 56,446.58$ 17 3.21$ 22,658.82$ 79,105.40$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 58,296.02$ 20 3.21$ 19,260.00$ 77,556.02$ 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
3 1 No Bid 3 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
4 1 No Bid 4 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 No Bid 3 No Bid
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
5 1 No Bid 5 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 142,331.70$ 12 3.21$ 96,300.00$ 238,631.70$ 3 146,997.48$ 12 3.21$ 96,300.00$ 243,297.48$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
6 1 No Bid 6 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 30,283.43$ 11 3.21$ 17,509.09$ 47,792.52$ 3 28,612.48$ 11 3.21$ 17,509.09$ 46,121.57$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
7 1 No Bid 7 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 152,596.32$ 10 3.21$ 77,040.00$ 229,636.32$ 3 151,953.44$ 10 3.21$ 77,040.00$ 228,993.44$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 151,953.44$ 10 3.21$ 77,040.00$ 228,993.44$
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
8 1 No Bid 8 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 24,909.45$ 11 3.21$ 17,509.09$ 42,418.54$ 3 23,494.33$ 11 3.21$ 17,509.09$ 41,003.42$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
9 1 No Bid 9 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 183,338.09$ 11 3.21$ 105,054.55$ 288,392.64$ 3 177,945.06$ 11 3.21$ 105,054.55$ 282,999.61$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Item No. Alternative No. Item No. Alternative No.
10 1 No Bid 10 1 No Bid

2 No Bid 2 No Bid
3 27,049.04$ 11 3.21$ 17,509.09$ 44,558.13$ 3 25,945.64$ 11 3.21$ 17,509.09$ 43,454.73$
4 No Bid 4 No Bid
5 No Bid 5 No Bid
6 No Bid 6 No Bid

Inter Pacific Motors Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Cutter Ford, Inc.


