Furnish and Deliver Various Work Trucks
Bid Opening: 3/15/2013

Item No. 457307
Iner Pacific Rainbow

Motors Inc. dba [|Chevrolet dba

Orchid Isle Auto ||Cutter

Group Item| [Cutter Ford Center Chevrolet

A 1/ |$ 44,34065 || $ 44,152.22 || $ 46,597.00
2| [$ 54,14280 || $ 55,089.76 || $ 59,792.00
3| |$ 61,195.90 || $ 64,346.04 || $ 65,642.00

41 | $ 44,699.83 No Bid No Bid

5| | No Bid No Bid No Bid

B 1[ ] $241,851.00 | [ $ 260,839.40 || No Bid

2| | No Bid No Bid No Bid

3| [ $ 49,154.28 No Bid No Bid

4| | $ 58,298.92 [ | No Bid No Bid

5| [$ 57,068.43 || % 60,272.07 || No Bid

6[|$ 70,580.29 | [ $ 69,322.10 || No Bid

7| | $463,402.68 || $ 480,815.52 || No Bid

8[|% 69,419.79 | [ $ 71,086.69 || No Bid

9| [ $110,029.28 | | $ 117,248.30 || No Bid

10| [$ 73,960.34 | $ 71,366.90 || No Bid




