PROPOSAL NO. RFB-BFS-570616
OPENED: NOVEMBER 21, 2012

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM
NO.

For the furnishing and delivery of COOLANT,
BRAKE FLUID AND BRAKE CLEANER

for the twelve-month period beginning January 1,
2013 and ending December 31, 2013 to the City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

GROUP I:

Ethylene Glycol, Phosphate-Free, Heavy

Duty Coolant, Concentrate, 55-gallon Drum

Bid Price Unit 15 drums
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 Mix, (pre-mix),

Phosphate-Free, Heavy Duty, 55-gallon Drum

Bid Price Unit 22 drums
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

Fleetguard DCA 75L or Equal, 5-gallon
Container
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer and Part Number:

24 containers

Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 Mix (Pre-Mix),

Phosphate Free, 1-gallon container

Bid Price Unit 120 containers
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,

1-gallon Container

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

1515 containers

ALOHA BACON PENNZOIL
AUTOMOTIVE UNIVERSAL DISTRIBUTORS OF
DISTRIBUTORS COMPANY, INC. HAWAII, INC.
NO BID $699.39 $702.62
$0.00 $10,490.85 $10,539.30
CC2741 Purus HD ELC
SPE17238-55
NO BID $426.10 $529.65
$0.00 $9,374.20 $11,652.30
CC2745 Purus HD ELC 50/50
SPE17239-55F
NO BID $103.45 NO BID
$0.00 $2,482.80 $0.00
DCA 75L
NO BID $8.82 $9.74
$0.00 $1,058.40 $1,168.80
CC2747 Purus HD ELC 50/50
SPE17239
$8.90 $12.89 $9.90
$13,483.50 $19,528.35 $14,998.50
Preston Prime AF3000 CC2742 Service Pro All Vehicle

SPE 16705
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ALOHA BACON PENNZOIL
AUTOMTOIVE UNIVERSAL DISTRIBUTORS OF
DISTRIBUTORS COMPANY, INC. HAWAII, INC.
ITEM
NO.
6 Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 Mix (Pre-Mix)
55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 16 drums $771.00 $426.10 $894.50
Total $12,336.00 $6,817.60 $14,312.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: Motorcraft VC7D CC2745 Motorcraft Premium Gold
MCVC7D
GROUP 1
7. Prestone 5/150 Extended Life Coolant or
Equal, 1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 390 containers $12.40 $15.33 $12.27
Total $4,836.00 $5,978.70 $4,785.30
Manufacturer and Part Number: Preston AF888 CC36000 Prestone 5/150 ELC
SPE 86095
8. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 12-0z containers
Bid Price Unit 334 containers $1.92 $2.80 $2.35
Total $641.28 $935.20 $784.90
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson 2212 2212 Johnson Penzoil 8568
9 Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 1-gallon containers
Bid Price Unit 67 gallons $16.86 $26.60 $21.12
Total $1,129.62 $1,782.20 $1,415.04
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnsons 2234 2234 Johnson Penzoil 8569 VS
10. Non-Chlorinated Brake Cleaner, 13-14 oz.
net weight container
Bid Price Unit 6244 containers 2.48 $3.29 $2.41
Total $15,485.12 $20,542.76 $15,048.04
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson 2413 5088 CRC Cyclo CC11
Brake & Parts Cleaner
GROUP Il Total Lump Sum (ltems 7 - 10): $22.092.02 29,238. $22.033.28




