
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-HPD-548303

OPENED: December 28, 2012

By: RM & CK

Elite Products Guardian Protective L.N. Curtins Security Tri-Tech Uniforms Hawaii

LLC Devices Inc & Sons Equipment Corp Forensics Inc Corp

Item

No.

GROUP A – HOLSTERS

1
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid no bid $136.00 $104.90 no bid no bid

Total $27,200.00 $20,980.00

2
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid $136.00 $104.90 no bid no bid

Total $13,600.00 $10,490.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP A (Item Nos. 1 & 2) $40,800.00 $31,470.00

GROUP B– WAIST BELTS

3
Bid Price:

Unit 300 each no bid no bid no bid $34.95 no bid no bid

Total $10,485.00

4
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $36.00 no bid no bid

Total $3,600.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP B (Item Nos. 3 & 4) $14,085.00

5
Bid Price:

Unit 500 each $45.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $50.99

Total $22,500.00 $25,495.00

Holsters; for the right hand

Holsters; for the left hand

Sam Browne Waist Belts; with nickel chrome buckle

Sally Brown Waist Belts; with nickel chrome buckle

Police Caps for Officers, Standard type, All sizes

BID RESULTS

GROUP C – POLICE CAPS, BRAIDS, BAND AND

COVERS

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS POLICE
EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES to the Honolulu
Police Department, City and County of Honolulu,
Honolulu, Hawaii
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6

Bid Price:

Unit 50 each $94.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $107.88

Total $4,700.00 $5,394.00

7

Bid Price:

Unit 50 each $117.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $111.99

Total $5,850.00 $5,599.50

8

Bid Price:

Unit 300 each $6.25 no bid no bid no bid no bid $6.85

Total $1,875.00 $2,055.00

9
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each $6.25 no bid no bid no bid no bid $6.85

Total $625.00 $685.00

10
Bid Price:

Unit 300 each $4.25 no bid no bid no bid no bid $4.50

Total $1,275.00 $1,350.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP C (Item Nos. 5-10) $36,825.00 $40,578.50

GROUP D – BATONS AND ACCESSORIES

Police Cap Bands, Gold band, gold cap strap for band

Police Caps for Officers, with one (1) Row of Gold Braid; All

sizes for Lieutenants

Police Caps for Officers, with two (2) Rows of Gold Braid;

All sizes for Captains and Above

Police Cap Bands, Chrome band, “snake” chrome cap strap

for band

Police Cap Covers
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11

Bid Price:

Unit 50 each no bid no bid no bid $79.35 no bid no bid

Total $3,967.50

12

Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $33.45 no bid no bid

Total $3,345.00

13

Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $2.20 no bid no bid

Total $220.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP D (Item Nos. 11-13) $7,532.50

14
Bid Price:

Unit 225 each no bid no bid $14.00 $15.70 no bid no bid

Total $3,150.00 $3,532.50

15
Bid Price:

Unit 150 each no bid no bid $7.00 $6.40 no bid no bid

Total $1,050.00 $960.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP E (Item Nos. 14 & 15) $4,200.00 $4,492.50

Baton; expandable type

Case Holder for expandable baton

Retaining Cap

GROUP E – FLASHLIGHT KITS AND ACCESSORIES

Flashlight Battery

Flashlight Bulb

GROUP F – HANDCUFF POUCHES
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16
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid no bid no bid $20.54 no bid no bid

Total $4,108.00

17
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $20.54 no bid no bid

Total $2,054.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP F (Item Nos. 16 & 17) $6,162.00

18
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid no bid no bid $21.50 no bid no bid

Total $4,300.00

19
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $21.50 no bid no bid

Total $2,150.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP G (Item Nos. 18 & 19) $6,450.00

20
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid no bid no bid $20.00 no bid no bid

Total $4,000.00

21

Nickel type snap

Brass type snap

GROUP G – MAGAZINE POUCHES

Nickel/chrome type snap

Brass type snap

GROUP H – FLASHLIGHT POUCHES

Regular size handcuff pouches; brass type

Regular size handcuff pouches; nickel type
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Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $20.00 no bid no bid

Total $2,000.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP H (Item Nos. 20 & 21) $6,000.00

22
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total

23
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I (Item Nos. 22 & 23)

24
Bid Price:

Unit 50 each no bid no bid no bid $31.50 $34.50 no bid

Total $1,575.00 $1,725.00

25
Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $12.55 $13.95 no bid

Total $1,255.00 $1,395.00

26

GROUP J –MISCELANEOUS ACCESSORIES (Award by

item)

Magnetic Finger Print Powder

Magnetic Wand Applicator; Red; pencil style

Fingerprint Powder; Minimum 8 oz.; black color

GROUP I – POCKET MASKS

Pocket mask with One-Way Valve

On-Way Valve
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Bid Price:

Unit 100 each no bid no bid no bid $15.90 $13.95 no bid

Total $1,590.00 $1,395.00 *

27
Bid Price:

Unit 300 each no bid no bid no bid $7.50 $7.20 no bid

Total $2,250.00 $2,160.00

28
Bid Price:

Unit 500 each no bid no bid no bid $4.40 $2.68 no bid

Total $2,200.00 $1,340.00

29
Bid Price:

Unit 20 each no bid no bid no bid $5.00 $3.98 no bid

Total $100.00 $79.60

30
Bid Price:

Unit 10 each no bid no bid no bid $12.83 $9.75 no bid

Total $128.30 $97.50

31
Bid Price:

Unit 10 boxes no bid no bid no bid $21.99 $11.25 no bid

Total $219.90 $112.50

32
Bid Price:

Unit 50 each no bid no bid no bid $25.00 no bid no bid

Finger Print Ink Reprint Labels

Fingerprint Kit Box with Custom Decal

Finger Print Brush; Fiberglass bristles

Finger Print Lifting Tape

Finger Print Ink

Finger Print Ink Roller; 4 in. roller



SOLICITATION NO. RFB-HPD-548303

OPENED: December 28, 2012

By: RM & CK

Elite Products Guardian Protective L.N. Curtins Security Tri-Tech Uniforms Hawaii

LLC Devices Inc & Sons Equipment Corp Forensics Inc Corp

Item

No.

BID RESULTS

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS POLICE
EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES to the Honolulu
Police Department, City and County of Honolulu,
Honolulu, Hawaii

Total $1,250.00

33
Bid Price:

Unit 500 pairs no bid no bid no bid $5.20 no bid no bid

Total $2,600.00

34
Bid Price:

Unit 60 each no bid no bid no bid $32.45 $49.00 no bid

Total $1,947.00 $2,940.00

35
Bid Price:

Unit 120 each no bid no bid no bid $30.35 no bid no bid

Total $3,642.00

36
Bid Price:

Unit 144 each $7.40 no bid no bid $6.96 no bid no bid

Total $1,065.60 $1,002.24

37
Bid Price:

Unit 144 each $7.55 no bid no bid $7.29 no bid no bid

Total $1,087.20 $1,049.76

38
Bid Price:

Unit 300 each no bid no bid no bid $21.15 no bid no bid

Total $6,345.00

Handcuffs

Whistle, Chrome

Whistle, Brass

Pepper Spray Pouch

Gloves; dress type

Measuring Wheels
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39
Bid Price:

Unit 500 each no bid $6.30 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total $3,150.00

40
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid $5.30 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total $1,060.00

41
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid no bid no bid $19.10 no bid no bid

Total $3,820.00

42
Bid Price:

Unit 200 each no bid no bid no bid $6.00 no bid no bid

Total $1,200.00

Pepper Spray, Service-Fog

Pepper Spray, Training-inert

CPR Microshield Mask

Brass Buckle for Sam Brown Belt

Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid

opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.

* Corrected Amount, Arithmetical Error


