Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.

Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
1. AINA HAINA COMMUNITY PARK

827 West Hind Drive (373-2722)

(Children)
6-22-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 5 $345.00 $1,725.00 $330.00 $1,650.00
7-06-12 to Regal Cinema (Dole) 5 $310.00 $1,550.00 $330.00 $1,650.00

and Kaka'ako Waterfront Park
7-13-12 to Kailua Beach 5 $335.00 $1,675.00 $330.00 $1,650.00
7-23-12 to Waikiki Beach 5 $310.00 $1,550.00 $330.00 $1,650.00

(Teens)
6-22-12 from Wet 'n Wild Water Park 1 $225.00 $225.00 $330.00 $330.00

(one-way - return from Wet 'n Wild to Aina Haina)
7-26-12 to Ala Moana Hotel 1 $290.00 $290.00 $330.00 $330.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 1 NO BID $7,015.00 $7,260.00 NO BID
2, KAHALA COMMUNITY PARK

4495 Pahoa Avenue (733-7371)

(Children)
6-19-12 to Gunstock Ranch 3 $398.00 $1,194.00 $285.00 $855.00

(55-250 Kamehameha Highway)
6-26-12 to Ice Palace 3 $280.00 $840.00 $285.00 $855.00
7-03-12 to Ward Theaters 3 $280.00 $840.00 $285.00 $855.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 2 NO BID $2,874.00 $2,565.00 NO BID
3. KAIMUKI COMMUNITY PARK

3521 Waialae Avenue (733-7351)

(Children)
6-20-12 to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $275.00 $825.00 $283.00 $849.00

(Dillingham location)
6-28-12 to Ice Palace 3 $275.00 $825.00 $283.00 $849.00
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7-25-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 3 $325.00 $975.00 $283.00 $849.00

(Children) Shuttle Excursions
7-18-12  |to Sans Souci Beach 1 $245.00 $245.00 $283.00 $283.00
7-20-12 to Palolo Valley Dist. Park 1 $245.00 $245.00 $283.00 $283.00

(Teens)
7-26-12  |to Paki Community Park 1 $245.00 $245.00 $283.00 $283.00

and Ala Moana Hotel

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 3 NO BID $3,360.00 $3,396.00 NO BID
4. KAMILO IKI COMMUNITY PARK

7750 Hawaii Kai Drive (395-5314)

(Children)
6-22-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 3 $425.00 $1,275.00 $427.00 $1,281.00
6-28-12 to Ala Moana Beach 3 $380.00 $1,140.00 $427.00 $1,281.00
7-12-12 to Palolo Pool 3 $380.00 $1,140.00 $427.00 $1,281.00
7-19-12 to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $380.00 $1,140.00 $427.00 $1,281.00

(Dillingham location)

(Teens)
7-26-12 to Koko Head District Park 1 $398.00 $398.00 $427.00 $427.00

and Ala Moana Hotel

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 4 NO BID $5,093.00 $5,551.00 NO BID
5. KANEWAI COMMUNITY PARK

2695 Dole Street (733-7366)

(Children)
6-14-12 to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $239.00 $717.00 $270.00 $810.00

(Dillingham location)
6-28-12 to Ice Palace 3 $239.00 $717.00 $270.00 $810.00
7-25-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 3 $310.00 $930.00 $270.00 $810.00
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(Children) Shuttle Excursions
6-21-12 to Kaimana Beach 1 $239.00 $239.00 $270.00 $270.00
7-12-12 to Honolulu Zoo 1 $239.00 $239.00 $270.00 $270.00
7-20-12 to Palolo Valley Dist. Park 1 $239.00 $239.00 $270.00 $270.00
(Teens)
6-15-12  |to Manoa Valley Dist. Park 1 $240.00 $240.00 $270.00 $270.00
and McCully Dist. Park
and Ice Palace
6-23-12 to Manoa Valley Dist. Park 1 $320.00 $320.00 $270.00 $270.00
and McCully Dist. Park
and Kualoa Park
7-14-12 to Manoa Valley Dist. Park 1 $240.00 $240.00 $270.00 $270.00
and McCully Dist. Park
and Hickam Bowling Ctr.
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 5 NO BID $3,881.00 $4,050.00 NO BID
6. KAPAOLONO COMMUNITY PARK
701 11th Avenue (733-7370)
(Children)
6-21-12 to Chuck E. Cheese (Pearl City) 3 $250.00 $750.00 $302.00 $906.00
7-05-12  |to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $320.00 $960.00 $302.00 $906.00
7-12-12  |to Hickam Bowling Center 3 $250.00 $750.00 $302.00 $906.00
(Children) Shuttle Excursions
6-28-12 to Honolulu Zoo 1 $250.00 $250.00 $302.00 $302.00
(Teens)
7-26-12 to Kahala Comm. Park 1 $250.00 $250.00 $302.00 $302.00
and Ala Moana Hotel
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 6 NO BID $2,960.00 $3,322.00 NO BID
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7. KILAUEA DISTRICT PARK
4109 Kilauea Avenue (733-7355)
(Teens)
6-15-12 to Palolo Valley Dist. Park 1 $250.00 $250.00 $299.00 $299.00
and Paki Community Pk.
and Ice Palace
6-23-12 to Palolo Valley Dist. Park 1 $320.00 $320.00 $299.00 $299.00
and Paki Community Pk.
and Kualoa Regional Park
7-14-12 to Palolo Valley Dist. Park 1 $250.00 $250.00 $299.00 $299.00
and Paki Community Pk.
and Hickam Bowling Ctr.
7-26-12  |to Wilson Community Park 1 $250.00 $250.00 $299.00 $299.00
and Ala Moana Hotel
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 7 NO BID $1,070.00 $1,196.00 NO BID
8. KOKO HEAD DISTRICT PARK
423 Kaumakani Street (395-3096)
(Children)
6-22-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 4 $415.00 $1,660.00 $399.00 $1,596.00
6-26-12 to Chuck E. Cheese (Dillingham) 4 $380.00 $1,520.00 $399.00 $1,596.00
7-10-12 to Gunstock Ranch 4 $450.00 $1,800.00 $399.00 $1,596.00
(Teens)
6-15-12 to Aina Haina Com. Park 1 $380.00 $380.00 $399.00 $399.00
and Ice Palace
6-22-12 from Wet 'n Wild Water Park 1 $298.00 $298.00 $399.00 $399.00
to Kamiloiki Community Park
and Koko Head District Park
(one-way return from Water Park with drop off at Kamiloiki)
6-23-12 to Aina Haina Com. Park 1 $400.00 $400.00 $399.00 $399.00




Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
and Kualoa Regional Park
7-14-12 to Aina Haina Com. Park 1 $380.00 $380.00 $399.00 $399.00
and Hickam Bowling Ctr.
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 8 NO BID $6,438.00 $6,384.00 NO BID
9. MANOA VALLEY DISTRICT PARK
2721 Kaaipu Avenue (988-0580) (pick-up at gym parking lot off of Manoa Road)
(Children)
6-14-12 to Kualoa Beach Park 7 $320.00 $2,240.00 $256.00 $1,792.00
6-28-12 to Dave & Busters 7 $240.00 $1,680.00 $256.00 $1,792.00
and Ward Theaters
7-19-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 7 $300.00 $2,100.00 $256.00 $1,792.00
(Teens)
7-19-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 1 $300.00 $300.00 $256.00 $256.00
7-26-12 to McCully District Park 3 $250.00 $750.00 $256.00 $768.00
and Ala Moana Hotel
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 9 NO BID $7,070.00 $6,400.00 NO BID
10. McCULLY DISTRICT PARK
831 Pumehana Street (973-7271)
(Children)
6-15-12 to Kualoa Beach Park 3 $320.00 $960.00 $269.00 $807.00
6-22-12 to Ice Palace 3 $240.00 $720.00 $269.00 $807.00
6-29-12 to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $240.00 $720.00 $269.00 $807.00
(Dillingham location)
7-20-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 3 $300.00 $900.00 $269.00 $807.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 10 NO BID $3,300.00 $3,228.00 NO BID
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1. PAKI COMMUNITY PARK

3503 Leahi Avenue (733-7368)

(Children)
6-26-12 to Ice Palace 3 $240.00 $720.00 $269.00 $807.00
7-20-12 to Wet 'n Wild Water Park 3 $300.00 $900.00 $269.00 $807.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 11 NO BID $1,620.00 $1,614.00 NO BID
12. PALOLO VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

2007 Palolo Avenue (733-7358)

(Children)
6-21-12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $398.00 $1,194.00 $303.00 $909.00
7-05-12 to Ice Palace 3 $250.00 $750.00 $303.00 $909.00

(Teens)
7-26-12  |to Kanewai Comm. Park 1 $250.00 $250.00 $303.00 $303.00

and Ala Moana Hotel

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 12 NO BID $2,194.00 $2,121.00 NO BID
13. WILSON COMMUNITY PARK

4901 Kilauea Avenue (733-7367)

(Children)
6-20-12 to Ice Palace 3 $270.00 $810.00 $285.00 $855.00
6-27-12 to Bay View Mini-Golf 3 $325.00 $975.00 $285.00 $855.00
7-11-12 to Waimea Bay Beach Pk. 3 $398.00 $1,194.00 $285.00 $855.00
7-18-12 to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $270.00 $810.00 $285.00 $855.00

(Dillingham location)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 13 NO BID $3,789.00 $3,420.00 NO BID
14. AIEA DISTRICT PARK
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99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7859)
(Children)
6/21/2012 |to Sea Life Park 3 $322.50 $967.50 $300.00 $900.00 $299.00 $897.00 $285.00 $855.00
6/28/2012 |to Sea Life Park 3 $322.50 $967.50 $300.00 $900.00 $299.00 $897.00 $285.00 $855.00
7/5/2012  |to Haleiwa Surf Center 6 $320.00 $1,920.00 $398.00 $2,388.00 $299.00 $1,794.00 $285.00 $1,710.00
7/19/2012 |to Ice Palace 6 $298.00 $1,788.00 $220.00 $1,320.00 $299.00 $1,794.00 $180.00 $1,080.00
7/23/2012 |to Honolulu Zoo 5 $298.00 $1,490.00 $220.00 $1,100.00 $299.00 $1,495.00 $195.00 $975.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 14 $7,133.00 $6,608.00 $6,877.00 $5,475.00
15. ALA PUUMALU COMMUNITY PARK
1575 Ala Puumalu Street (831-7231)
(Children)
6/19/2012 |to Aina Moana (Magic Isl.) 2 $298.00 $596.00 $240.00 $480.00 $270.00 $540.00
6/26/2012 |to Kualoa Regional Park 2 $322.50 $645.00 $310.00 $620.00 $270.00 $540.00
7/10/2012 |to Honolulu Zoo 2 $298.00 $596.00 $240.00 $480.00 $270.00 $540.00
7/17/2012 |to Ice Palace 2 $298.00 $596.00 $240.00 $480.00 $270.00 $540.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 15 $2,433.00 $2,060.00 $2,160.00 NO BID
16. BERETANIA COMMUNITY PARK
1290 Aala Street (522-7022)
(Children)
6/20/2012 |to Ice Palace 3 $298.00 $894.00 $240.00 $720.00 $260.00 $780.00
6/27/2012 |to Kuhio Beach 3 $298.00 $894.00 $240.00 $720.00 $260.00 $780.00
7/11/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 3 $350.00 $1,050.00 $398.00 $1,194.00 $260.00 $780.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 16 $2,838.00 $2,634.00 $2,340.00 NO BID
17. BOOTH DISTRICT PARK
2331 Kanealii Avenue (522-7040)
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(Children)
6/22/2012 |to K-Bay Lanes 4 $290.00 $1,160.00 $240.00 $960.00
6/26/2012 |to Regal Theaters 4 $240.00 $960.00 $240.00 $960.00
7/6/2012  |to Wet n’ Wild Hawaii 4 $300.00 $1,200.00 $240.00 $960.00
7/25/2012 |to Ice Palace 4 $240.00 $960.00 $240.00 $960.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 17 NO BID $4,280.00 $3,840.00 NO BID
18. FERN COMMUNITY PARK
1201 Middle Street (832-7809)
(Children)
7/17/2012 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $320.00 $640.00 $380.00 $760.00 $385.00 $770.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 18 $640.00 $760.00 $770.00 NO BID
19. HALAWA DISTRICT PARK
99-795 Iwaiwa Street (483-7852)
(Children)
6/14/2012 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $310.00 $930.00 $360.00 $1,080.00 $280.00 $840.00 $285.00 $855.00
7/5/2012  |to Salt Lake District Park 3 $288.00 $864.00 $225.00 $675.00 $280.00 $840.00 $180.00 $540.00
7/12/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $398.00 $1,194.00 $280.00 $840.00 $295.00 $885.00
7/24/2012 |to Wet n’ Wild Hawaii 3 $298.00 $894.00 $290.00 $870.00 $280.00 $840.00 $230.00 $690.00
(Shuttle Service)
6/22/2012 |to Ice Palace 1 $330.00 $330.00 $235.00 $235.00 $280.00 $280.00 $195.00 $195.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 19 $4,038.00 $4,054.00 $3,640.00 $3,165.00
20. KALAKAUA DISTRICT PARK
720 Mcneill Street (832-7801)
(Children)
6/20/2012 |to Ice Palace 2 $225.00 $450.00 $250.00 $500.00
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6/27/2012 |to Honolulu Zoo 2 $245.00 $490.00 $250.00 $500.00
7/11/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 2 $398.00 $796.00 $250.00 $500.00
7/18/2012 |to Wet n’ Wild Hawaii 3 $295.00 $885.00 $250.00 $750.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 20 NO BID $2,621.00 $2,250.00 NO BID
21, KALIHI UKA COMMUNITY PARK

2329 Kalihi Street (832-7807)

(Children)
7/3/2012  |to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $340.00 $680.00 $285.00 $570.00
7/25/2012 |to Sea Life Park 2 $300.00 $600.00 $285.00 $570.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 21 NO BID $1,280.00 $1,140.00 NO BID
22, KALIHI VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

1911 Kamehameha 1V Road (832-7812)

(Children)
6/20/2012 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $235.00 $705.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 22 NO BID $1,020.00 $705.00 NO BID
23. KAMEHAMEHA COMMUNITY PARK

1400 Kalihi Street (832-7811)

(Children)
6/14/2012 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $275.00 $825.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 23 NO BID $1,020.00 $825.00 NO BID
24, LANAKILA DISTRICT PARK

1701 Lanakila Avenue (832-7820)

(Children)
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6/19/2012 |to Regal Theaters 2 $225.00 $450.00 $240.00 $480.00 $210.00 $420.00
6/29/2012 |to K-Bay Lanes 2 $290.00 $580.00 $240.00 $480.00 $280.00 $560.00
7/11/2012 |to Regal Theaters 2 $225.00 $450.00 $240.00 $480.00 $210.00 $420.00
7/18/2012 |to Ice Palace 3 $225.00 $675.00 $240.00 $720.00 $210.00 $630.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 24 NO BID $2,155.00 $2,160.00 $2,030.00
25, MAKIKI DISTRICT PARK
1527 Keeaumoku Street (522-7082)
(Children)
6/22/2012 |to Camp Kualoa 4 $310.00 $1,240.00 $239.00 $956.00
6/29/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 4 $398.00 $1,592.00 $239.00 $956.00
7/13/2012 |to Ice Palace 4 $240.00 $960.00 $239.00 $956.00
7/20/2012 |to Ward Theaters 4 $240.00 $960.00 $239.00 $956.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 25 NO BID $4,752.00 $3,824.00 NO BID
26. MOANALUA COMMUNITY PARK
2900 Moanalua Road (831-7105)
(Children)
6/21/2012 |to Ice Palace 3 $298.00 $894.00 $225.00 $675.00 $260.00 $780.00 $210.00 $630.00
7/19/2012 |to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $320.00 $960.00 $300.00 $900.00 $260.00 $780.00 $280.00 $840.00
7/24/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 3 $350.00 $1,050.00 $398.00 $1,194.00 $260.00 $780.00 $290.00 $870.00
(Shuttle Service)
6/28/2012 |to Fort Shafter Bowling Alley 1 $375.00 $375.00 $240.00 $240.00 $260.00 $260.00 $230.00 $230.00
7/5/2012  |to Salt Lake District Park 1 $375.00 $375.00 $240.00 $240.00 $260.00 $260.00 $230.00 $230.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 26 $3,654.00 $3,249.00 $2,860.00 $2,800.00
27. PU’UNUI COMMUNITY PARK
2555 Pu’unui Avenue (595-2460)
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6/15/2012 |to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $325.00 $650.00 $260.00 $520.00 $285.00 $570.00
6/29/2012 |to Kualoa Regional Park 2 $290.00 $580.00 $260.00 $520.00 $285.00 $570.00
7/6/2012  |to Wet n’ Wild Hawaii 2 $290.00 $580.00 $260.00 $520.00 $220.00 $440.00
7/25/2012 |to Ice Palace 2 $240.00 $480.00 $260.00 $520.00 $210.00 $420.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 27 NO BID $2,290.00 $2,080.00 $2,000.00
28. SALT LAKE DISTRICT PARK
1159 Ala Lilikoi Place (831-7100)
(Children)
6/21/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 6 $398.00 $2,388.00 $246.00 $1,476.00 $295.00 $1,770.00
6/27/2012 |to Ice Palace 6 $225.00 $1,350.00 $246.00 $1,476.00 $210.00 $1,260.00
7/12/2012 |to Wet n’ Wild Hawaii 6 $250.00 $1,500.00 $246.00 $1,476.00 $220.00 $1,320.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 28 NO BID $5,238.00 $4,428.00 $4,350.00
29, SHERIDAN COMMUNITY PARK
833 Piikoi Street (592-7041)
(Children)
7/13/2012 |to Ice Palace 2 $240.00 $480.00 $235.00 $470.00
(Shuttle Service)
6/29/2012 |to Honolulu Zoo 1 $240.00 $240.00 $235.00 $235.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 29 NO BID $720.00 $705.00 NO BID
30. STEVENSON RECREATION CENTER
1202 Prospect Street (522-7043)
(Children)
6/29/2012 |to Gunstock Ranch 1 $398.00 $398.00 $269.00 $269.00
7/6/2012  |to Ice Palace 1 $240.00 $240.00 $269.00 $269.00
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Gomes School Bus Service,

Ground Transport, Inc.

Robert's Hawaii School Bus,

Tomasa's Bus Company

Ltd.

Inc.

Inc.

Item No.
& Date
Of Trip

Program Area, Destination

estimated

BID PRICES

BID PRICES

BID PRICES

BID PRICES

no. of

Per

Per

Per

Per

Buses

Bus

Total

Bus

Total

Bus

Total

Bus

Total

7/16/2012

to Haleiwa Surf Center

$310.00

$310.00

$269.00

$269.00

7/20/2012

to Ward Theaters

$240.00

$240.00

$269.00

$269.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 30

NO BID

$1,188.00

$1,076.00

NO BID

31.

AIEA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

Aiea Complex Office: 99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7860)

Aiea District Park: 99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7859)

Salt Lake District Park: 1150 Ala Lilikoi Place (831-7101)

(Teens)

7/26/2012

Pick up from Salt Lake / Aiea

$370.00

$370.00

$290.00

$290.00

$320.00

$320.00

to Hawaii Okinawan Center

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 31

$370.00

$290.00

$320.00

NO BID

32.

BOOTH COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

Booth Complex Office: 2331 Kaneali’i Avenue (595-2203)

Booth District Park: 2331 Kaneali’i Avenue (522-7040) |

Lanakila District Park: 1701 Kanakila Avenue (832-7820)

(Teens)

7/26/2012

Pick up from Booth / Lanakila

$290.00

$290.00

$300.00

$300.00

to Hawaii Okinawan Center

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 32

NO BID

$290.00

$300.00

NO BID

33.

HALAWA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

Halawa Complex Office: 99-795 Iwaiwa Street (483-7850)

Fern Community Park: 1201 Middle Street (832-7809)

Halawa District Park: 99-795 Iwaiwa Street (483-7850)

Moanalua Community Park: 2900 Moanalua Road (831-7105)

(Teens) |
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.

Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
7/26/2012 |Pick up from Fern / Moanalua / Halawa 1 $370.00 $370.00 $290.00 $290.00 $300.00 $300.00

to Hawaii Okinawan Center
7/27/2012 |Pick up from Fern / Moanalua / Halawa 1 $540.00 $540.00 $560.00 $560.00 $300.00 $300.00

to Kualoa Regional Park *
7/29/2012 *|Return back from Kualoa Regional Park

* Return trip is 2 days later

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 33 $910.00 $850.00 $600.00 NO BID
34. KALAKAUA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

Kalakaua Complex Office: 720 McNeill Street (832-7800)

Kalakaua District Park: 720 McNeill Street (832-7800) |

Beretania Community Park: 1290 Aala Street (522-7022)

(Teens)
7/26/2012 |Pick up from Beretania / Kalakaua 1 $290.00 $290.00 $300.00 $300.00

to Hawaii Okinawan Center

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 34 NO BID $290.00 $300.00 NO BID
35. KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

Kalihi Valley Complex Office: 1911 Kamehameha IV Road (832-7811)

Kalihi Valley District Park: 1911 Kamehameha IV Road (832-7811)

Kalihi Uka Community Park: 2329 Kalihi Street (832-7807) ||

Kamehameha Community Park: 1400 Kalihi Street {Enter thru Lohilani Street} (832-7819)

(Teens)
7/28/2012 |Pick up from Kamehameha / 1 $310.00 $310.00 $260.00 $260.00

Kalihi Uka / Kalihi Valley

to Wet n’ Wild Hawaii
7/26/2012 |Pick up from Kamehameha / 1 $290.00 $290.00 $260.00 $260.00

Kalihi Uka / Kalihi Valley

to Hawaii Okinawan Center
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 35 NO BID $600.00 $520.00 NO BID
36. MAKIKI COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM
Makiki Complex Office: 1527 Keeaumoku Street (522-7084)
Makiki District Park: 1527 Keeaumoku Street (522-7082)
Sheridan Community Park: 833 Piikoi Street (592-7041) |
Stevenson Recreation Center: 1202 Prospect Street (522-7043
(Teens)
7/26/2012  |Pick up from Sheridan / Makiki / Stevenson 1 $290.00 $290.00 $300.00 $300.00
to Hawaii Okinawan Center
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 36 NO BID $290.00 $300.00 NO BID
37. ASING COMMUNITY PARK
91-1450 Renton Road (681-6435)
(Children)
06/21/12  |to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $385.00 $1,155.00 $399.00 $1,197.00 $290.00 $870.00
06/28/12  |to Gunstock Ranch 3 $410.00 $1,230.00 $399.00 $1,197.00 $300.00 $900.00
07/05/12  |to Ice Palace 3 $280.00 $840.00 $399.00 $1,197.00 $210.00 $630.00
07/19/12  |to Waimea Bay Beach Park 3 $325.00 $975.00 $399.00 $1,197.00 $290.00 $870.00
(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings
06/13/12  |to Makakilo Pool 1 $220.00 $220.00 $399.00 $399.00 $195.00 $195.00
06/20/12  |to Makakilo Pool 1 $220.00 $220.00 $399.00 $399.00 $195.00 $195.00
07/11/12  |to Makakilo Pool 1 $220.00 $220.00 $399.00 $399.00 $195.00 $195.00
07/18/12  |to Makakilo Pool 1 $220.00 $220.00 $399.00 $399.00 $195.00 $195.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 37 NO BID $5,080.00 $6,384.00 $4,050.00
38. CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK (Lower)
94-1220 Lumikula Street (671-4838)
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
(Children)
6/27/12 to Wet & Wild 2 $259.00 $518.00 $299.00 $598.00 $220.00 $440.00
7112/12 to Chuck E Cheese 2 $250.00 $500.00 $299.00 $598.00 $210.00 $420.00
7/18/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 2 $385.00 $770.00 $299.00 $598.00 $290.00 $580.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 38 NO BID $1,788.00 $1,794.00 $1,440.00
39. CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK (Upper)
94-1220 Lumikula Street (671-4838)
(Children)
6/27/12 to Wet & Wild 2 $259.00 $518.00 $299.00 $598.00 $220.00 $440.00
7112/12 to Ice Palace 2 $260.00 $520.00 $299.00 $598.00 $210.00 $420.00
7/18/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 2 $385.00 $770.00 $299.00 $598.00 $285.00 $570.00
(Childrens Shuttle for S wimming Outings)
06/20/12  |to Waikele Community Park 1 $220.00 $220.00 $299.00 $299.00 $200.00 $200.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 39 NO BID $2,028.00 $2,093.00 $1,630.00
40. EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK
91-955 North Road (689-0370)
(Children)
6/20/12 to Honolulu Zoo 3 $399.00 $1,197.00 $210.00 $630.00
6/27/12 to Kapolei Theaters 3 $399.00 $1,197.00 $200.00 $600.00
to Kapolei Regional Park
7112/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $399.00 $1,197.00 $290.00 $870.00
7/18/12 to Bishop Museum 3 $399.00 $1,197.00 $200.00 $600.00
(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings
6/18/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
6/25/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
712112 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 40 NO BID NO BID $5,985.00 $3,300.00
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
41. Ewa Mahiko District Park
91-120 Renton Road (681-6435)
(Children)
6/19/12 to Waimea Bay Beach Park 6 $399.00 $2,394.00 $290.00 $1,740.00
71312 to Pearlridge Theaters 6 $399.00 $2,394.00 $220.00 $1,320.00
to Neal Blaisdell Park
7/10/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 6 $399.00 $2,394.00 $290.00 $1,740.00
717112 to Polynesian CC 6 $399.00 $2,394.00 $310.00 $1,860.00
(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings
6/21/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
6/28/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
7112/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
7/19/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $399.00 $399.00 $200.00 $200.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 41 NO BID NO BID $11,172.00 $7,460.00
42, EWA TEEN COMPLEX
91-1450 Renton Road (6871-6435)
(Teen)
7/13/12 Ewa Mahiko District Park 1 $399.00 $399.00 $290.00 $290.00
to McCoy Pavillion
7/13/12 Asing Community Park 1 $399.00 $399.00 $290.00 $290.00
to McCoy Pavillion
7/25/12 Makakilo Community Park 1 $399.00 $399.00 $290.00 $290.00
to Haleiwa Beach Park
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 42 NO BID NO BID $1,197.00 $870.00
43. HO'AE’AE COMMUNITY PARK
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
97-709 Kaaholo Street (676-8832)
(Children)
6/22/12 to San Souci Beach Park 3 $280.00 $840.00 $319.00 $957.00 $220.00 $660.00
6/27/12 to San Souci Beach Park 3 $280.00 $840.00 $319.00 $957.00 $220.00 $660.00
7/10/12 to Ice Palace 2 $260.00 $520.00 $319.00 $638.00 $210.00 $420.00
to Ala Moana Beach Park 2 $260.00 $520.00 $319.00 $638.00 $220.00 $440.00
7/23/12 to San Souci Beach Park 3 $280.00 $840.00 $319.00 $957.00 $220.00 $660.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 43 NO BID $3,560.00 $4,147.00 $2,840.00
44, MAILI COMMUNITY PARK
87-360 Kualaaupuni Street (696-4766)
(Children)
6/20/12 to Ice Palace 3 $563.00 $1,689.00
to Chuck E. Cheese 1 $563.00 $563.00
6/27/12 to Gunstock Ranch 4 $563.00 $2,252.00
7/11/12 to Pearl Highland Theater 4 $563.00 $2,252.00
7/18/12 to Wet & Wild 4 $563.00 $2,252.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 44 NO BID NO BID $9,008.00 NO BID
45, MAKAHA COMMUNITY PARK
84-730 Manaku Street(696-5039)
(Children)
6/19/12 to Ice Palace 2 $617.00 $1,234.00
to Glow Putt 2 $617.00 $1,234.00
7/3/12 to Wet & Wild 3 $617.00 $1,851.00
7/17/12 to Gunstock Ranch 3 $617.00 $1,851.00
7/24/12 to Honolulu Zoo 3 $617.00 $1,851.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 45 NO BID NO BID $8,021.00 NO BID
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
46. MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK
92-1140 MAKAKILO DRIVE (672-8465)
(Children)
6/15/12 to Chuck E. Cheese 7 $380.00 $2,660.00 $378.00 $2,646.00 $220.00 $1,540.00
6/22/12 to Ft. Shafter Bowl 7 $380.00 $2,660.00 $378.00 $2,646.00 $230.00 $1,610.00
7/6/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 7 $350.00 $2,450.00 $378.00 $2,646.00 $290.00 $2,030.00
7/13/12 to Kokololio Beach Park 7 $350.00 $2,450.00 $378.00 $2,646.00 $320.00 $2,240.00
(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings
6/26/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $400.00 $400.00 $378.00 $378.00 $230.00 $230.00
7/10/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $400.00 $400.00 $378.00 $378.00 $230.00 $230.00
717112 to Makakilo Pool 1 $400.00 $400.00 $378.00 $378.00 $230.00 $230.00
7124/12 to Makakilo Pool 1 $400.00 $400.00 $378.00 $378.00 $230.00 $230.00
(Teen)
6/21/12 to Ward Theaters 1 $350.00 $350.00 $378.00 $378.00 $280.00 $280.00
6/28/12 to Ice Palace 1 $310.00 $310.00 $378.00 $378.00 $280.00 $280.00
7/6/12 to Podium Raceway 1 $260.00 $260.00 $378.00 $378.00 $260.00 $260.00
7/13/12 to McCoy Pavillion 1 $350.00 $350.00 $378.00 $378.00 $290.00 $290.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 46 NO BID $13,090.00 $13,608.00 $9,450.00
47. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK-LOWER DIVISION
94-1150 Lanikuhana Avenue (623-5258)
(Children)
6/26/12 to Gunstock Ranch 5 $410.00 $2,050.00 $389.00 $1,945.00
713112 to Alii Beach Park 5 $360.00 $1,800.00 $389.00 $1,945.00
7/10/12 to Chuck E. Cheese 5 $260.00 $1,300.00 $389.00 $1,945.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 47 NO BID $5,150.00 $5,835.00 NO BID
48. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK-UPPER DIVISION
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
94-1150 Lanikuhana Avenue (623-5258)
(Children)
6/18/12 to Ice Palace 4 $260.00 $1,040.00 $382.00 $1,528.00
6/28/12 to Kualoa Ranch 4 $400.00 $1,600.00 $382.00 $1,528.00
7/3/12 to Wet N' Wild 4 $270.00 $1,080.00 $382.00 $1,528.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 48 NO BID $3,720.00 $4,584.00 NO BID
49. MILILANI COMPLEX TEENS
94-1150 Lanikuhana Ave. (623-5258)
(Teen)
7/13/12 Mililani DP 1 $320.00 $320.00 $389.00 $389.00
to Crestview CP
to Waikele CP
to McCoy Pavillion
7/26/12 Mililani DP 1 $285.00 $285.00 $389.00 $389.00
to Crestview CP
to Waikele CP
to Wet N' Wild
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 49 NO BID $605.00 $778.00 NO BID
50. NANAKULI BEACH PARK
89-269 Farrington Hwy. (668-1137)
(Children)
6/22/12 to Living Art Marine Center 3 $543.00 $1,629.00
to Honolulu Zoo 2 $543.00 $1,086.00
6/29/12 to Living Art Marine Center 3 $543.00 $1,629.00
to Windward Community College 1 $543.00 $543.00
to Haunauma Bay Preserve 1 $543.00 $543.00
7/6/12 to Mililani Theaters 5 $543.00 $2,715.00
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
to Mililani Mauka District Park
7/20/12 to Wet N' Wild 5 $543.00 $2,715.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 50 NO BID NO BID $10,860.00 NO BID
51. PACIFIC PALISADES COMMUNITY PARK
2282 Auhuhu Street (453-7557)
P/U Palisades Elementary School Parking Lot
(Children)
71112 to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $410.00 $1,230.00 $321.00 $963.00 $300.00 $900.00
7/18/12 to Ice Palace 3 $300.00 $900.00 $321.00 $963.00 $200.00 $600.00
7/25/12 to Haleiwa Alii BP - West end 3 $390.00 $1,170.00 $321.00 $963.00 $300.00 $900.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 51 NO BID $3,300.00 $2,889.00 $2,400.00
52. PEARL CITY DISTRICT PARK
785 Hoomaemae Street (453-7550)
(Children)
6/22/12 to Waimea Bay Beach Park 5 $390.00 $1,950.00 $399.00 $1,995.00 $290.00 $1,450.00
6/29/12 to Kailua Beach Park 5 $340.00 $1,700.00 $399.00 $1,995.00 $290.00 $1,450.00
7/13/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 5 $390.00 $1,950.00 $399.00 $1,995.00 $290.00 $1,450.00
7/20/12 to Ice Palace 5 $275.00 $1,375.00 $399.00 $1,995.00 $180.00 $900.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 52 NO BID $6,975.00 $7,980.00 $5,250.00
53. PEARL CITY COMPLEX TEENS
785 Hoomaemae Street (453-7551)
(Teens)
6/22/12 Pearl City District Park 1 $390.00 $390.00 $525.00 $525.00 $260.00 $260.00
to Kualoa Regional Park
7/13/12 Pearl City District Park 1 $280.00 $280.00 $525.00 $525.00 $280.00 $280.00
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
to McCoy Pavillion
7/26/12 Pearl City District Park 1 $340.00 $340.00 $525.00 $525.00 $280.00 $280.00
to Sherwood Forest
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 53 NO BID $1,010.00 $1,575.00 $820.00
54. PILILAAU COMMUNITY PARK
85-166 PLANTATION RD (696-4441)
(Children)
6/28/12 to Pearlridge Theaters 4 $433.00 $1,732.00
7/5/12 to Polynesian CC 4 $433.00 $1,732.00
7/12/12 to Pearlridge Theaters 2 $433.00 $866.00
to Ice Palace 3 $433.00 $1,299.00
7/19/12 to Wet N' Wild 4 $433.00 $1,732.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 54 NO BID NO BID $7,361.00 NO BID
55. WAHIAWA DISTRICT PARK
1129 Kilani Avenue (621-5663)
(Children)
6/19/12 to Ala Moana Beach Park 4 $399.00 $1,596.00
7/9/12 to Ice Palace 4 $399.00 $1,596.00
7/24/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 4 $399.00 $1,596.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 55 NO BID NO BID $4,788.00 NO BID
56. WAHIAWA COMPLEX TEENS
1129 Kilani Avenue (621-5663)
(Teens)
7/27/12 to Wet & Wild 1 $399.00 $399.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 56 NO BID NO BID $399.00 NO BID
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Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.

Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
57. WAIANAE DISTRICT PARK

85-601 Farrington Hwy. (696-5039)

(children)
6/25/12 to Ice Palace 2 $454.00 $908.00

to Living Art Marine Center 3 $454.00 $1,362.00
7/2/12 to Gunstock Ranch 5 $454.00 $2,270.00
7/9/12 to Honolulul Zoo 2 $454.00 $908.00

to Living Art Marine Center 3 $454.00 $1,362.00
7/13/12 to Wet N' Wild 5 $454.00 $2,270.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 57 NO BID NO BID $9,080.00 NO BID
58. WAIANAE COMPLEX TEENS

85-601 Farrington Hwy. (696-5039)

(Teens)
7/13/12 Waianae District Park 1 $519.00 $519.00

to Nanakuli Beach Park

to McCoy Pavillion

Waianae District Park 2 $519.00 $1,038.00

to McCoy Pavillion
7/27/2012 [Waianae District Park 1 $519.00 $519.00

to Nanakuli Beach Park

to Wet N' Wild

Waianae District Park 2 $519.00 $1,038.00

to Wet N' Wild

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 58 NO BID NO BID $3,114.00 NO BID
59. WAIAU DISTRICT PARK
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PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.
Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
98-1650 Kaahumanu Street (453-7555)
(Children)
6/19/12 to Ice Palace 1 $298.00 $298.00 $240.00 $240.00 $538.00 $538.00 $210.00 $210.00
to Chuck E. Cheese 2 $298.00 $596.00 $240.00 $480.00 $538.00 $1,076.00 $210.00 $420.00
6/26/12 to Kailua Beach Park 3 $322.50 $967.50 $300.00 $900.00 $538.00 $1,614.00 $290.00 $870.00
7/10/12 to Kokololio Beach Park 3 $305.00 $915.00 $320.00 $960.00 $538.00 $1,614.00 $320.00 $960.00
717112 to Waimea Beach Park 3 $335.00 $1,005.00 $380.00 $1,140.00 $538.00 $1,614.00 $290.00 $870.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 59 $3,781.50 $3,720.00 $6,456.00 $3,330.00
60. WAIKELE COMMUNITY PARK
94-870 Lumiaina Street (678-0871)
(Children)
6/19/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $345.00 $690.00 $499.00 $998.00 $295.00 $590.00
6/25/12 to Hanauma Bay 2 $300.00 $600.00 $499.00 $998.00 $310.00 $620.00
7/10/12 to Magic Island 2 $250.00 $500.00 $499.00 $998.00 $210.00 $420.00
7124/12 to Ice Palace 2 $245.00 $490.00 $499.00 $998.00 $200.00 $400.00
(Children Shuttle)
717112 to Central Oahu RP Tennis Court 1 $240.00 $240.00 $499.00 $499.00 $200.00 $200.00
7/25/12 to Chuck E. Cheese 1 $240.00 $240.00 $499.00 $499.00 $210.00 $210.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 60 NO BID $2,760.00 $4,990.00 $2,440.00
61. WAIPAHU DISTRICT PARK
94-230 Paiwa Street (675-7129)
(Children)
6/22/12 to Ala Moana Beach Park 3 $300.00 $900.00 $320.00 $960.00
6/29/12 to Waimea Bay 3 $389.00 $1,167.00 $320.00 $960.00
7/6/12 to Kalama Beach Park 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $320.00 $960.00
7/20/12 to Kokololio Beach Park 3 $350.00 $1,050.00 $320.00 $960.00
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Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 61 NO BID $4,137.00 $3,840.00 NO BID
62. WAIPAHU COMPLEX TEENS

94-230 Paiwa Street (676-7855)

(Teens)
713112 Hoaeae CP 1 $420.00 $420.00 $400.00 $400.00

to Waipahu DP

to Ala Moana Hotel

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 62 NO BID $420.00 $400.00 NO BID
63. WHITMORE COMMUNITY PARK

1259 Whitmore Avenue (622-2420)

(Children)
6/26/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $383.00 $766.00
7/11/12 to Honolulu Zoo 2 $383.00 $766.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 63 NO BID NO BID $1,532.00 NO BID
64. AHUIMANU COMMUNITY PARK

47-450 Hui Aeko Place (239-6594)

(Children)
6/20/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 4 $280.00 $1,120.00 $499.00 $1,996.00
7/13/12 to Gunstock Ranch 4 $290.00 $1,160.00 $499.00 $1,996.00
7/18/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 4 $300.00 $1,200.00 $499.00 $1,996.00

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings
6/28/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $310.00 $310.00 $499.00 $499.00
7/5/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $310.00 $310.00 $499.00 $499.00
7112/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $310.00 $310.00 $499.00 $499.00

(Children) Shuttles




25

Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DPR-475818

Regn No.: RQM-DPR-1200044

OPENED: January 27, 2012

By: RM & GT
Gomes School Bus Service, Ground Transport, Inc. Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Tomasa's Bus Company
Ltd. Inc. Inc.

Item No. estimated BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES BID PRICES
& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total Bus Total
7/20/12 to Windward Community 1 $310.00 $310.00 $499.00 $499.00

College

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 64 $4,720.00 NO BID $7,984.00 NO BID
65. AIKAHI SUMMER FUN

281 llihau Street (266-7655)

(Children)
6/13/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $285.00 $855.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
7/11/12 to Ho'omaluhia Regional Park 3 $280.00 $840.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
717112 to Honolulu Zoo 2 $294.00 $588.00 $499.00 $998.00
717112 to Ice Palace 2 $294.00 $588.00 $499.00 $998.00

(Children) Shuttle for Bowling
6/27/12 to KMCBH K-Bay Lanes 1 $315.00 $315.00 $499.00 $499.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 65 $3,186.00 NO BID $5,489.00 NO BID
66. Enchanted Lake /Community Park

770 Keolu Drive, Kailua, HI 96734

(Children)
6/22/12 to Hickam Bowling Alley 3 $294.00 $882.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
6/29/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $330.00 $990.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
7/13/12 to Ice Palace 3 $294.00 $882.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
7/20/12 to Chuck E Cheese 3 $294.00 $882.00 $499.00 $1,497.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 66 $3,636.00 NO BID $5,988.00 NO BID
67. HAUULA COMMUNITY PARK

54-040 Kam.Hwy. Hauula 96717

(Children)
6/22/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $310.00 $930.00 $650.00 $1,950.00
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6/29/12 Hickam AFB Bowling Alley 3 $330.00 $990.00 $650.00 $1,950.00
7/13/12 Honolulu Zoo 3 $335.00 $1,005.00 $650.00 $1,950.00
7/20/12 ChuckE Cheeses 3 $330.00 $990.00 $650.00 $1,950.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 67 $3,915.00 NO BID $7,800.00 NO BID
68. HEEIA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

46-202 Haiku Road (233-7335)

(Children)
6/21/12 to Ice Palace 5 $294.00 $1,470.00 $653.00 $3,265.00
6/25/12 to Gunstock Ranch 5 $298.00 $1,490.00 $653.00 $3,265.00
71112 to Haleiwa Surf Center 5 $310.00 $1,550.00 $653.00 $3,265.00

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming
6/19/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00 $653.00 $653.00
713112 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00 $653.00 $653.00
717112 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00 $653.00 $653.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 68 $5,590.00 NO BID $11,754.00 NO BID
69. Kahuku District Park/Kahuku High School Gym

56-576 Kam.Hwy. Kahuku HI 96731

(Children)
6/21/12 Honolulu Zoo 3 $365.00 $1,095.00 $625.00 $1,875.00
6/28/12 Schofield Bowling Alley 3 $360.00 $1,080.00 $625.00 $1,875.00
7112/12 Kualoa Regional Park 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $625.00 $1,875.00
7/19/12 Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $625.00 $1,875.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 69 $4,215.00 NO BID $7,500.00 NO BID
70. KAILUA SUMMER FUN

315 Kuulei Road (266-7650)
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(Children)
6/26/12 to Polynesian Cultural Center 3 $325.00 $975.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
6/26/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $320.00 $960.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
7/03/12 to KMCBH K-Bay Lanes 5 $288.00 $1,440.00 $499.00 $2,495.00
717112 to Honolulu Zoo 3 $320.00 $960.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
717112 to Ice Palace 3 $320.00 $960.00 $499.00 $1,497.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 70 $5,295.00 NO BID $8,483.00 NO BID
71. KAPUNAHALA NEIGHBORHOOD PARK
45-800 Anoi Road (233-7316)
(Children)
6/19/12 to Ice Palace 5 $320.00 $1,600.00 $499.00 $2,495.00
7/10/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 5 $300.00 $1,500.00 $499.00 $2,495.00
717112 to Chuck-E-Cheese 5 $320.00 $1,600.00 $499.00 $2,495.00
(Dillingham)
(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings
6/29/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00 $499.00 $499.00
7/13/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00 $499.00 $499.00
7/20/12 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00 $499.00 $499.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 71 $5,780.00 NO BID $8,982.00 NO BID
72. LAIE SUMMER FUN/ LAIE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
54-040 Kam.Hwy. Hauula 96717
(Children)
6/27/12 Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $650.00 $1,950.00
7/10/12 Honolulu Zoo 3 $365.00 $1,095.00 $650.00 $1,950.00
7/20/12 Kualoa Regional Park 3 $340.00 $1,020.00 $650.00 $1,950.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 72 $3,135.00 NO BID $5,850.00 NO BID
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73. SUNSET BEACH NEIGHBORHOOD PARK
59-360 Kamehameha Hwy. (638-7213)
(Children)
6/29/12 to Waialua District Park 2 $660.00 $1,320.00
7/5/12 to Gunstock Ranch 2 $660.00 $1,320.00
7/20/12 to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $660.00 $1,320.00
7/25/12 to Kualoa Regional Park 2 $660.00 $1,320.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 73 NO BID NO BID $5,280.00 NO BID
74. WAIALUA DISTRICT PARK
67-180 Goodale Ave Street (637-9721)
(Children)
6/22/12 Waimea Valley 4 $638.00 $2,552.00 $280.00 $1,120.00
6/29/12 Honolulu Zoo 4 $638.00 $2,552.00 $310.00 $1,240.00
7/6/12 Bishop Museum 4 $638.00 $2,552.00 $300.00 $1,200.00
7/20/12 Gunstock Ranch 4 $638.00 $2,552.00 $300.00 $1,200.00
(Teens)
7/126/12 to Kualoa Regional Park
Pick-up at Waialua District Park 67-180 Goodale Ave (637-9721)
and Haleiwa Alii Beach Park 66-167 Haleiwa Rd (637-5051)
and Sunset Beach Neighborhood Park 59-360 Kamehameha Hwy. (637-4106)
1 $638.00 $638.00 $240.00 $240.00
7/127/12 Pick-up at Kualoa Regional Park
to Sunset Beach Neighborhood Park 59-360 Kamehameha Hwy
to Haleiewa Alii Beach Park 66-167 Haleiwa Rd.
to Waialua District Park 67-180 Goodale Ave.
1 $638.00 $638.00 $240.00 $240.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 74 NO BID NO BID $11,484.00 $5,240.00
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75. Waimanalo Beach Park

41-741 Kalanianaole Hwy. (259-9106)

(Children)
6-29-12 to Hoomaluhia 2 $345.00 $690.00 $385.00 $770.00
7-6-12 to Kualoa Regional Park 2 $365.00 $730.00 $385.00 $770.00
7-20-12 to Ice Palace 2 $385.00 $770.00 $385.00 $770.00
7-24-12 to Wet n Wild 2 $425.00 $850.00 $385.00 $770.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 75 $3,040.00 NO BID $3,080.00 NO BID
76. Waimanalo District Park

41-415 Hihimanu St.Waimanalo, HI 96795

(Children)
6/19/12 to Kualoa (Regional Park) 3 $365.00 $1,095.00 $683.00 $2,049.00
7/03/12 to Honolulu Zoo 3 $390.00 $1,170.00 $683.00 $2,049.00
7/10/12 to Ice Palace 3 $385.00 $1,155.00 $683.00 $2,049.00
7/24/12 to Wet N Wild 3 $425.00 $1,275.00 $683.00 $2,049.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 76 $4,695.00 NO BID $8,196.00 NO BID
77. Kahaluu Complex

54-040 Kam.Hwy. Hauula 96717
7/127/12 Hawaiian Waters (Mahalo) 1 $450.00 $450.00 $499.00 $499.00

Pick-up Hauula Community Park 54-050 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5564)

and Laie Elementary School Cafeteria 55-109 Kulanui (233-7314)]

and Kahuku High School Gym 56-490 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5116)

1 $450.00 $450.00 $499.00 $499.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 77 $900.00 NO BID $998.00 NO BID
78. KAI WAI COMPLEX

41-415 Hihimanu St. Waimanalao, HI 96795 259 8015
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(Teens)
712712 to Dave n Busters
Pick-up at Waimanalo District Park, 41-415 Hihimanu ST. (2|59-8926)
and Enchanted Lake Community Park, 770 Keolu Dr. (266-7665)
1 $350.00 $350.00 $499.00 $499.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 78 $350.00 NO BID $499.00 NO BID
79. KANEOHE COMPLEX
45-660 Keaahala Road (233-7309)
(Teens)
712712 to Hawaiian Waters Adventure Park
Pick up at Ahuimanu Community Park, 47-450 Hui Aeko Place (239-6594)
| 1 $395.00 $395.00 $499.00 $499.00
and Kaneohe District Park, 45-660 Keaahala Road (233-7309)
1 $395.00 $395.00 $499.00 $499.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 79 $790.00 NO BID $998.00 NO BID
80. VEHICLE FOR THE HANDICAPPED/DISABLED
VARIOUS PARKS AND RECREATION SITES
various various sites 8 $510.00 $4,080.00 $0.00 $310.00 $2,480.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 80 NO BID $4,080.00 NO BID $2,480.00
Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date
of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




