
CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-451107
DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES
BID OPENING: February 10, 2012
REVISED 4-11-12

QTY: 1

16,988.50$ 16,988.50$

City MPG: N/A

Cost of Fuel: N/A

Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Evaluated Bid : N/A

27,976.64$ 27,976.64$

City MPG: 50

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel

Cost: 4,032.00$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 32,008.640$

17,245.04$ 17,245.04$

City MPG: 28

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 7,200.00$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 24,445.040$

21,947.63$ 21,947.63$ 17,245.04$ 17,245.04$ 27,707.14$ 27,707.14$ 20,039.00$ 20,039.00$

City MPG: 21 City MPG: 28 City MPG: 25 City MPG: 25

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 9,600.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 7,200.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 8,064.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 8,064.00$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 31,547.630$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 24,445.040$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 35,771.140$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 28,103.000$

Total Unit Price Total

ITEM 1:

Unit Price Total Unit Price

Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.

Unit Price

Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl

Total Unit Price

Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID

2012 Ford Focus 4DR Sedan

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

2012 Ford Focus

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Dodge Avenger JSDH41

NO BID

2012 Toyota Prius I C2100

NO BID

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Sonic IJV69

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Sonic IJV69LT

NO BID

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

2012 Ford Focus
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 5

36,539.15$ 182,695.75$ 27,563.00$ 137,815.00$

City MPG: 15 City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel

Cost: 48,200.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 48,200.00$
Total

Evaluated

Bid : 230,895.750$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 186,015.000$

22,655.98$ 113,279.90$ 23,723.00$ 118,615.00$

City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A

Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A

Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Fuel

Cost: N/A

Total Evaluated

Bid : N/A

Total

Evaluated Bid

: N/A

22,698.56$ 113,492.80$ 22,655.98$ 113,279.90$ 22,828.29$ 114,141.45$ 27,165.33$ 135,826.65$

City MPG: 23 City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A City MPG: 22

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 43,826.09$ Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Fuel

Cost: 45,818.18$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 157,318.887$

Total Evaluated

Bid : N/A Total Evaluated Bid : N/A

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 181,644.832$

ITEM 2:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Equinox ILF26 2012 Chevrolet Equinox ILF26

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

2013 Ford Escape

NO BID

2013 Ford Escape-UOF

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Jeep Patriot MKTE74

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Toyota Rav4 T2010

NO BID

NO BID

2013 Ford Escape

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

2013 Ford Escape FWD 4X2

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 1

37,235.49$ 37,235.49$ 27,221.00$ 27,221.00$

City MPG: 15 City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel

Cost: 9,640.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 9,640.00$
Total

Evaluated

Bid : 46,875.490$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 36,861.000$

23,267.43$ 23,267.43$ 24,266.00$ 24,266.00$

City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A

Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A

Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Fuel

Cost: N/A

Total Evaluated

Bid : N/A

Total

Evaluated Bid

: N/A

23,348.82$ 23,348.82$ -$ 23,587.45$ 23,587.45$ 27,728.26$ 27,728.26$

City MPG: 23 City MPG: City MPG: N/A City MPG: 22

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 8,765.22$ Total Fuel Cost: #DIV/0! Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Fuel

Cost: 9,163.64$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 32,114.037$

Total Evaluated

Bid : #DIV/0! Total Evaluated Bid : N/A

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 36,891.896$

ITEM 3:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Equinox ILF26 2012 Chevrolet Equinox ILF26

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

2013 Ford Escape

NO BID

2013 Ford Escape-UOF

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Jeep Patriot MKTE74

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Toyota Rav4 T2010

NO BID

NO BID

2013 Ford Escape FWD

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 4

30,231.09$ 120,924.36$

City MPG: N/A

Cost of Fuel: N/A

Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated

Bid : N/A

29,282.71$ 117,130.84$ 30,231.09$ 120,924.36$ 30,867.74$ 123,470.96$ 30,206.39$ 120,825.56$

City MPG: 17 City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A City MPG: 18

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 47,435.29$ Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Fuel

Cost: 44,800.00$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 164,566.134$

Total Evaluated

Bid : N/A Total Evaluated Bid : N/A

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 165,625.560$

ITEM 4:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

2013 Ford Flex

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Dodge Grand Caravan RTKH53

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

2012 Toyota Sienna T16

NO BID

NO BID

2013 Ford Flex

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

2013 Ford Flex FWD

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 1

29,937.16$ 29,937.16$ 31,040.51$ 31,040.51$ 31,626.90$ 31,626.90$ 30,843.57$ 30,843.57$

City MPG: 17 City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A City MPG: 18

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 11,858.82$ Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A

Total Fuel

Cost: 11,200.00$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 41,795.984$

Total Evaluated

Bid : N/A Total Evaluated Bid : N/A

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 42,043.570$

ITEM 5:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Dodge Grand Caravan RTKH53

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

2012 Toyota Sienna T16

NO BID

NO BID

2013 Ford Flex FWD

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

NO BID

2013 Ford Flex SE

NO BID

NO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 1

24,971.71$ 24,971.71$ 20,742.74$ 20,742.74$ 20,569.32$ 20,569.32$

City MPG: 10 City MPG: 12 City MPG: 11

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel Cost: 14,460.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 12,050.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 13,145.45$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 39,431.710$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 32,792.740$ Total Evaluated Bid : 33,714.775$

20,742.74$ 20,742.74$ 22,079.00$ 22,079.00$

City MPG: 16 City MPG: 17

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 12,600.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 11,858.82$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 33,342.740$

Total

Evaluated Bid

: 33,937.824$

24,184.28$ 24,184.28$ 20,742.74$ 20,742.74$ 33,009.01$ 33,009.01$ 27,560.00$ 27,560.00$

City MPG: 14 City MPG: 16 City MPG: 18 City MPG: 18

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 14,400.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 12,600.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 11,200.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 11,200.00$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 38,584.280$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 33,342.740$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 44,209.010$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 38,760.000$

ITEM 6:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

2012 Dodge 1500 REG CAB 2WD SWB 2012 Ford F-150 2012 Ford FIC F-150 4X2

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

2012 Ford F-150

NO BID

2012 Ford F150 (F1C)

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Dodge 1500 REG CAB 2WD SWB

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Colorado

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Colorado CS154032012 Ford F-150

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 1

26,610.46$ 26,610.46$ 28,655.40$ 28,655.40$ 29,007.01$ 29,007.01$ 33,265.96$ 33,265.96$

City MPG: 10 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel Cost: 14,460.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 13,145.45$ Total Fuel Cost: 13,145.45$

Total Fuel

Cost: 13,145.45$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 41,070.460$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 41,800.855$ Total Evaluated Bid : 42,152.465$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 46,411.415$

28,655.40$ 28,655.40$ 30,136.00$ 30,136.00$

City MPG: 15 City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 13,440.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 13,440.00$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 42,095.400$

Total

Evaluated Bid

: 43,576.000$

33,787.91$ 33,787.91$

City MPG: 14

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel

Cost: 14,400.00$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 48,187.910$

ITEM 7:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

2012 Dodge RAM 1500 QUAD CAB 4X2 2012 Ford F-150 2012 Ford WIC F-150 SCC 4X2

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Silverado

NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

2012 Ford F-150

NO BID

2012 Ford F150 (W1C)

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

2012 Toyota Tundra

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 1

27,827.21$ 27,827.21$ 25,837.37$ 25,837.37$ 25,934.23$ 25,934.23$ 44,316.21$ 44,316.21$ 28,825.00$ 28,825.00$

City MPG: 10 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 10

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel Cost: 14,460.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 13,145.45$ Total Fuel Cost: 13,145.45$

Total Fuel

Cost: 13,145.45$ Total Fuel Cost: 14,460.00$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 42,287.210$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 38,982.825$ Total Evaluated Bid : 39,079.685$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 57,461.665$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 43,285.000$

25,580.00$ 25,580.00$

City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$
Total Fuel

Cost: 13,440.00$

Total

Evaluated Bid

: 39,020.000$

25,837.37$ 25,837.37$

City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 3.31$

Total Fuel Cost: 13,240.00$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 39,077.370$

ITEM 8:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

2012 Dodge RAM 1500 ST 4X2 REG CAB 2012 Ford F-150 4X2 R/C 2012 Ford F-150 4X2 FIC

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Silverado 2012 Chevrolet CC10703

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID NO BID NO BID

2012 Ford F150 (F1C)

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

2012 Ford F-150 4X2 R/C

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 1

32,462.81$ 32,462.81$ 31,585.01$ 31,585.01$ 31,391.30$ 31,391.30$ 51,316.21$ 51,316.21$ 34,964.00$ 34,964.00$

City MPG: 10 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 10

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel Cost: 14,460.00$ Total Fuel Cost: 13,145.45$ Total Fuel Cost: 13,145.45$

Total Fuel

Cost: 13,145.45$ Total Fuel Cost: 14,460.00$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 46,922.810$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 44,730.465$ Total Evaluated Bid : 44,536.755$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 64,461.665$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 49,424.000$

32,053.00$ 32,053.00$

City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$
Total Fuel

Cost: 13,440.00$

Total

Evaluated Bid

: 45,493.000$

31,585.01$ 31,585.01$

City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 13,440.00$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 45,025.010$

ITEM 9:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

2012 RAM 1500 ST 4X2 SWB DSIL61 2012 Ford F-150 4X2 R/C 2012 Ford F150 4X2 FIC

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Silverado 2012 Chevrolet CC10703

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID NO BID NO BID

2012 Ford F150 (F1C)

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

NO BID

2012 Ford F-150 4X2 R/C

NO BID

NO BID
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Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.Bid Item Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

QTY: 4

34,621.66$ 138,486.64$ 35,349.41$ 141,397.64$ 57,236.32$ 228,945.28$ 40,086.00$ 160,344.00$

City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11 City MPG: 11

Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$ Cost of Fuel: 2.41$

Total Fuel

Cost: 52,581.82$ Total Fuel Cost: 52,581.82$

Total Fuel

Cost: 52,581.82$ Total Fuel Cost: 52,581.82$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 191,068.458$ Total Evaluated Bid : 193,979.458$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 281,527.098$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 212,925.818$

38,074.00$ 152,296.00$

City MPG: 15

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$
Total Fuel

Cost: 53,760.00$

Total

Evaluated Bid

: 206,056.000$

37,752.86$ 151,011.44$ 34,621.66$ 138,486.64$ 40,248.43$ 160,993.72$

City MPG: 13 City MPG: 15 City MPG: 13

Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$ Cost of Fuel: 3.36$

Total Fuel Cost: 62,030.77$ Total Fuel Cost: 53,760.00$

Total Fuel

Cost: 62,030.77$

Total Evaluated Bid

: 213,042.209$

Total Evaluated

Bid : 192,246.640$

Total

Evaluated

Bid : 223,024.489$

ITEM 10:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

NO BID

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles

NO BID

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In

Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric

Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 3

Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Ford F-150 4X4 R/C 2012 F150 X1E 4X4 SC

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet Silverado

NO BID NO BID

2012 Ford F-150 (X1E)

NO BID

Alternate 6

EPA Non-Top

Performers for Fuel

Economy

2012 Dodge RAM 1500 QUAD 4X4 DS6L41

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

2012 Toyota Tundra2012 Ford F-150 4X4 R/C

NO BID

Alternate 5

EPA Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

2012 Chevrolet CK10753

NO BID
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