PROPOSAL NO. RFB-BFS-450610
OPENED: OCTOBER 12, 2011

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM
NO.

For the furnishing and delivery of COOLANT,
BRAKE FLUID AND BRAKE CLEANER

for the twelve-month period beginning January 1,
2012 and ending December 31, 2012 to the City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

GROUP I:

Ethylene Glycol, Phosphate-Free, Heavy

Duty Coolant, Concentrate, 55-gallon Drum

Bid Price Unit 16 drums
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 Mix, (pre-mix),

Phosphate-Free, Heavy Duty, 55-gallon Drum

Bid Price Unit 18 drums
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

Fleetguard DCA 75L or Equal, 5-gallon
Container
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer and Part Number:

40 containers

Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 Mix (Pre-Mix),

Phosphate Free, 1-gallon container

Bid Price Unit 60 containers
Total

Manufacturer and Part Number:

BACON HAWAII PACIFIC POWER PENNZOIL
UNIVERSAL, TRUCK PRODUCTS DISTRIBUTORS OF
INC. PARTS COMPANY HAWAII, INC.

$698.43 $1,105.66 $780.74 $825.29

$11,174.88 $17,690.56 $12,491.84 $13,204.64

Fleetguard CC2741 Fleetguard CC2821 Old World Service Pro

(150,000 mil) Industries SPE16707-55
23512139

$425.13 $674.75 $450.40 $503.93

$7,652.34 $12,145.50 $8,107.20 $9,070.74

Fleetguard CC2745 Fleetguard CC2826 Old World | Service Pro Antifreeze

(150,000 mil) Industries SPE 160790
23518918

$103.44 $163.62 $172.24 NO BID

$4,137.60 $6,544.80 $6,889.60 $0.00
Fleetguard DCA75L| Fleetguard DCA 75L Fleetguard
FG DCA75L

$8.82 $14.25 $11.09 $9.30

$529.20 $855.00 $665.40 $558.00

Fleeetguard CC2746 Fleetguard CC2825 Old World Service Pro

(150,000 mil) Industries SPE16709

23528203
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BACON HAWAII PACIFIC POWER PENNZOIL
UNIVERSAL, TRUCK PRODUCTS DISTRIBUTORS OF
INC. PARTS COMPANY HAWAII, INC.
ITEM
NO.
5. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,
1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 1056 containers $12.89 $23.27 $14.03 $9.49
Total $13,611.84 $24,573.12 $14,815.68 $10,021.44
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2742 Fleetguard CC2820 Old World Service Pro
(150,000 mil) Industries SPE 16705
GROUP I 23512138
Prestone 5/150 Extended Life Coolant or
Equal, 1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 160 containers $15.33 NO BID $14.03 $12.46
Total $2,452.80 $0.00 $2,244.80 $1,993.60
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2742 Old World| Honeywell/Prestone
Industries SPE 86095
23512138
Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 12-0z containers
Bid Price Unit 440 containers $2.73 NO BID $1.90 $2.37
Total $1,201.20 $0.00 $836.00 $1,042.80
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnsons 2212 Penray PIC 6012 Penzoil 8568
Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 1-gallon containers
Bid Price Unit 80 gallons $25.86 NO BID $17.38 $22.04
Total $2,068.80 $0.00 $1,390.40 $1,763.20
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnsons 2234 Penray PIC 6001 Penzoil 8569
Non-Chlorinated Brake Cleaner, 13-14 oz.
net weight container
Bid Price Unit 6100 containers 2.71 NO BID $2.88 $2.59
Total $16,531.00 $0.00 $17,568.00 $15,799.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: 5088 CRC Penray PIC 4520 Cyclo CC11
Brake & Parts Cleaner
GROUP Il Total Lump Sum (ltems 6 - 9): $22,253.80 NO BID $22,039.20 $20,598.60




