ABSTRACT
FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-ESD-437334
OPENED: November 8, 2011

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
MEDICAL SUPPLIES

to the Honolulu Emergency Services
Department, Emergency Medical Services BOUNDTREE MEDICAL, KENTRON HEALTH LIFESCIENCE R & M REYES RESCUE SAFETY VIDACARE
Division, Ambulance Section, City and LLC HENRY SCHEIN INC. CARE, INC LAERDAL RESOURCES, INC. R.WEINSTEIN, INC. ENTERPRISE, INC. PACIFIC, INC. STAT MEDICAL, INC. CORPORATION
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii.
IL%M DESCRIPTION Qty UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |[UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |[UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL
GROUP | - ADHESIVE TAPE (Item No 1 - 5)
1 Adhesive Tape; waterproof; 1 in. 144 1.5783 227.28 1.39 200.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.46 210.24 1.860 267.84 1.70 244.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Adhesive Tape; waterproof; 2 in. 720 3.0367 2,186.42 2.74 1,972.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.72 1,958.40 1.595 1,148.40 3.18 2,289.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Adhesive Tape; waterproof; 3 in. 48 4.4725 214.68 4.03 193.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.00 192.00 5.569 267.31 4.99 239.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4  |Adhesive Tape; porous; 1 in. 144 0.9642 138.84 0.95 136.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.91 131.04 0.933 134.35 0.82 118.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Adhesive Tape; porous; 2 in. 72 1.8130 130.54 1.68 120.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.73 124.56 1.860 133.92 1.67 120.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP | 2,897.76 2,624.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,616.24 1,951.82 3,012.24 No Bid No Bid
GROUP Il - AIRWAYS, ORAL (Item No. 6 - 11)
6 |50 mm; #0 50 0.7000 35.00 0.41 20.50 0.37 18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.43 21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 |60 mm; #1 50 0.7000 35.00 0.41 20.50 0.37 18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.43 21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 |70 mm; #2 50 0.7000 35.00 0.40 20.00 0.37 18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.43 21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 (80 mm; #3 50 0.7000 35.00 0.42 21.00 0.37 18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.43 21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |90 mm; #4 750 0.7000 525.00 0.41 307.50 0.37 277.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.43 322.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |100 mm; #5 750 0.6700 502.50 No Bid No Bid 0.37 277.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.43 322.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP I 1,167.50 * No Bid 629.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 731.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP Il - ANESTHESIA MASKS (ltem No.
12 -18)
12 |Neonatal Size 30 2.0200 60.60 1.92 57.60 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 [Infant Size 30 1.6100 48.30 1.88 56.40 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |Toddler Size 30 1.6100 48.30 1.70 51.00 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 |Child Size 30 1.6100 48.30 1.88 56.40 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 |Adult Size, small 30 1.6100 48.30 1.88 56.40 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 |Adult Size, standard 30 1.6100 48.30 2.03 60.90 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 |Adult Size, large 30 1.6100 48.30 1.93 57.90 1.35 40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP Il 350.40 396.60 283.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP IV - BAGS (ltem No. 19-21)
19 (Bag, ALS Drug, w/ 12 padded compartments 25 100.6500 2,516.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 139.50 3,487.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 |Bag, ALS Drug 15 197.4100 2,961.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 228.00 3,420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |Bag, Biohazard 50 1.3200 66.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.03 151.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP V - BAND AIDS (Item No. 22 & 23)
22 [Band Aid; 1in.x 3in. 42,000 0.0355 1,491.00 0.02 840.00 0.014 588.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.029 1,197.00 0.023 966.00 0.0234 982.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 |Band Aid; 2 in. 12,000 0.1252 1,502.40 0.12 1,440.00 0.05 600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.095 1,140.00 0.095 1,140.00 0.10 1,188.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP V 2,993.40 2,280.00 1,188.00 No Bid No Bid 2,337.00 2,106.00 2,170.80 No Bid No Bid
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lLEOM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL | |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL
Gauze Bandages
24 |2in. x 5 yds (stretched) 96 0.2330 22.37 0.11 10.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.199 19.10 0.24 23.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 |3in.x5yds. 96 0.2900 27.84 0.13 12.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.256 24.58 0.31 29.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 |4in.x5yds. 3,840 0.2792 1,072.13 0.16 614.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.334 1,282.56 0.39 1,497.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 |6in.x5yds. 1,920 0.5350 1,027.20 0.26 499.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.500 960.00 0.63 1,209.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP VI 2,149.54 1,136.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,286.24 2,760.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP VII-A. - BLOOD PRESSURE
SUPPLIES (Award by Item)
28 |Bulb, Blood Pressure, large 40 1.4600 58.40 No Bid No Bid 1.29 51.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.960 118.40 1.59 63.60 4.50 180.00 No Bid No Bid
29 |Gauge, Blood Pressure; certified; aneroid 5 12.8000 64.00 No Bid No Bid 5.19 25.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.776 68.88 10.75 53.75 35.00 175.00 No Bid No Bid
30 [Valve, Blood Pressure; cuff control valve 60 2.2500 135.00 No Bid No Bid 1.90 114.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.760 225.60 2.05 123.00 5.50 330.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP VII-B. - CUFFS & COIL FOR
CRITICARE (Item No. 31-35)
Blood Pressure Cuffs & Coil
31 [Infant Size 10 33.7700 337.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.00 310.00 No Bid No Bid
32 |Child Size 10 40.7600 407.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.00 350.00 No Bid No Bid
33  |Adult Size 50 42.8600 2,143.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 1,900.00 No Bid No Bid
34 |Extra Large Adult Size 10 58.4500 584.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 49.00 490.00 No Bid No Bid
35 |Coil with quick connect 25 42.8600 1,071.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.00 950.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP VII-B 4,544.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,000.00 No Bid
GROUP VIl - CABLES FOR LIFEPAK (Item
No. 36-39)
36 |Defibrillator Cable 5 327.2800 1,636.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 311.00 1,555.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 |EKG Main Cable 10 306.5000 3,065.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 318.00 3,180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 |Wire Limb Assembly 5 67.5400 337.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
39 |Wire Precordial Assembly 5 132.9900 664.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 127.50 637.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP VI 5,704.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid *No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP IX - COMPONENT ACCESSORIES
FOR LIFEPAK (Item No. 40-51)
40 [Battery; rechargeable nickel cadium 50 223.3800 11,169.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 213.50 10,675.00 345.00 17,250.00 No Bid No Bid
41 |Cable; Extension 50 192.2100 9,610.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.00 2,700.00 250.00 12,500.00 No Bid No Bid
42 |Case, carrying 15 124.6800 1,870.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 116.10 1,741.50 175.00 2,625.00 No Bid No Bid
43 |Detector Circuits; adult/intermediate size 500 8.7700 4,385.00 9.72 4,860.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.49 4,745.00 8.79 4,395.00 No Bid No Bid
44  |Detector Circuits; pediatric size 100 9.7500 975.00 13.60 1,360.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.25 1,225.00 11.20 1,120.00 No Bid No Bid
45 |Pouch, back 15 73.7700 1,106.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 68.96 1,034.40 110.00 1,650.00 No Bid No Bid
46 |Pouch, Left 15 83.1200 1,246.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.70 1,165.50 125.00 1,875.00 No Bid No Bid
47 |Pouch, Top 10 48.8400 488.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.82 458.20 85.00 850.00 No Bid No Bid
48 |Sensor, End-tidal CO2 500 12.6700 6,335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.85 8,425.00 12.96 6,480.00 No Bid No Bid
49 [Sensor, Pulse Oximeter; adult 50 280.5200 14,026.00 252.35 12,617.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 242.00 12,100.00 349.00 17,450.00 No Bid No Bid
50 |Shield, screen 20 44.6800 893.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41.91 838.20 79.00 1,580.00 No Bid No Bid
51 |Strap, shoulder 10 29.1000 291.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.80 278.00 55.00 550.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP VI 52,397.05 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45,385.80 68,325.00 No Bid
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BOUNDTREE MEDICAL, KENTRON HEALTH LIFESCIENCE R & M REYES RESCUE SAFETY VIDACARE
LLC HENRY SCHEIN INC. CARE, INC LAERDAL RESOURCES, INC. R. WEINSTEIN, INC. ENTERPRISE, INC. PACIFIC, INC. STAT MEDICAL, INC. CORPORATION
ILEOM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL
GROUP X - DETECTOR, END-TIDAL CO2
(Item No. 52 & 53)
52 [|Pediatric size 240 9.6500 2,316.00 8.92 2,140.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.516 4,203.84 15.61 3,746.40 8.25 1,980.00 No Bid No Bid
53 |Adult size 240 9.6500 2,316.00 8.68 2,083.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.516 4,203.84 15.61 3,746.40 8.25 1,980.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP X 4,632.00 4,224.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8,407.68 7,492.80 3,960.00 No Bid
GROUP XI - DRESSING (ltem No. 54 & 55)
54 |3in. x4 in.; packaged 100 pieces 48,000 0.1398 6,710.40 0.15 7,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.132 6,336.00 0.068 3,264.00 0.086 4,128.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 [8in. x 3 in.; 50 pieces per box 12,000 0.1990 2,388.00 0.19 2,280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.16 1,920.00 0.134 1,608.00 0.169 2,028.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XI 9,098.40 9,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8,256.00 4,872.00 6,156.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XII - A- ECG ELECTRODES (Item No.
56)
56 |Electrodes, ECG, infant size 2,000 0.2800 560.00 1.01 2,020.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.23 464.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.285 570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XII - B - LONG-TERM MONITORING
ELECTRODES (ltem No. 57 & 58)
57 |Packaged 3 electrodes per package 2,520 0.4167 1,050.08 0.16 403.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.32 816.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.34 856.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 |Packaged 25 electrodes per package 95,000 0.3300 31,350.00 0.34 32,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.28 26,790.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.266 25,270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XII - B 32,400.08 32,703.20 No Bid No Bid 27,606.48 No Bid No Bid 26,126.80 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XII - C - MULTI-FUNCTION
ELECTRODES (ltem No. 59 & 60)
59 |Adult Size 800 20.7400 16,592.00 39.26 31,408.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.95 14,360.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 [Pediatric Size 400 22.2200 8,888.00 42.06 16,824.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.00 7,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XIl - C 25,480.00 48,232.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21,960.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XIII - ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES WITH
DRAWSTRINGS (Iltem No. 61-64)
61 |[Size 6.0mm; cuffed 20 9.1100 182.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.92 218.40 8.75 175.00 No Bid No Bid
62 [Size 7.0 mm; cuffed 20 9.1100 182.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.92 218.40 8.75 175.00 No Bid No Bid
63 [Size 8.0 mm; cuffed 200 9.1100 1,822.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.92 2,184.00 8.75 1,750.00 No Bid No Bid
64 [Size 9.0 mm; cuffed 20 9.1100 182.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.92 218.40 8.75 175.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP Xl 2,368.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,839.20 2,275.00 No Bid
GROUP XIV - ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES
(CUFFED) (Item No. 65-69)
65 [Size 6.0 mm; cuffed 20 2.0100 40.20 No Bid No Bid 1.75 35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.22 64.40 1.95 39.00 No Bid No Bid
66 [Size 7.0 mm; cuffed 20 2.0100 40.20 No Bid No Bid 1.75 35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.22 64.40 1.95 39.00 No Bid No Bid
67 |[Size 7.5 mm; cuffed 400 2.0100 804.00 No Bid No Bid 1.75 700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.22 1,288.00 1.75 700.00 No Bid No Bid
68 [Size 8.0 mm; cuffed 600 2.0100 1,206.00 No Bid No Bid 1.75 1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.22 1,932.00 1.75 1,050.00 No Bid No Bid
69 [Size 9.0 mm; cuffed 20 2.0100 40.20 1.27 25.40 1.75 35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.22 64.40 1.95 39.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XIV 2,130.60 *No Bid 1,855.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,413.20 1,867.00 No Bid
GROUP XV - ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES
(UNCUFFED) (Item No. 70-77)
70 [Size 2.0 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 1.23 24.60 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
71 |[Size 2.5 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 121 24.20 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
72 |Size 3.0 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 1.16 23.20 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
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ILEOM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL [ |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL | |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL
73 |Size 3.5 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 No Bid No Bid 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
74 |Size 4.0 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 1.16 23.20 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
75 |Size 4.5 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 1.16 23.20 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
76 |Size 5.0 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 1.16 23.20 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid
77 |Size 5.5 mm 20 1.3700 27.40 1.12 22.40 0.92 18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.40 48.00 1.20 24.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XV 219.20 *No Bid 147.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 384.00 192.00 No Bid
GROUP XVI - GLUCOSE REAGENT STRIPS
(Iltem No. 78 & 79)
78 |Glucose Reagent Strips 60 70.5200 4,231.20 47.10 2,826.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.56 3,993.60 36.850 2,211.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 |Glucose Reagent Strips Control Fluid 12 9.1000 109.20 8.18 98.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.36 52.32 17.050 204.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XVI 4,340.40 2,924.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,045.92 2,415.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XVII - IMMOBILIZER, HEAD (Item No.
80)
80 |Immobilizer, Head 2,000 3.9000 7,800.00 4.24 8,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.66 9,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XVIII - INHALATION SUPPLIES (ltem
No. 81-84)
81 |Nasal Cannula; adult size 9,600 0.3500 3,360.00 0.33 3,168.00 0.32 3,072.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.41 3,936.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 |Nebulizer, Mist 2,300 0.9000 2,070.00 No Bid No Bid 0.69 1,587.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.81 1,863.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 |Non-Rebreather Oxygen Mask; adult size 9,000 0.8600 7,740.00 1.23 11,070.00 0.75 6,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.19 10,710.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 Zzﬁgg::t]e'(\;z?zké high concentration; pediatric 850 1.1700 994.50 1.26 1,071.00{| 079 671.50|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid NoBid|| 1.44 1,224.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XVIII 14,164.50 *No Bid 12,080.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17,733.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XIX - INTRAVENOUS (I.V.)
CATHETER PLACEMENT UNITS (Item No. 85-
90)
85 |14G x 1-1/4 in. color code orange 2,800 1.5600 4,368.00 1.71 4,788.00 1.69 4,732.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.62 4,536.00 3.233 9,052.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
86 |16G x 1-1/4 in. color code gray 3,800 1.5600 5,928.00 1.67 6,346.00 1.69 6,422.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.62 6,156.00 3.132 11,901.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87 |18G x 1-1/4 in. color code green 18,800 1.5600 29,328.00 1.71 32,148.00 1.69 31,772.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.62 30,456.00 3.132 58,881.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 |20G x 1-1/4 in. color code pink 12,800 1.5600 19,968.00 1.67 21,376.00 1.69 21,632.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.62 20,736.00 3.132 40,089.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 |22G x 1 in. color code blue 400 1.5600 624.00 1.67 668.00 1.69 676.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.62 648.00 3.132 1,252.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 |24G x 3/4 in. color code yellow 200 1.5600 312.00 1.67 334.00 1.69 338.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.62 324.00 3.132 626.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XIX 60,528.00 65,660.00 65,572.00 No Bid No Bid 62,856.00 121,804.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XX - INTUBATION STYLETS (ltem
No. 91-93)
91 |Child Size, 6 Fr. 20 2.8800 57.60 2.60 52.00 1.390 27.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.89 77.80 2.65 53.00 No Bid No Bid
92 |Child Size, 10 Fr. 100 2.8800 288.00 2.50 250.00 1.390 139.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.89 389.00 2.65 265.00 No Bid No Bid
93 |Adult Size, 14 Fr. 700 2.8800 2,016.00 3.01 2,107.00 1.390 973.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.89 2,723.00 2.60 1,820.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XX 2,361.60 2,409.00 1,139.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,189.80 2,138.00 No Bid
GROUP A- MACINTOSH TYPE
94 [Newborn size, Macintosh #0 10 12.9900 129.90 No Bid No Bid 8.99 89.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
95 [Infant size, Macintosh #1 10 12.9900 129.90 9.22 92.20 8.99 89.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 |Child size, Macintosh #2 12 12.9900 155.88 9.21 110.52 8.99 107.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 158.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
97 |Medium size, Macintosh #3 10 12.9900 129.90 9.23 92.30 8.99 89.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
98 |Large size, Macintosh #4 10 12.9900 129.90 9.23 92.30 8.99 89.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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lLEOM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL | |JUNIT PRICE TOTAL
GROUP B - MILLER TYPE
99 [Premature infant size, Miller #0 5 12.9900 64.95 9.23 46.15 8.99 44.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 65.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 |Infant size, Miller #1 5 12.9900 64.95 9.23 46.15 8.99 44.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 65.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101 |Large size, Miller #2 5 12.9900 64.95 9.23 46.15 8.99 44.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 65.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102 |[Large size, Miller #3 5 12.9900 64.95 9.23 46.15 8.99 44.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 65.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
103 |Large size, Miller #4 10 12.9900 129.90 9.23 92.30 8.99 89.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP C- WISCONSIN TYPE
104 |[Child size, Wisconsin (Wis-Foregger) #2 10 12.9900 129.90 No Bid No Bid 14.990 149.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
105 [Medium size, Wisconsin (Wis-Foregger) #3 15 12.9900 194.85 No Bid No Bid 14.990 224.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 197.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
106 [Large size, Wisconsin (Wis-Foregger) #4 15 12.9900 194.85 No Bid No Bid 14.990 224.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.19 197.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XX |- A, B, C 1,584.78 *No Bid 1,336.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,609.18 No Bid No Bid
GROUP D- GRANDVIEW BLADES (Item No.
107 & 108)
107 |Adult size 50 68.7500 3,437.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108 |Child size 50 68.7500 3,437.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XX 1-D 6,875.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXII - LARYNGOSCOPE BULB &
HANDLE - (Item No. 109 - 112)
109 (Laryngoscope Bulb - Large size 360 1.2300 442.80 2.68 964.80 0.99 356.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.97 709.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
110 [Laryngoscope Bulb - Small size 360 1.2300 442.80 9.06 3,261.60 0.99 356.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.97 709.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
111 hzg{(nggsh‘:;npje”a”d'es standard American 125 12.6700 1,583.75 9.06 1,132.50 8.69 1,086.25(| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| NoBid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid 9.90 1,237.50| | No Bid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid
112 hzg{(nggsh‘:;npje”a”d'es Fiber Optic American 125 45.4600 568250(| 39.71 4963.75|| 2419 3,023.75|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| NoBid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| 39.75 4,968.75|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXII 8,151.85 10,322.65 4,822.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7,624.65 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXIIl - GROUPS A, B, C -
LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES - (Item No. 113 -
123)
GROUP A - MACINTOSH TYPE -
DISPOSABLE
113 |Newborn size, Macintosh #2 50 3.6100 180.50 4.39 219.50 26.99 1,349.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 221.00 7.40 370.00 No Bid No Bid
114 |Infant Size, Macintosh #3 50 3.6100 180.50 No Bid No Bid 26.99 1,349.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 221.00 7.40 370.00 No Bid No Bid
115 |Child size, Macintosh #4 75 3.6100 270.75 No Bid No Bid 26.99 2,024.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 331.50 7.40 555.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP B - MILLER TYPE
116 |Premature infant size, Miller #0 20 3.6100 72.20 No Bid No Bid 26.99 539.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 88.40 7.40 148.00 No Bid No Bid
117 |Infant size, Miller #1 20 3.6100 72.20 No Bid No Bid 26.99 539.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 88.40 7.40 148.00 No Bid No Bid
118 |Large size, Miller #2 20 3.6100 72.20 4.48 89.60 26.99 539.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 88.40 7.40 148.00 No Bid No Bid
119 |[Large size, Miller #3 5 3.6100 18.05 No Bid No Bid 26.99 134.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 22.10 7.40 37.00 No Bid No Bid
120 |Large size, Miller #4 10 3.6100 36.10 No Bid No Bid 26.99 269.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 44.20 7.40 74.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP C - WISCONSIN TYPE
121 (Child size, Wisconsin (Wis-Foregger ) #2 10 12.5000 125.00 No Bid No Bid 44.95 449.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 44.20 7.40 74.00 No Bid No Bid
122 [Medium size, Wisconsin (Wis-Forgger) #3 15 12.5000 187.50 No Bid No Bid 44.95 674.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 66.30 7.40 111.00 No Bid No Bid
123 (Large size, Wsiconsin (Wis-Forgger) #4 15 12.5000 187.50 No Bid No Bid 44.95 674.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.42 66.30 7.40 111.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXIII 1,402.50 *No Bid 8,545.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,281.80 2,146.00 No Bid
GROUP XXIV - PACKS, COLD & HOT - (Item
No. 124-125)
124 [Cold Packs, large size, disposable 11,200 0.7000 7,840.00 0.27 3,024.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.540 6,048.00 0.59 6,608.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
125 [Hot Packs, large size, disposable 1,200 1.8400 2,208.00 0.28 336.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.890 2,268.00 1.59 1,908.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BOUNDTREE MEDICAL, KENTRON HEALTH LIFESCIENCE R & M REYES RESCUE SAFETY VIDACARE
LLC HENRY SCHEIN INC. CARE, INC LAERDAL RESOURCES, INC. R. WEINSTEIN, INC. ENTERPRISE, INC. PACIFIC, INC. STAT MEDICAL, INC. CORPORATION
'LEOM DESCRIPTION QTY | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL [ |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |[UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL
GROUP XXV - PULSE OXIMETERS & CASE -
(Item No. 126 & 127)
126 |Oximeter, Finger Pulse, digital 10 250.6500 2,506.50 169.40 1,694.00 75.000 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 |Carrying Case 10 22.0800 220.80 19.01 190.10 4.000 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXV 2,727.30 1,884.10 790.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXVI - RESUSCITATORS,
DISPOSABLE MANUAL - (Item No. 128 & 130)
128 [Infant size 30 11.0400 331.20 12.33 369.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.73 681.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
129 (Pediatric (child) size 132 11.0400 1,457.28 12.33 1,627.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.64 3,120.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
130 |Adult size 1,482 9.7500 14,449.50 9.30 13,782.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.45 24,378.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXVI 16,237.98 15,780.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28,181.28 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXVII - SHARPS CONTAINER - (Item
No. 131 - 133)
131 (2 gallon size 60 3.3800 202.80 3.00 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.04 302.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 |1 gallon size 90 3.9700 357.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.23 650.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
133 [Personal size 3,600 1.8200 6,552.00 1.63 5,868.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.030 7,308.00 1.69 6,084.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXVIIl - SPHYGMOMANOMETERS -
(Item No. 134 - 136)
134 [Infant size 20 12.5400 250.80 No Bid No Bid 11.95 239.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.200 464.00 13.78 275.60 36.40 728.00 No Bid No Bid
135 [Child size 20 24.5500 491.00 No Bid No Bid 11.95 239.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.720 134.40 13.78 275.60 43.20 864.00 No Bid No Bid
136 |Adult size 100 11.6700 1,167.00 No Bid No Bid 11.95 1,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.200 2,320.00 13.78 1,378.00 31.40 3,140.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXVIII 1,908.80 No Bid 1,673.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,918.40 1,929.20 4,732.00 No Bid
GROUP XXIX - SPLINTS, CARDBOARD- (Item
No. 137 - 139)
137 |Small size 324 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.12 1,982.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 [Medium size 360 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.99 2,876.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
139 |[Large size 703 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.75 7,557.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXIX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,416.53 No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXX - SUCTION SUPPLIES (AWARD
BY ITEM FOR ITEMS 140-142)
140 ([Suction canister 80 2.8900 231.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.69 215.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 ([Suction set 150 0.8200 123.00 0.53 79.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.93 439.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
142 ([Suction tip 100 1.7100 171.00 1.97 197.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.16 216.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP XXXI - SUCTION UNITS, HAND
POWERED & ACCESSORIES- (Item No. 143 -
146)
143 [Hand powered suction unit, starter kit 30 79.1000 2,373.00 71.15 2,134.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.70 2,001.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144 |Replacement Cartridges 240 19.4900 4,677.60 17.53 4,207.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.44 2,985.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
145 [Suction Tips 80 5.8950 471.60 4.85 388.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.51 280.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
146 [Suction Catheters 120 2.8250 339.00 2.32 278.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.02 242.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXXI 7,861.20 7,008.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,509.80 No Bid No Bid
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BOUNDTREE MEDICAL KENTRON HEALTH LIFESCIENCE R & M REYES RESCUE SAFETY VIDACARE
"[| HENRY SCHEIN INC. LAERDAL R. WEINSTEIN, INC. STAT MEDICAL, INC.
LLC CARE, INC RESOURCES, INC. ENTERPRISE, INC. PACIFIC, INC. CORPORATION

'LEOM DESCRIPTION QTY ||UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [uNIT PRICE TOTAL

GROUP XXXII - SYRINGES - GROUP A -

BECTON DOCLOMSPM SAFETY-LOK (Item

No. 147 - 150)
147 ;Z‘;Z?’:”ge with 25G 5/8 in. PrecisionGlide 500 0.6400 320.00|| NoBid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid|| NoBid No Bid|| No Bid NoBid|| 0.3705 185.25|| 0.495 247.50 0.38 190.00(| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid
148 |3cc syringe without needle 500 0.2111 105.55 0.19 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1912 95.60 0.256 128.00 0.19 95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
149 |5cc syringe without needle 150 0.5196 77.94 0.43 64.50|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| 0.4705 7058|| 0.632 94.80 0.42 63.00|| No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid
150 [10cc syringe without needle 300 0.5260 157.80 0.43 129.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4764 142.92 0.645 193.50 0.44 132.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXXII - A 661.29 *No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 494.35 663.80 480.00 No Bid No Bid

GROUP B - OTHER TYPE (Item No. 151 - 152)
151 |60cc Luer Lock tip 200 0.8700 174.00 0.37 74.00|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| 0.486 97.20(| 1.000 200.00 0.50 100.00|| No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid
152 |60cc Catheter tip 200 0.5000 100.00 0.37 74.00|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| 0.309 61.80(| 1.000 200.00 0.66 132.00|| No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXXII - B 274.00 148.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 159.00 400.00 232.00 No Bid No Bid

GROUP XXXIIl - TAPE, TRANSPARENT

PLASTIC (Item No. 153-154)
153 |1/2in. x5 yds. 576 0.6604 380.39 0.46 264.96(| 0.295 169.92|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid 0.60 345.60|| 0.840 483.84|| NoBid NoBid || No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid
154 |1in. x5 yds. 1,440 1.2560 1,808.64 1.20 1,728.00[| 0.500 849.60[| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid No Bid 1.14 1,641.60|| 1540 2,217.60 1.15 1,656.00|| No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXXIII 2,189.03 1,992.96 1,019.52 No Bid No Bid 1,987.20 2,701.44 *No Bid No Bid No Bid

GROUP XXXIV - TRACTION SPLINTS (Item

No. 155-156)
155 |Adult size 5 207.7900 1,038.95(| 24638 1,231.90|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| 260.82 1,304.10|| No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid
156 |Pediatric size 5 207.7900 1,038.95|| 248.13 1,240.65|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| No Bid NoBid|| 260.82 1,304.10|| No Bid NoBid || No Bid No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID GROUP XXXIV 2,077.90 2,472.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,608.20 No Bid No Bid

GROUP XXXV - MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

(Iltem No. 157-213) Award by item
157 |Airway monitor 10 6.5000 65.00 8.02 80.20|| 6.690 66.90{| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
158 |Alcohol swabs 4,000 0.0156 62.40 0.02 80.00|| 0.015 60.00{| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| 0.0125 50.00/| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
159 |Aspirator 5 4.5500 22.75 3.92 19.60[ 45590 22.95(| NoBid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
160 |Bandage, triangular 3,600 1.5200 5,472.00 0.38 1,368.00/|  0.390 1,404.00{| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 1.178 4,240.80|| No Bid No Bid 1.12 4,032.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
161 |Belts, 9 ft. 700 6.8200 4,774.00|| 11.69 8,183.00|| 6.690 4,683.00[| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 12.00 8,400.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
162 |Belt Straps, backboard 700 2.3300 1,631.00 2.45 1,715.00||  1.990 1,393.00{| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 8.40 5,880.00/| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
163 |Belt Straps, Cot 150 6.8200 1,023.00/| No Bid No Bid 5.990 808.50|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 18.37 2,756.50||  No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
164 |Blanket, disposable 180 7.4844 1,347.19 6.07 1,002.60||  3.990 718.20|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 8.950 1,611.00 7.81 1,405.80|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
165 |Blanket, rescue 500 0.4600 230.00 0.41 205.00|| 0.390 195.00{| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 1.310 655.00 1.13 565.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
166 |Ciruit, ventillation 500 12.5100 6,255.00 5.34 2,670.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 7.95 3,975.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
167 |Clean-up kit 48 6.7700 324.96|| No Bid No Bid 4.490 215.52|| NoBid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 16.54 793.92|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
168 |Cotton rolls 100 6.6000 660.00 5.94 504.00|| 4.250 425.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 6.64 664.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
169 [Cricothrotomy kit 5 181.2400 906.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 193.67 968.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
170 |Defibrillator pads 200 2.2730 454.60|| NoBid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
171 |Disinfectant 40 17.1500 686.00 4.48 179.20[  No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 24.00 960.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
172 [Double Lumen Airway, in plastic tray 5 56.1400 280.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 87.43 437.15 54.75 273.75 No Bid No Bid
173 Egyb'e Lumen Airway, small adult size in plastic) o 56.1400 280.70|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 87.43 437.15||  54.00 270.00|| No Bid No Bid
174 |Double Lumen Airway, in roll up kit 160 46.3600 7417.60|| 4170 6,672.00|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid 42.47 6,795.20||  48.00 7,680.00|| No Bid No Bid
175 Estﬁ'e Lumen Airway, small adult size, in rol ) 45.3600 4,082.40(| 4053 3,647.70[|  NoBid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid NoBid|| 42.47 3,822.30(| 48.00 4,320.00| No Bid No Bid
176 [Drape Sheet, extra large 72 No Bid No Bid 6.78 488.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.08 437.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ILEOM DESCRIPTION QTY [ [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| [UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL| |UNIT PRICE TOTAL | |[UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL [ [UNIT PRICE TOTAL | [UNIT PRICE TOTAL
177 [Dressing, Intravenous Veni-puncture site 30,000 0.3897 11,691.00 0.48 14,400.00 0.370 11,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4255 12,765.00 No Bid No Bid 0.528 15,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
178 |Dressing, Multi-Trama 1,650 2.6600 4,389.00 1.52 2,508.00 0.990 1,633.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.32 3,828.00 2.960 4,884.00 3.19 5,263.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
179 |Extrication Collar, pediatric size 200 3.9000 780.00 5.26 1,052.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.90 980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
180 |Extrication Collar, adult size 5,150 3.9000 20,085.00 5.26 27,089.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.90 25,235.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
181 |Filters, HEPA, adult size 100 4.0260 402.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
182 ([Filters, HEPA, pediatric size 100 4.0260 402.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
183 |Gown 1,050 1.5500 1,627.50 No Bid No Bid 0.390 409.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.198 1,257.90 1.790 1,879.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
184 |Infuser, Pressure 50 16.6100 830.50 11.64 582.00 10.990 549.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.35 767.50 12.50 625.00 No Bid No Bid
185 [Intraosseous Injection Device 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 320.00 64,000.00
186 [Intraosseous Injection Device, pediatric 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.00 21,000.00
187 [Intraosseous Injection Device, adult 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.00 21,000.00
188 [Intubator, espohageal 40 1.9800 79.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.15 86.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
189 [Impedance Threshold Device 300 99.5000 29,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 89.00 26,700.00 No Bid No Bid
190 |Lancets, Safety 600 0.2208 132.48 No Bid No Bid 0.150 90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.14 84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
191 [Mucosal Atomization Device 150 9.4500 1,417.50 2.36 354.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
192 [Mattress, replacement 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 210.00 10,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
193 |O.B.Kit 40 7.3000 292.00 4.58 183.20 4.490 179.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.96 198.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
194 |Pad, gauze 200 0.0615 12.30 0.05 10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0597 11.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
195 |Padding, triple 1,600 0.1890 302.40 No Bid No Bid 0.210 336.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.174 278.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
196 |Paper, ECG recording 720 4.0700 2,930.40 No Bid No Bid 2.590 1,864.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.68 3,369.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
197 [Probe cover, tympanic thermometer 16,000 0.0729 1,166.40 0.07 1,120.00 0.082 1,312.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.066 1,056.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
198 |Restraints 5 3.2500 16.25 3.28 16.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.72 43.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
199 [Scissors with curved blades 5 1.6900 8.45 1.42 7.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
200 (Scissors, 7-1/4 in. length 250 1.0300 257.50 0.84 210.00 0.990 247.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.20 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
201 |Sponges, topper dressing 400 0.05226 20.90 0.05 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.076 30.40 No Bid No Bid 0.0502 20.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
202 [Stopcock 400 1.6430 657.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.45 980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
203 |Swivel 1,100 2.4936 2,742.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.88 3,168.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
204 ([Tourniquet Bands, latex 25,000 0.0700 1,750.00 0.12 3,000.00 0.090 2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.172 4,300.00 0.159 3,975.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
205 |Tourniquet bands, non-latex 100 0.3804 38.04 No Bid No Bid 0.110 11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.41 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
206 [Tube Holder, adult size 2,000 2.9300 5,860.00 2.87 5,740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.04 6,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
207 |Tube Holder, pediatric size 300 2.9300 879.00 2.87 861.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.04 912.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
208 | Transport Sheet 50 17.6000 880.00 17.68 884.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.240 1,162.00 17.69 884.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
209 |Wipes 150 7.2000 1,080.00 6.70 1,005.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.55 1,132.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
210 [N/A

211 |CPAP OS breathing circuit w/small adult mask 50 7.6700 383.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
212 E':gf OS breathing circuit w/medium adult 150 32.4700 4,870.50||  No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid|| No Bid No Bid
213 |CPAP OS breathing circuit w/large adult mask 100 9.8800 988.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

* Indicates "No bid" as award is made by Total Sum Bid for the Group. Pursuant to Item No. 10, Method of Award, of the Special provisions, Bidder must bid on every item within said group.
**These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.
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