PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DFM-456703

- OPENED: OCTOBER 25, 2011 (RQM-DFM-1200027)

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of PNEUMATIC

TIRES, for the twelve-month beginning EAST BAY TIRE CO. HAWAIIAN ISLAND NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL PACIFIC TIRE
January 1, 2012 and ending TIRE CO., INC. TIRE OF HAWAIL, INC. GROUP INC.
December 31, 2012, to the City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO. UNMOUNTED TIRES
. PASSENGER CAR TIRES
1. P225/70R15
Bid Price Unit 120 $97.75 $89.85 NO BID NO BID
Total $11,730.00 $10,782.00 | (For item Nos. 1 - 6) ~ (For ltem Nos. 1 - 11)
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, MAXTOUR, HANKOOK H724
Man PC#100A742 1011008
Stock or Import: Stock S
2. P235/75R15
Bid Price Unit 40 $102.62 NO BID
Total $4,104.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CHAMPIRO,
Man PC#100A266
Our PC#GT2257015-1
Stock or Import: Stock
3. P235/70R17-XL
Bid Price Unit 40 $131.77 $144.60
Total $5,270.80 $5,784.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, SAVERO HTZ, HANKOOK R403
Man PC#100A1442 1003240
Our PC#GT23575R15HY2
Stock S

Stock or Import:
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4, P225/60R17, for 2009 Chevrolet Uplander,
for Paratransit Department, Oahu Transit
Services, Inc. (OTS)
Bid Price Unit 70 $107.90 $122.12
Total $7,553.00 $8,548.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear Assurance HANKOOK H724
Fuel Max 1011702
PC#738168571
Stock or Import: Stock S
. TRUCKTIRES
TRUCK TIRES, TUBELESS
5. 8X145,12PR
Bid Price Unit 40 $109.00 NO BID
Total - $4,360.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carlisle, Sport Trail,
PC#5195061
Stock or Import: Stock
6. 7.50X16,10PR
Bid Price Unit 40 No Bid NO BID
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
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7. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 160 $161.76 $122.05 ‘ $195.81
v Total $25,881.60 $19,528.00 $31,329.60
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, Savero HT+, GOODYEAR WRL HT KUMHO KL51
ManPC#100A581 744395900
Our PC#GT24575R16EHY5
Stock or Import: Stock S ST.
8. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G949 RSA, Product code 139082303 or
equivalent. Contractor must stock at least
10 tires for OTS emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract regardless
of whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 60 $246.00 $258.88 NO BID No Bid
Total $14,760.00 $15,532.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G949 RSA GOODYEAR G949
PC#139082303 139082303
Stock or Import: Stock S
9. LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR, black wall on
both sides of tire. '
Bid. Price Unit 160 $121.75 $146.23 $170.89
Total $19,480.00 $23,396.80 $27,342.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear GOODYEAR WRL HT KUMHO KL51
WranglerSRA 744821900
PC#179751217
Stock or Import: Stock S ST.
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10. LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on both
sides of tire), all-position, highway, commercial
light truck, all steel casing, designed for
multiple retreading. Goodyear G947 RSS,
Product code 139081305, Armor Max or
equivalent. Contractor must stock at least
60 tires for OTS emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 630 $239.90 $251.96 NO BID
Total $151,137.00 $158,734.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G947 RSS GOODYEAR G947
PC#139081305 139081305
Stock or Import: Stock S
11. LT235/85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 60 $157.00 $123.26 $183.35
Total . $9,420.00 $7,395.60 $11,001.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, Savero HT+ GOODYEAR WRL HT KUMHO KL51
Man PC#100A584 744725502
Our PC#GT23585R16EAS2
Stock or Import: Stock S ST.
12. 215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G114
or comparable, SBR, Trailer service.
Bid Price Unit 30 $219.66 $235.87 $393.95 $187.00
Total $6,589.80 $7,076.10 $11,818.50 $5,610.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, GT979AD, GOODYEAR G14 CONTINENTAL Double Coin
Man PC#100EV589G 756246567 HTR RT500 16ply
Our PC#21575R175
Stock S ST. Stock

Stock or Import:
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13. 225/70R19.15, 12 PR, SBR
-Bid Price Unit 75 $251.45 $255.45 $223.70 $189.00
Total $18,858.75 $19,158.75 $16,777.50 $14,175.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, GT279, ManPC# GOODYEAR G647 KUMHO RS03 Double Coin
100EV650G 139418053 RT500 12ply
Our PC#CGTTBR2570
Stock or Import: Stock S ST. Stock|
14. 255/70R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159
or comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Bid Price Unit 60 $335.48 $345.51 NO BID $249.00
Total $20,128.80 $20,730.60 $14,940.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, GT279, GOODYEAR G670 Double Coin
ManPC#100EV591G 756780050 " RT500 16ply
Our PC#ES91G
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock
15. 315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile.
Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service (AES) for emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 1,300 $469.00 $518.67 $583.08 $379.00
Total $609,700.00 $674,271.00 $758,004.00 $492,700.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, GT01, GOODYEAR G291 KUMHO 973 Double Coin
ManPC#100EV570G 756256420 RR200L 20ply
Our PC#(GT3158022.5-1
Stock or Import: Stock S IM. Stock
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16. 425/65R22.5, 20 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
(G286 or comparable, on/off highway,
SBR, all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price - Unit 20 $688.00 $684.21 $799.61 $569.00
Total $13,760.00 $13,684.20 $15,992.20 $11,380.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G296 MSA, GOODYEAR G296 KUMHO MAO02 Double Coin
ManPC#756160365 756160365 RLB900+ 20ply
Stock or Import: Stock S ST. Stock
17. 11R22.5-H, 16 PR, Goodyear G395 LHS or
comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Contractor must stock at least 40 tires for
the Division of AES for emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 400 $385.00 $366.46 $450.36 $329.00
Total $154,000.00 $146,584.00 $180,144.00 $131,600.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT, GT879, DUNLOP SP343 KUMHO Double RT606+
ManPC#100EV615G 271132574 973 16ply
Our PCHEG15G
Stock S IM. Stock

Stock or Import:
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lll. LOADER - DOZER, LOADER, PAVER,
TUBELESS, NYLON CORD
18. 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 5 $3,425.00 No Bid NO BID $3,995.00
Total $17,125.00 $19,975.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Firestone, SRG DTLD Yokohama Y545 L-4
L-4, PC#416193BS
Stock or Import: Stock Import
19. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price Unit 5 $400.00 No Bid NOBID| e
Total $2,00000¢{ e
TOTAL BID PRICE (ITEM NOS. 18 + 19): $19,12500 | e




