
CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-DPR-414320
DESCRIPTION: ONE (1) SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE TO DPR
BID OPENING: JUNE 20, 2011

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

$ 30,823.64 $ 30,823.64
City MPG: 14
Cost of Fuel: 2.41$
Total Fuel
Cost: $ 10,328.56

Total
Evaluated Bid : $41,152.20

$ 38,260.29 $ 38,260.29 $ 38,260.29 $ 38,260.29 $ 37,712.60 $ 37,712.60
City MPG: 34 City MPG: N/A City MPG: 34
Cost of Fuel: 2.90$ Cost of Fuel: Cost of Fuel:
Total Fuel
Cost: $ 5,117.66

Total Fuel
Cost:

Total Fuel
Cost:

Total
Evaluated Bid : $43,377.95

Total
Evaluated Bid : N/A

Total
Evaluated
Bid : N/A

$ 38,260.29 $ 38,260.29
City MPG: 34
Cost of Fuel: 2.90$
Total Fuel
Cost: $ 5,117.66

Total
Evaluated Bid : $43,377.95

$ 25,775.90 $ 25,775.90 $ 29,028.75 $ 29,028.75
City MPG: 21 City MPG: N/A

Cost of Fuel: 2.90$ Cost of Fuel:
Total Fuel
Cost: $ 8,285.71

Total Fuel
Cost:

Total
Evaluated
Bid : $ 34,061.610

Total
Evaluated Bid : N/A

*Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.

All bids are subject to evaluation.

NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 6
EPA Non-Top Performers

for Fuel Economy

2011 Jeep Patriot

NO BID

2012 Ford Escape FWD XLS

Alternate 5
EPA Top Performers for

Fuel Economy
NO BID

NO BID

2012 Ford Escape Hybrid

NO BID

2012 Ford Escape Hybrid

2012 Ford Escape Hybrid

NO BID

2012 Ford Escape Hybrid

Alternate 3
Other Alternative Fuel

Vehicles

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles

NO BID

2012 Ford Escape

NO BID

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge

Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell

Vehicles
NO BID

Bid Item

ITEM 1: One (1) Pick-up
Truck with 4WD and 4-

Door Crew Cab

Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In Hybrid

Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford Interpacific Motors Inc. dba

NO BID NO BID NO BID


