CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-381615
DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES
BID OPENING: MAY 5, 2011

Cummins West, Inc.

Cutter CJD, Inc.

Interpacific Motors Inc.

Servco Pacific Inc.

Bid Item dba International Trucks of Hawaii 2o iz gf;z?lgirt;eep DEeE CILLED PRI, e dba Orchid isle Auto Center dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 1: One (1) Pick-up
Truck with 4WD and 4-Door
Crew Cab
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In Hybrid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2012 Chevrolet Silverado Crew
2011 Dodge Dakota 2011 Ford F150 4X4 CREW Cab CK10543
$ 26,72459 | $ 26,724.59 | $ 34,032.08 | $ 34,032.08 $ 3454769 ($ 34,547.69
Alternate 3 City MPG: 14|City MPG: 12 City MPG: N/A
Other Alternative Euel Vehicles NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 NO BID Cost of Fuel: N/A
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 10,328.57 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 12,050.00 Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 37,053.161(Bid: $ 46,082.080 Bid : N/A
2012 Chevrolet Silverado Crew
Cab CK10543
$ 4221209 |$ 42,212.09
Alternate 4 City MPG: N/A
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Cost of Fuel: N/A
Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated
Bid : N/A




2012 Chevrolet Silverado Crew
Cab CK10543

$ 4921209 | $ 49,212.09
Alternate 5 City MPG: N/A
EPA Top Performers for Fuel NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Cost of Fuel: N/A
Economy
Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated
Bid : N/A

2012 Chevrolet Colorado CT15643
$ 32,465.02 (% 32,465.02

Alternate 6

City MPG: N/A
EPA Non-Top Performers for NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Cost of Fuel. N/A
Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated
Bid : N/A
. Cutter CJD, Inc. . -
. Cummins West, Inc. ' Interpacific Motors Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.
Bid Item dba International Trucks of Hawaii Hlef s gZzTIC(e:irt;eep D CLiEr [Fere), e dba Orchid isle Auto Center dba Servco Auto Leeward
EuECU G 2 IR 2011 Ford F450 CrewCab 2012 Ford F450 (W4G)
Crewcab
ITEM 2: Three (3) 15,000 Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
LB. GVWR 4-Door Crew
. . NO BID NO BID
Cab and Chassis, Service o o

Body and Canopy

$ 12473712 | $ 374,211.36 $ 70,791.39 | $ 212,374.17($ 74,504.41|$ 223,513.23




Cummins West, Inc.

Cutter CJD, Inc.

Interpacific Motors Inc.

Servco Pacific Inc.

Bid Item dba International Trucks of Hawaii 2loa ity gt(;glslgirt;eep DEEEE CIED [FEI, e dba Orchid isle Auto Center dba Servco Auto Leeward
'”temat'oga' ax2 bT s 2011 Ford F450 CrewCab 2012 Ford F450 (W4G)
ITEM 3: Four (4) 15,000 LB. rewea

GVWR 4-Door Crew Cab Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

and Chassis with 4WD, NO BID NO BID

DRW, Material Rack and

Service Body
$ 12921461 | $ 516,858.44 $ 70,896.93 | $ 283,587.72|$ 72,643.93| % 290,575.72




