ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

RFB-HPD-381216
OPENED: February 16, 2011
RQM-HPD-1100065
;::ﬁzr:‘li?ig: ?: tf\:“;—/{irgo(lﬁlu ALS Technologies, Ruag Ammotec Security Equipment
Police Department, City and Inc. USA, Inc. Corp.
County of Honolulu, Hawaii
. 12 GA 00 Buck Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds 50,000 : $0.39
Total NO BID NO BID $19,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Federal Cartridge no. LE127 00
. .223 Caliber (5.56 MM) Ammunition
- Bid Price  Rounds 500,000 $0.48
Total NO BID NO BID $240,000.00
Brand Name and Number: Federal Cartridge no. T223A
. 9mm Luger (parabellum) Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds 600,000 0.176 $0.167
Total NO BID 105,600.00 $100,200.00
Brand Name and Number: RWS 9mm 10010 Federal Cartridge no. AE9AP
. 12 GA Rifle Slug Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds 50,000 $0.429
Total NO BID NO BID $21,450.00
Brand Name and Number: Federal Cartridge no.LE127 RS
. 12 GA Target Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds 5,000 $0.399
Total NO BID NO BID $1,995.00
Brand Name and Number: Federal Cartridge no. T115.9



10.

11.

Furnishing and delivery of
Ammunition to the Honolulu
Police Department, City and
County of Honolulu, Hawaii

- Bean-Bag Cartridge

Bid Price  Rounds 50,000
Total

Brand Name and Number:

.308 Caliber Match Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds

. Total

Brand Name and Number:

5,000

9mm Luger (Parabellum) Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds
Total
Brand Name and Number:

300,000

. 40 Caliber S&W Ammunition

Rounds 100,000
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Bid Price

40 Caliber S&W Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds
Total
Brand Name and Number:

100,000

.38 Special Caliber Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds

"~ Total
Brand Name and Number:

10,000

ALS Technologies,
Inc.

$3.50

$175,000.00

ALS Technologies, Inc.
ALS1212T

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Ruag Ammotec
USA, Inc.

NO BID

1.55

7,750.00

Swiss-P 2003.9074

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Security Equipment
Corp.
$3.20
4 $160,000.00
Combined Tactical Systems
Model 2581
$0.83
$4,150.00

Federal Cartridge no. GM308M500

$0.316 -
$94,800.00
CCl/Speer No. 53618

$0.356
$35,600.00
CCl/Speer No. 53970

$0.224
$22,400.00
CCl/Speer No. 53955

$0.22
$2,200.00
Federal Cartridge no. AE38B



12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

Furnishing and delivery of
Ammunition to the Honolulu
Police Department, City and
County of Honolulu, Hawaii

NON-TOXIC AMMUNITION
12 GA 00 Frangible Non-Toxic Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds 90,000
Total
Brand Name and Number:

12 GA Rifle Slug Non-Toxic Frangible Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds 90,000
Total
Brand Name and Number:

.308 Caliber Non-Toxic Frangible Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds 10,000
Total
Brand Name and Number:

9mm Luger Non-Toxic Frangible Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds 300,000
Total
Brand Name and Number:

40 Caliber S&W Non-Toxic Frangible Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds 50,000
Total
Brand Name and Number:

.38 Special Caliber Non-Toxic Frangible Ammunition
Bid Price Rounds 20,000
” Total
Brand Name and Number:

.223 Caliber (5.56 MM) Non-Toxic Frangible Ammunition
Bid Price  Rounds 100,000
: Total
Brand Name and Number:

ALS Technologies,

Inc.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Ruag Ammotec

USA, Inc.

0.73
65,700.00
RWS CM00

0.80
72,000.00
RWS CMSlug

0.90
9,000.00
RWS CM308

0.31

193,000.00

RWS CM9

0.33
16,500.00
RWS CM40

0.352
7,040.00
RWS CM38

0.50
50,000.00
RWS CM223

Security Equipment
Corp.

$1.00
$90,000.00

Precision Ammunition CM00

$1.089
$98,010.00

Precision Ammunition CMSlug

$1.09
$10,900.00
Interational Cartridge #308-125

$0.342
$102,600.00
CCl/Speer No. 53365

$0.382
$19,100.00
CCl/Speer No. 53375 .38 spl, 100 gr-

$0.65
$13,000.00
International Cartridge #030-100

$0.70
$70,000.00
Federal Cartridge no. BC223NT5



