PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-375002
OPENED: FEBRUARY 4, 2011

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM
NO.
1.

For the furnishing and delivery of TRAFFIC
SIGNAL EQUIPMENT for the twelve-month
beginning March 1, 2011 and ending
February 29, 2012 to the Department of
Transportation Services, City and County
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

MODEL 332A CONTROLLER CABINET
Bid Price Unit 3 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

CCTV TRAFFIC CAMERA ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 20 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING ELBOW
Bid Price Unit 100 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING SHURLOCK

TEE

Bid Price Unit
Total

100 Each

Brand and No.:

SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING REAMED

TEE

Bid Price Unit
Total

100 Each

Brand and No.:

EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO. PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
NO BID NO BID $15,125.00 $14,820.00
$45,375.00 $44,460.00
MTS 170E+332 Safetran 170/332
NO BID NO BID $5,188.00 NO BID
$103,760.00
Pelco ES31
NO BID $15.50 NO BID $16.55
$1,550.00 $1,655.00
TP# 652-G TSH-0174F
NO BID $21.00 NO BID $24.95
$2,100.00 $2,495.00
TP# 651-G TSH-0205F
NO BID $15.25 NO BID $14.25
$1,525.00 $1,425.00
TP# 2437-G TSH-0202F
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EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO. PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
ITEM
NO.
6. ADA PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON
ASSEMBLY W/HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 300 Each NO BID NO BID $116.70 $112.00
Total $35,010.00 $33,600.00
Brand and No.: DCC Polara BDLM2X
57H+VRS+4EVR120
7. MODEL 400 MODEM BOARD
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID $147.00 $198.00 $195.00
Total $7,350.00 $9,900.00 $9,750.00
Brand and No.: PDC# MDM-97 GDI - 400/1200B PDC Model 400
8. TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE POST-TOP
ADAPTER WITH FOUR SIDE PORTS
Bid Price Unit 75 Each NO BID $76.00 $85.95 $82.00
Total $5,700.00 $6,446.25 $6,150.00
Brand and No.: TPI# POSTI-nnx-Ax Pelco Traffic Parts 4-way
(Powder Coat) SE3176/SE0310 PT
9. STAINLESS STEEL 100A METER
SOCKET WITH BREAKER
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID NO BID $1,472.00 NO BID
Total $36,800.00
Brand and No.: B-Line 214MTBSS
10. 12 INCH RED LED RETROFIT
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $48.00 NO BID $47.25 $49.00
Total $4,800.00 $4,725.00 $4,900.00
Brand and No.: Excellence Opto Inc. Dialight Duralight
TRV-R12SG-D2T 433-1210-003 JXC-300 CAR




PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-375002

Page 3
EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO. PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
ITEM
NO.
11. 12 INCH YELLOW LED RETROFIT
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 10 Each $57.00 NO BID $47.25 $58.00
Total $5,700.00 $472.50 $580.00
Brand and No.: Excellence Opto. Inc. Dialight Duralight
TRV-Y12SG-D1T 433-3230-001 JXC300-CAY
12. 12 INCH GREEN LED RETROFIT
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $58.00 NO BID $68.10 $58.00
Total $5,800.00 $6,810.00 $5,800.00
Brand and No.: Excellence Opto. Inc. Dialight Duralight
TRV-G12SG-D2T 433-2220-001 JXC300-CAG
13. TRAFFIC SIGNAL VISOR
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID NO BID $19.95 $21.25
Total $3,990.00 $4,250.00
Brand and No.: MTS-M19267 MTS MMP1213B
14. 210 CONFLICT MONITOR
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID $343.20 $369.00 $390.00
Total $8,580.00 $9,225.00 $9,750.00
Brand and No.: EDI #210C EO01-210E EDI MODEL 210
15. SINGLEMODE VIDEO RECEIVER AND
DATA TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID $1,194.00 NO BID
Total $4,776.00

Brand and No.:

1FS-VR1930WDM
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EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO. PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
ITEM
NO.
16. SINGLEMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER
AND DATE TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID $1,194.00 NO BID
Total $4,776.00
Brand and No.: 1FS-VT1930WDM
17. ORNAMENTAL CAP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $3.05 $4.65 $4.75
Total $305.00 $465.00 $475.00
Brand and No.: TP #6028-G Pelco #SE0361 Traffic Parts 6028G
18. COUNTDOWN LED PEDESTRIAN
SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 300 Each $148.00 NO BID $177.05 $175.00
Total $44,400.00 $53,115.00 $52,500.00
Brand and No.: Excellence Opto, Inc. Dialight Duralight
TRP-C45D315RC10 4306479001XA JXM-400VIEIL
19. MULTIMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER/
DATA RECEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID $1,027.00 NO BID
Total $4,108.00
Brand and No.: 1FS-VT1920WDM
20. MULTIMODE VIDEO RECEIVER/DATA
TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID $1,027.00 NO BID
Total $4,108.00

Brand and No.:

1FS-VR1920WDM




PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-375002

Page 5
EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO. PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
ITEM
NO.
21. LED VEHICLE TRAFFIC SIGNAL
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID $390.00 $398.00
Total $39,000.00 $39,800.00
Brand and No.: MTS TP30 Series Peek 3-Sec Poly
Housing Dialight LED
Lamps
22. RED LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY
LAMP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $64.27 $50.50 $71.00
Total $6,427.00 $5,050.00 $7,100.00
Brand and No.: Leotek #TO5R-A-6100 Dialight ET PV 18X10 RD
*P463R33-003
23. YELLOW LED PROGRAMMED
VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 10 Each NO BID $64.95 $49.95 $71.00
Total $649.50 $499.50 $710.00
Brand and No.: Leotek #TO5Y-A6100 Dialight ET PV 18X10 YL
*P463Y33-003
24. GREEN LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY
LAMP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $100.60 $65.35 $121.00
Total $10,060.00 $6,535.00 $12,100.00
Brand and No.: Leotek #T05G-CAO1 Dialight ET PV30X6BG
*P463G33003
25. AUDIO PEDESTRIAN BUTTON
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID NO BID $252.00 NO BID
Total $12,600.00

Brand and No.:

Pelco SE2039
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26. MODEL 242 DC ISOLATOR
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand and No.:
27. MODEL 200 LOAD SWITCH
LAMP
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand and No.:
28. MODEL 170E CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand and No.:

29. PEDESTRIAN TRAFFIC SIGNAL

HOUSING
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand and No.:
30. TRAFFIC SIGNAL BULB
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand and No.:

50 Each

50 Each

20 Each

100 Each

100 Each

EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO. PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES

NO BID $44.45 $38.85 $37.95
$2,222.50 $1,942.50 $1,897.50
PDC #DCI-82 PDC 242 PDC Model 242
NO BID $20.35 $28.10 $27.75
$1,017.50 $1,405.00 $1,387.50
TSC #200LS Caltrans PDC 200 PDC Model 200

1 case (20 pc) min order
NO BID NO BID $1,376.00 $1,325.00
$27,520.00 $26,500.00
MTS - 170E DTS 170E
NO BID $117.96 $102.50 $109.00
$11,796.00 $10,250.00 $10,900.00
CH MTS M64648 Peek 4302, Poly

#SSPED-Pnn-R2n-Q
NO BID NO BID $3.92 $3.85
$392.00 $385.00

Hytron 100A21KTSR3
(min. order - 120 ea or 1
carton)

Hytron 100A21KTSR3
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EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
ITEM
NO.
31. FLASH TRANSFER RELAY
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID $36.25 $35.10 $34.90
Total $3,625.00 $3,510.00 $3,490.00
Brand and No.: Struthers-Dunn MTS-M11556 PDC Model FTR-91
21XBXP-120
32. LOCAL FIRMWARE W/EPROM FOR
170E CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit 5 Each NO BID NO BID $1,160.00 NO BID
Total $5,800.00
Brand and No.: MTS #233/S233RV
33. ASTRO-BRACKET FOR 3-SECTION
STANDARD SIGNAL ON MAST-ARMS
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID $127.55 $130.95 $133.00
Total $3,188.75 $3,273.75 $3,325.00
Brand and No.: TPI Pelco AB-0116-3-29 TP EZBRC 3-SEC
#EZBRC-ITS-346-Bin
-nnP
34. ASTRO-BRACKET FOR 4-SECTION
STANDARD SIGNAL ON MAST-ARMS
Bid Price Unit 5 Each NO BID $133.55 $142.60 $138.00
Total $667.75 $713.00 $690.00
Brand and No.: TPI Pelco AB-0116-4-29 TP EZBRC 4-SEC

#EZBRC-ITS-362-Bin
-nnP
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EXCELLENCE TRAFFIC PHOENIX SHAH
OPTO PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
ITEM
NO.
35. ASTRO-BRACKET FOR 3-SECTION
PROGRAMMED SIGNAL ON MAST-ARMS
Bid Price Unit 10 Each NO BID NO BID $200.50 $185.00
Total $2,005.00 $1,850.00
Brand and No.: Pelco AB-0152-3-29 TP EZBRC PVS
36. TYPE 1 - SIGNAL LOOP CABLE, IMSA 20-1
CERTIFIED, 1000 LINEAR FOOT PER REEL
Bid Price Unit 2 REELS NO BID NO BID $3,958.00 $4,135.00
Total $7,916.00 $8,270.00
Brand and No.: Falcon 98261420-1-0 Digital Cable
IMSA20-1
37. 10 FEET TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE, HOT
DIPPED GALVANIZED, WITH FOUR
1.25 INCH MOUNTING HOLES
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID $449.00 $535.00
Total $44,900.00 $53,500.00
Brand and No.: Ameron Type Valmont Type I-10
1-10-966G
(w/oversized bolt holes)
38. MPEG-2/MPEG-4/H.264 VIDEO/DATA
ENCODER
Bid Price Unit 5 Each NO BID NO BID $1,996.00 NO BID
Total $9,980.00

Brand and No.:

Cortec VCX Series
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OPTO PARTS, INC. PACIFIC, INC. &
INC. ASSOCIATES
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39. MPEG-2/MPEG-4/H.264 VIDEO/DATA
DECODER
Bid Price Unit 2 Each NO BID NO BID $1,996.00 NO BID
Total $3,992.00
Brand and No.: Coretec VCX Series
40. PLUGIN 170 CONTROLLER
ETHERNET CARD
Bid Price Unit 15 Each NO BID NO BID $296.00 NO BID
Total $4,440.00
Brand and No.: MTS - M3332A
41. EXTERNAL FSK TO SERIAL MODEM
Bid Price Unit 3 Each NO BID NO BID $648.00 NO BID
Total $1,944.00
Brand and No.: MTS-M11528
42. MANAGED HARDENED ETHERNET
SWITCH
Bid Price Unit 3 Each NO BID NO BID $2,349.00 NO BID
Total $7,047.00
Brand and No.: Comnet

CNGE3FE7MS2+SFP-7




